BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 13 FIRE PREVENTION AND PROTECTION OF THE
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF LEE'S SUMMIT, MISSOURI BY REPEALING
ARTICLE Ill. FIRE CODE AND ADOPTING A NEW ARTICLE Ill PERTAINING TO THE SAME
SUBJECT MATTER.

WHEREAS, the 2018 Edition of the International Fire Code, as revised has been reviewed
by the Fire Department, the Board of Appeals, Public Safety Advisory Board and the Community
Economic Development Committee; and,

WHEREAS, after much technical study and ample public input, the Fire Department, the
Board of Appeals, Public Safety Advisory Board, and the Community Economic Development
Committee believe it is in the best interests of the City of Lee’s Summit to amend Chapter 13,
Fire Prevention and Protection of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Lee’s Summit, Missouri
by repealing Article Il to remain current with the most recently published International Fire
Code; and,

WHEREAS, based on staff reports and public comment, the City Council desires to protect
the public health, safety, and welfare by amending Chapter 13 - Fire Prevention and Protection
by repealing Article IIl in its entirety, and enacting a new Article Ill pertaining to the same subject
matter.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LEE'S
SUMMIT, MISSQOURI, as follows:

SECTION 1. That Chapter 13 - Fire Prevention and Protection of the Code of Ordinances
of the City of Lee’'s Summit is hereby amended by repealing Article Ill and enacting a new
Article 11l pertaining to the same subject matter, to read as follows:

Sec. 13-41. Title.
This article shall be known as the City's Fire Code, and may be cited as such.
Sec. 13-42. Interpretation of Article.

Should any provision or specification contained in this article conflict with any provision or
specification of the 2018 Edition of the International Fire Code, such provision or
specification shall be considered as supplementary or an amendment to such code(s).

Sec. 13-43. International Fire Code — Adopted

The International Fire Code, 2018 Edition and appendices B and D as amended herein,
and C as published by the International Code Council, is hereby adopted as the fire code of
the City. Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the
Code are hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this article as if fully set out in
this article, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in
section 13-44 of this Code. Three (3) copies of the International Fire Code are on file in the
office of the City Clerk.

Page 1



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

Sec. 13-44. Same — Amendments.

The International Fire Code, 2018 Edition, is amended in the following respects:
Administration.

Section 103.1 is amended to read as follows:

103.1 General. The Division of Fire Prevention is established within the jurisdiction under
the direction of the fire code official (fire chief). The function of the division shall be the
implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code. All sworn
members of the department shall assist the Fire Chief (fire code official) with the
implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

Section 103.2 is amended to read as follows:

103.2 Appointment. The fire chief shall be the fire code official and shall not be removed
from office except for cause and after full opportunity to be heard on specific and relevant
charges by and before the appointing authority.

Section 103.3 is amended to read as follows:

103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with
the concurrence of the appointing authority, the fire code official shall have the authority to
appoint a deputy fire code official, other related technical officers, inspectors and other
employees. The deputy code official shall also be known as the Assistant Chief of Fire
Prevention.

Section 105.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

105.4.1 Submittals. Construction documents shall be submitted in one or more sets and in
such form and detail as required by the fire code official. The construction documents shall
be prepared and sealed by a registered design professional where required by the fire code
official.

Section 105.6 is amended to read as follows:

105.6 Required operational permits. The code official is authorized to issue operational
permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.47 as amended.

The following permits have been deleted:

105.6.1 Aerosol products.

105.6.2 Amusement buildings.

105.6.3 Aviation facilities.

105.6.4 Carnivals and fairs.

105.6.5 Cellulose nitrate film.

105.6.6 Combustible dust-producing operations.

Page 2



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

108.6.7

105.6.8

105.6.9

105.6.10
105.6.11
105.6.12
105.6.13
105.6.15
105.6.16
105.6.17
105.6.18
105.6.19
105.6.22
105.6.23
105.6.24
105.6.25
105.6.26
105.6.27
105.6.28
105.6.29
105.6.31
105.6.33
105.6.35
105.6.36
105.8.37
105.6.39
105.6.41
105.6.42
105.6.43
105.6.44
105.6.45
105.6.46
105.6.34
105.6.47
105.6.48
105.6.49
105.6.50

*Deletion of the permit requirement does not negate the operational requirements of the

code.

Combustible fibers.

Compressed gases.

Covered mall buildings.

Cryogenic fluids.

Cutting and welding.

Dry cleaning plants.

Exhibits and trade shows.

Fire hydrants

Flammable and combustible liquids.

Floor finishing.

Fruit and crop ripening.

Fumigation and thermal insecticidal fogging.
High-piled storage.

Hot work operations.

Industrial ovens.

Lumber yards and woodworking plants.
Liquid or gas-fueled vehicles or equipment in assembly buildings.
LP-gas.

Magnesium.

Miscellaneous combustible storage.
Motor fuel-dispensing facilities

Open flames and torches

Organic coatings.

Outdoor assembly event.

Places of assembly.

Private fire hydrants.

Pyroxylin plastics.

Refrigeration equipment.

Repair garages and service stations.
Rooftop heliports.

Spraying or dipping.

Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts.
Open flames and candles.

Temporary membrane structures, tents and canopies
Tire rebuilding plants

Waste Handling

Wood products

The following operational permits are required as amended:

105.6.14 Explosives. An operational permit is required for the manufacture, storage,
handling, sale or use of any quantity of explosive, explosive material, fireworks, or
pyrotechnic special effects within the scope of Chapter 56. See amended Section 56010f

the 2018 International Fire Code.

Page 3



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

An operational permit for blasting operations shall be obtained from the City of Lee’s
Summit Public Works Inspections Division to meet the permit requirements of Chapter 56,
EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS. The Public Works Inspections Division shall be the
overseeing agency of blasting operations in accordance with the applicable provisions of
Chapter 56 and other referenced documents. The Public Works Inspections Division shall
notify the fire code official of any issued permits, violations, suspensions or revocations.
The Public Works Division shall be the repository of records related to blasting. The fire
code official retains the right to enforce the provisions of this code delegated to the Public
Works Inspection Division.

105.6.20 Hazardous materials. A Hazardous materials permit is required for the using,
dispensing, transporting, handling, and/or storing of extremely hazardous substances.
“Extremely Hazardous Substances (EHS) Facilities” are defined as facilities subject to the
provisions of Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act of 1986 (SARA TITLE IlI),
Section 302, for storing, dispensing, using, or handling of listed chemicals in excess of their
threshold planning quantities (TPQ). See amended Section 5001.4 of the 2018 International
Fire Code.

Section 105.6.21 is amended to read as follows:

105.6.21 HPM facilities. An operational permit is required to store, handle or use
hazardous production materials. See amended Section 5001.4 of the 2018 International
Fire Code.

Section 105.6.32 is amended to read as follows:

105.6.32 Open burning. An operational permit is required for the kindling or maintaining of
an open fire or a fire on any public street, alley, road, or other public or private ground.
Instructions and stipulations of the permit shall be adhered to. A permit is required for a
recreational fire.

Section 105.7 is amended to read as follows:

Section 105.7 Required Construction Permits- The fire code official is authorized to issue a
permit in conjunction with Codes Administration or a Released for Construction letter for
work as set for in Sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.25.

Section109.1 is amended to read as follows:

109.1 Board of Appeals established. All decisions, orders, and/or determinations made by
the fire chief relative to the interpretation of this code shall be governed by a board of
appeals, as set forth in the Building Code of the City of Lee's Summit , as codified in
Chapter 7, Article 1 of the City of Lee’s Summit Code of Ordinances.

Section109.2 Limitations on Authority is deleted.

Section109.3 Qualifications is deleted:

Page 4



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

Section 110.4 is amended to read as follows:

110.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or shall fail to comply with any of the
requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or
certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of an ordinance violation,
punishable under Section 1-13.A of the Lee’s Summit Code of Ordinances. Each day that a
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

General Precautions Against Fire.
Section 307.1.2 is added as follows:

307.1.2 Nature of material being burned. The burning of heavy smoke producing materials
is prohibited. No processed construction wood products shall be burned.

Section 307.2 is amended to read as follows:

307.2 Permit required. A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance
with Section 105.6 prior to kindling a fire for recognized silvicultural or range management
practices with a prescribed burn plan approved by the fire code official, or a fire for the
purpose of brush removal from commercial excavation sites: agricultural zoned locations, or
recreational fires. Application for such approval shall only be presented by and permits
issued to the owner of the land upon which the fire is to be kindled, unless written
permission is given to the applicant by the property owner conduct such operations, or the
applicant is working as an agent for the land owner.

Section 307.4.1 Bonfires, is deleted.

Open Flames

Section 307.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

307.4.2 Recreational fires. Recreational fires shall not be conducted within 25 feet (7620
mm) of a structure or combustible material. Conditions which could cause a fire to spread
within 25 feet (7620 mm) of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition. Recreational
fires shall not exceed a pile size of 3 feet in diameter and 2 feet in height.

Section 307.1.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

307.4.3 Portable outdoor fireplaces. Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be used in
accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and shall not be operated within 15 feet

(3048 mm) of a structure or combustible material.

Section 308.1.4 is amended to read as follows:

Page 5



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

308.1.4 Charcoal burners and other open-flame cooking devices shall not be operated or
located on combustible balconies or within 10 feet of combustible structure.
Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings.
2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler
system.
3. LP-gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not greater
than 21/2 pounds [nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity].

Emergency Planning and Preparedness
Section 401.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

401.3.1 Fire Events. In the event an unwanted fire, unauthorized release of hazardous
material, or situation immediately dangerous to the health and safety of building occupants
or public, the owner or occupant shall immediately report such condition to the fire
department. Building employees and tenants shall implement the appropriate emergency
plans and procedures.

Section 403.12 is amended to read as follows:

403.12 Special requirements for public safety shall be in accordance with Sections
403.12.1 through 403.12.3.3. The fire code official may, based on the nature of an event,
require the event to use fire department personnel for fire watch and crowd managers.

Fire Service Features.
Section 503.3 is amended to read as follows:

503.3 Marking. Where required by the fire code official, approved signs or other approved
notices or markings that include the words NO PARKING—FIRE LANE shall be provided
for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads or prohibit the obstruction thereof.
The means by which fire lanes are designated shall be maintained in a clean and legible
condition at all times and be replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate
visibility.

Fire lanes may be marked in one or a combination of methods as approved by the fire
code official. Curbs. All curbs and curb ends shall be painted red with four inch (4") white
lettering stating "FIRE LANE—NO PARKING". Wording may not be spaced more than
fifteen feet (15') apart. Where no curb exists or a rolled curb is installed, a 6-inch (6") wide
painted red stripe applied to the concrete or asphalt with four inch (4") white lettering stating
"FIRE LANE—NO PARKING. "Signs. In areas where fire lanes are required, but no
continuous curb is available, one of the following methods shall be used to indicate the fire
lane. Option 1 : A sign twelve inches (12") wide and eighteen inches (18") in height shall be
mounted on a metal post set in concrete a minimum of depth of eighteen inches (18") set
back one foot (1') in from the edge of the roadway with the bottom of the sign being seven
feet (7') from finished grade. Signs shall face oncoming traffic. Spacing of signs shall not

Page 6



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

exceed fifty feet (50') between signs. Signs shall be reflective material with a white color
background with symbols, letters and border in red color. "FIRE LANE—NO PARKING".
Option 2: A sign twelve inches (12") wide and eighteen inches (18") in height shall be
mounted on the side of a structure or other permanent fixture approved by the Fire Code
Official. The bottom of the sign being seven feet (7') from finished grade. Spacing of signs
shall not exceed fifty feet (50') between signs. Signs shall be reflective material with a white
color background with symbols, letters and border in red color. "FIRE LANE—NO
PARKING".

Section 505.1 is amended to read as follows:

505.1 Address identification. New and existing buildings shall have approved address
numbers, building numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is
plainly legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall
contrast with their background. Where required by the fire code official, address numbers
shall be provided in additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response.
Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall be a
minimum of 4 inches (101.6 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm).
Where access is by means of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from the
public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure.
Address numbers shall be maintained. In multi-tenant commercial buildings where tenants
have multiple entrances located on different sides of the building, each door shall be
addressed

Section 507.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or
moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 300 feet from a hydrant on a fire apparatus
access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where required by the fire code
official.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600

feet (183 m).

Section 507.5.2.1 of is added to read as follows:
Section 507.5.2.1 Hydrants —Color. All public fire hydrants shall be painted optic yellow. All
private fire hydrants shall be painted optic yellow with a silver bonnet. Private fire hydrants
(yard hydrants) that are tied to the buildings fire suppression system shall be painted red.
Non-potable fire hydrants shall be optic yellow with a purple bonnet.

FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS

Section 901.5 is amended to read as follows:

Page 7



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

901.5 Installation, acceptance, testing. Fire detection and alarm systems, fire-extinguishing
systems, fire hydrant systems, fire standpipe systems, fire pump systems, private fire
service main and all other fire protection systems and appurtenances thereto shall be
subject to acceptance tests as contained in the installation standards and as approved by
the fire code official. The fire code official shall be notified 48 hours before any required
acceptance testing.

Section 903.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.3. Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
occupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 12,000 square feet (1115 m2) in
area.

2. Throughout every portion of educational buildings below the level of exit discharge.

3. Where a Group E fire area is located more than two stories above grade.

4. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit door at
ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any area below the lowest
level of exit discharge serving that area.

Section 903.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:
1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m2).

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than two stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2).

4. A Group F-1 occupancy used for the manufacture of upholstered furniture or mattresses
exceeds 2,500 square feet (232 m2).

Section 903.2.7 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m2).

2. A Group M fire area is located more than two stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2).

4. A Group M occupancy used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or
mattresses exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2).

Section 903.2.9 is amended to read as follows:

Page 8



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings
containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m2).

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than two stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2).

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial trucks or buses where the fire
area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2).

5. A Group S-1 occupancy used for the storage of upholstered furniture or mattresses
exceeds 2,500 square feet (232 m2).

Section 903.2.9.1 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings used as repair garages in accordance with Section 406.8 of the International
Building Code, as shown:

1. Buildings having two or more stories above grade plane, including basements, with a fire
area containing a repair garage exceeding 5,000 square feet.

2. Buildings no more than one story above grade plane, with a fire area containing a repair
garage exceeding 5,000 (464 m2)square feet.

3. Buildings with repair garages servicing vehicles parked in basements.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the repair of commercial trucks or buses where the fire
area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2).

Section 903.2.11.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.11.3 Buildings more than two stories in height. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
installed throughout buildings greater than two stories in height.

Exceptions:

1. Airport control towers.

2. Occupancies in Group F-2

Section 903.3.7 is amended to read as follows:

903.3.7 Fire department connections. The location of fire department connections shall be
approved by the fire code official. Connections shall be a 4 inch Storz type fitting and
located within 100 feet of a fire hydrant, or as approved by the code official.

Section 903.4 is amended to read as follows:

903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. All valves controlling the water supply for
automatic sprinkler systems, pumps, tanks, water levels and temperatures, critical air
pressures and water-flow switches on all sprinkler systems shall be electrically supervised
by a listed fire alarm control unit.

Exceptions:

1. Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one- and two-family dwellings.

2. Limited area systems serving fewer than 20 sprinklers.

Page 9



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

3. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13R where a
common supply main is used to supply both domestic water and the automatic
sprinkler system, and a separate shutoff valve for the automatic sprinkler system
is not provided.

4. Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or locked in the open position.

5. Control valves to commercial kitchen hoods, paint spray booths or dip tanks that
are sealed or locked in the open position.

6. Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire pump engines that are sealed or locked in
the open position.

7. Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, pre-action and deluge sprinkler systems
that are sealed or locked in the open position.

8. Backflow device valves located in underground vaults that are sealed and locked in
the open position.

Section 903.4.2. is amended to read as follows:

903.4.2 Alarms. One all-weather horn/strobe shall be connected to every automatic
sprinkler system on the exterior of the building above the FD connection or in an approved
location. Such sprinkler water-flow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow
equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system.
Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automnatic sprinkler system shall
actuate the building fire alarm system. Interior alarm notification appliances shall be
installed as required by Section 903.4.2.1.

Section 903.4.2.1 is added and shall read as follows:

903.4.2.1 Notification devices. Where an automatic fire sprinkler system is installed in a
building, audible and visible notification appliances shall be installed throughout the building
as follows:

1 Audible notification appliances shall be installed so as to be audible at 15 dBa above
sound pressure level throughout the building.

2 Visible notification appliances shall be installed in all public and common use areas,
restrooms and corridors in accordance with the spacing requirements of NFPA 72.

3 Visible notification devices can be eliminated in normally unoccupied portions of
buildings where permitted by the fire code official.

Exception: The requirements of this section do not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.
Section 905.1 is amended to read as follows:

905.1 General. Standpipe systems shall be provided in new buildings and structures in
accordance with this section and as required by the fire code official. Fire hose threads
used in connection with standpipe systems shall be approved and shall be compatible with
fire department hose threads. The location of fire department hose connections shall be
approved. In buildings used for high-piled combustible storage, fire protection shall be in
accordance with Chapter 32.

Page 10



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

Section 905.3 is amended to read as follows:

905.3 Required installations. Standpipe systems shall be installed where required by Sections
905.3.1 through 905.3.8.Standpipe systems are allowed to be combined with automatic sprinkler
systems.

Exception: Standpipe systems are not required in Group R-3 occupancies and Group R-2
occupancies 3 stories or less were individual units egress directly to the exterior, or
unenclosed stairwells.

Section 905.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

905.3.1 Height. Class Ill standpipe systems shall be installed throughout buildings where any of the
following conditions exist:
1. Three or more stories are above or below grade plane.
2. The floor level of the highest story is located more than two stories above the lowest level of the
fire department vehicle access.
3. The floor level of the lowest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm) below the highest level
of fire department vehicle access.
Exceptions:
1. Class | standpipes are allowed in buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.
2. Class | standpipes are allowed in Group B and E occupancies.
3. Class | manual standpipes are allowed in open parking garages where the highest floor is
located not more than 150 feet (45 720 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle
access.
4. Class | manual dry standpipes are allowed in open parking garages that are subject to
freezing temperatures, provided that the hose connections are located as required for Class |l
standpipes in accordance with Section 905.5.
5. Class | standpipes are allowed in basements equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler
system.
6. Class | standpipes are allowed in buildings where occupant-use hose lines will not be utilized
by trained persconnel or the fire department.
7. In determining the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, it shall not be required to
consider either of the following:
7.1. Recessed loading docks for four vehicles or less.
7.2. Conditions where topography makes access from the fire department vehicle to the
building impractical or impossible.

Section 905.3.4.1 is deleted.

Section 905.3.5 is amended to read as follows:

905.3.5 Underground buildings. Underground buildings shall be equipped throughout with
a Class | automatic wet or manual wet standpipe system. Subterranean spaces developed
by the extraction of subsurface material from underground spaces shall also be regulated

by the City of Lee’s Summit Subterranean Building/Fire Code.

Section 905.5 is deleted. May be used as reference when indicated by other sections of this
. code.

Page 11



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

Section 907.2.7.1 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.7.1 Occupant notification. During times that the building is occupied, the initiation of a signal
from a manual fire alarm box or from a waterflow switch shall not be required to activate the alarm
notification appliances when an alarm signal is activated at a constantly attended location from which
evacuation instructions shall be initiated over an emergency voice/alarm communication system
installed in accordance with Section 907.5.2.2., and when approved by the fire code official.

Section 912.2 is amended to read as follows:

With respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings and landscaping, fire department
connections shall be so located that fire apparatus and hose connected to supply the
system will not obstruct access to the buildings for other fire apparatus. The fire department
connection shall be a 4 inch storz type connection within 100 feet of an approved fire
hydrant or as approved by the fire code official.

Means of Egress.
Section 1010.1.9.4 is amended to read as follows:

[BE] 1010.1.9.4 Locks and latches shall be permitted to prevent operation of doors
whereany of the following exist:

1. Places of detention or restraint.

2. Where egress doors are used in pairs, approved automatic flush bolts shall be permitted
to be used, provided that the door leaf having the automatic flush bolts does not have a
doorknob or surface-mounted hardware.

3. Doors from individual dwelling or sleeping units of Group R occupancies having an
occupant load of 10 or less are permitted to be equipped with a night latch, dead bolt or
security chain, provided such devices are openable from the inside without the use of a key
or tool.

4. Fire doors after the minimum elevated temperature has disabled the unlatching
mechanism in

accordance with listed fire door test procedures.

5. Doors serving roofs not intended to be occupied shall be permitted to be locked,
preventing entry to the building from the roof.

Existing Buildings.

Section 1101.2 is amended to read as follows:

1101.2 Intent. The intent of this chapter is to provide a minimum degree of fire and life
safety to persons occupying existing buildings by providing minimum construction
requirements where such existing buildings do not comply with the minimum requirements
of the International Building Code. Alterations or modifications to the use of an existing

structure that is not a change in use shall meet the minimum requirements of this section as
required by the fire code official and building official.

Hazardous Materials — General Provisions.

Page 12



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

Section 5001.5 is amended to read as follows:

5001.5 Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Sections 105.6 and 105.7.

When required by the fire code official, permittees shall apply for approval to permanently
close a storage, use or handling facility. Such application shall be submitted at least 30
days prior to the termination of the storage, use or handling of hazardous materials. The fire
code official is authorized to require that the application be accompanied by an approved
facility closure plan in accordance with Section 5001.6.3.

Section 5001.5 (a) GENERAL

Hazardous materials permit is required for the using, dispensing, transporting, handling,
and/or storing of extremely hazardous substances. “Extremely Hazardous Substances
(EHS) Facilities” are defined as facilities subject to the provisions of Superfund
Amendments and Reauthorization Act of 1986 (SARA TITLE Ill), Section 302, for storing,
dispensing, using, or handling of listed chemicals in excess of their threshold planning
quantities (TPQ). See amended Section 5001.5 of the 2018 International Fire Code. Any
owner or operator of a facility that uses or dispenses liquefied propane gas for retail or
commercial purposes above is required to obtain a permit per Section 5001.5 (b) The
permit may limit the amount of hazardous materials to be stored or used at the facility and
may require special safety measures and other conditions associated with the use,
manufacture, and storage of such materials.

Section 5001.5 (b) HAZARDOUS MATERIAL PERMIT FOR LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM
GAS (PROPANE)

Any owner or operator of a facility that uses or dispenses liquefied propane gas for retail or
commercial purposes above 40 pounds and below the threshold quantities (TPQ) set forth
in EPCRA, is required to obtain an Hazardous Materials Permit from the fire department .
Permits shall granted or denied administratively by the Chief of the Fire Department.
Appeals from the Chief's decision shall be processed as any other hazardous materials
permit All other requests for permits, those which are not within the Chief's discretion to
administratively grant or appeals from the Chief's decision, shall be considered by the
Public Safety Advisory Board. The board shall make recommendations to the Mayor and
City Council concerning the issuance of the permit and any applicable terms and
conditions.

Section 5001.5 (c) APPLICATION AND ISSUANCE

An owner or operator shall apply for such a permit with the Fire Department. An application
shall be completed and the request for the permit shall then be considered by the Public
Safety Advisory Board of the City. The board shall make recommendations to the Mayor
and City Council concerning the issuance of the permit and any applicable terms and
conditions. The factors that the Public Safety Advisory Board shall utilize in evaluating the
permit request shall include, but are not limited to:

1. The quantities and potential danger of the substances and their location on the site;

Page 13



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

2. Proposed safety and containment measures, including any proposed on-site
monitoring activities and operational and containment technology;

3. The potential numbers of people, structures, and land, which could be at, risk if there
were a major accident;

4. The potential for odors and toxic fumes;

5. The location of the site in relation to identified areas of special environmental concern
such as water course, water wells, underground aquifers, or fish and wildlife habitats;

6. The location of the site in relation to city-designated routes for the transport of
hazardous materials; and/or

7. Any other significant factor relating to public safety, health, and welfare.

The recommendation of the Public Safety Advisory Board shall be forwarded to the
Mayor and City Council for final action. The Mayor and City Council shall utilize the
same evaluation factors for considering the approval of such hazardous materials
permit and any applicable terms and conditions.

Section 5001.5(d) MODIFICATION AND/OR REVOCATION

The Fire Department reserves the right to modify the terms and conditions of the permit if
substantial changes occur in the:

1. surrounding uses;

2. number, amount, and types of hazardous materials subject to EPA reporting
requirements;

3. storage or location of the hazardous materials;

4. any other factor or circumstances that significantly impact the factors used by the Public
Safety Advisory Board and the City Council in evaluating the initial issuance of the
permit.

The Fire Department may revoke a permit if the owner or operator of the facility
fails to use, manufacture, or store hazardous materials in compliance with the
terms and conditions of the permit.

In the event that the Chief of the Fire Department determines after investigation that a
substantial change has occurred warranting a modification of the terms and conditions of
the permit or that the owner/operator is not complying with the terms and conditions of the
permit, the Chief of the Fire Department shall notify the owner/operator of his proposed
action by certified mail, return receipt requested. The notice shall also inform the
owner/operator that if the owner/operator does not agree with or desires to challenge the

Page 14



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

proposed action, the owner/operator must file a written request for review with the Fire
Department within ten days of receipt of the notice. The request for review must include the
reasons why the owner/operator does not agree with the Chief of the Fire Department's
determination.

Upon receipt of the request for review, the Fire Department shall schedule a hearing before
the City Council regarding the proposed modifications or revocation and, by written letter,
notify the owner/operator of the date and time of said hearing. The owner/operator shall be
provided with at least ten (10) days notice of the hearing. The owner/operator shall have an
opportunity to present the basis for challenging the Fire Chief's proposed modification
and/or revocations. The City Council shall utilize the procedures mandated by the Missouri
Administrative Procedure and Review Act, Ch. 536 Mo.R.S. for the conduct of such
hearing. The City Council may affirm, reverse, or modify the Chief of the Fire
Department's proposed action and its decision shall be final.

Section 5001.5 (e)

When required by the fire code official, permittees shall apply for approval to permanently
close a storage, use or handling facility. Such application shall be submitted at least 30
days prior to the termination of the storage, use or handling of hazardous materials. The fire
code official is authorized to require that the application be accompanied by an approved
facility closure plan in accordance with Section 5001.6.3.

Section 5001.5 (f)
Tables regarding the types and quantities of materials for permiiting are adopted as
reference.

Explosives and Fireworks
Section 5601.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

5601.1.3 Fireworks. The possession, manufacture, storage, sale, handling and use of
fireworks are prohibited within the corporate limits of the city, except as follows:

1. Except as authorized below for the storage and handling of certain Division 1.4G
fireworks, the storage and handling of fireworks shall be permitted only in
compliance with Section 5604.

2. The manufacture, assembly and testing of fireworks shall be permitted only in
compliance with Section 5605.

3. The possession and use of Division 1.3G fireworks shall be permitted only in
accordance with Section 5608.

4. The possession, storage, handling and use of certain Division 1.4G fireworks shall
be permitted within the corporate limits of the city, provided such fireworks comply

Page 15



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

with Chapter 320 of the Revised Statutes of Missouri, 11 CSR 40-3.010, CPSC 16
CFR, Parts 1500-1507, DOT 49 CFR, Parts 100-178, and all applicable Ordinances
and Codes of the City of Lee's Summit, Missouri, except that it shall be unlawful for
any person to possess, store, handle, or use, within the corporate limits of the city,
the following Division 1.4G fireworks:

a. Rockets on a stick;

b. Missiles with fins or rudders for the purpose of achieving aerodynamic flight;
and

c. Roman Candles with or without spikes, identified by the word "Candle" on the
label with the following wording on the caution label: "WARNING SHOOTS
FLAMING BALLS" or "WARNING SHOOTS FLAMING BALLS AND
REPORTS", and not including California Candles or llluminating Torch with
the following wording on the caution label: "CAUTION EMITS SHOWERS
OF SPARKS" and

d. Single or multi-shot parachutes, with night effects.

5. The possession or discharge of Division 1.4G fireworks, as authorized by this
Section shall be allowed only by permit. The permit shall contain the name,
address, and location of the intended use and shall be in the form approved by
the Director of Finance. The permit may be obtained at the point of sale within the
city, the city web page, or from the Director of Finance. One such permit shall be
required per household or address at which the discharge will occur.

6. The use of Division 1.4G fireworks within the city limits shall only be permitted on
July 2 and 3 of each year between the hours of 10:00 a.m. and 11:00 p.m., on
July 4 of each year between the hours of 10:00 a.m. and Midnight.

7. It shall be unlawful for any person to throw, use, explode, detonate, aim, point or
shoot fireworks, including pyrotechnic devices, in such a manner that, after it is
ignited, will propel it, or any part thereof, such that it, or any part thereof, lands on
property not owned by the person shooting the fireworks.

8. It shall be unlawful for any person to throw, use, explode, detonate, or shoot
fireworks within any structure.

9. It shall be unlawful for any person to throw, use, explode, detonate, or shoot fireworks
within six hundred feet of any church, hospital, mental health facility, school, or
within one hundred of any location where fireworks are stored, sold, or offered for
sale.

10. No person shall use, explode, detonate, or shoot fireworks within, or throw the

same from, a motorized vehicle including watercraft or any other means of
transportation, except  where a display permit has been issued for a floating

Page 16



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

11

12.

13.

vessel or floating platform, nor shall any person place or throw any ignited
firework into or at a motorized vehicle including watercraft or any other
means of transportation, or at or near any person, group of people, or animal.

No person shall throw, use, explode, detonate, or shoot fireworks within three
hundred feet of any permanent storage of ignitable liquid, gases, gasoline pump,
gasoline filling station, or any nonpermanent structure where fireworks are stored,
sold or offered for sale.

Notwithstanding the provisions of the Lee's Summit City Code to the contrary, the
prohibitions of Chapter 17, Article IX, "Regulations Regarding Control of Noise
and Sound" shall not be applicable to any lawful discharge of Division 1.4G
fireworks authorized by this Section 5601.1.3.

It shall be unlawful for any person under the age of 16 years, unless under the
supervision of a parent or guardian, to possess or discharge Division 1.4G
fireworks within the city limits.

Section 5601.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

5601.2.2 Sale and retail display.

1

General. No person, firm, or corporation shall construct a retail display for, sell, or
offer for sale, explosives, explosive materials, or fireworks within the corporate city
limits, except as allowed for permitted blasting operations and commercial fireworks
displays, and except that the retail display and sale of certain Division 1.4G
fireworks shall be permitted within the corporate city limits by nonprofit, religious or
community service organizations for the period beginning 6:00 a.m. on June 23 and
extending through midnight on July 4 of each year. Notwithstanding the foregoing, it
shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation, including nonprofit, religious or
community service organizations, to construct a retail display for, sell, or offer for
sale, within the corporate city limits, the following Division 1.4G fireworks:

A.

B.

Rockets on a stick;

Missiles with fins or rudders for the purpose of achieving aerodynamic flight; and
Roman Candles with or without spikes, identified by the word "Candle" on the
label with the following wording on the caution label: "WARNING SHOOTS
FLAMING BALLS" or "WARNING SHOOTS FLAMING BALLS AND REPORTS",
and not including California Candles or llluminating Torch with the following
wording on the caution label: "CAUTION EMITS SHOWERS OF SPARKS".
Single or multi-shot parachutes, with night effects.

All nonprofit, religious or community service organizations selling Division 1.4G

Page 17



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

fireworks as authorized herein shall comply with Chapter 320 of the Revised
Statutes of Missouri, 11 CSR 40-3.010, CPSC 16 CFR, Parts 1500-1507, DOT
49 CFR, Parts 100-178, and all applicable Ordinances and Codes of the City of
Lee's Summit, Missouri.

2. Retail Sales License Required. No person shall construct a retail display for, sell, or
offer for sale at retail, Division 1.4G fireworks as authorized by Subsection 1 of this
Section 5601.2.2 without a license issued pursuant to this Subsection 2. It shall be
unlawful for any person to sell fireworks from a car or truck or in any other manner
except from a structure or stand licensed to sell fireworks pursuant to this Section.

A. Application period, limitation on number of licenses and locations. The Director
of Planning and Development or his or her designee will accept license
applications between 8:00 a.m. on April 15t and 5:00 p.m. on April 3” of each
year. In the event that April 1, 2 or 3 for any given year falls on a Saturday,
Sunday or legal holiday, the period for accepting license applications shall be
proportionally extended so that a total of 3 business days shall be available for
the submission of applications. No application will be accepted without a
completed application in the form provided by the Director of Planning and
Development, proof of state permit, proof of insurance, security plan, security
deposit, and all necessary supporting documents. No more than twenty licenses
shall be issued for the retail sale of fireworks in the City in any year. Only one
application may be filed on behalf of an entity for a particular location, and any
additional applications filed on behalf of the same entity for a particular location
will not be considered. Once an application is filed, the information contained
therein may not be revised or altered; provided, however, that the identity of an
entity and the proposed location may be changed by written request received by
the Director of Planning and Development within forty-eight (48) hours of the
filing of the application. Only one license can be issued for an application and
only one license will be issued for each particular location. Each year nineteen
(19) licenses shall be reserved for nonprofit, religious or community service
organizations located and operating in either the City of Lee's Summit or the
Lee’s Summit R-7 School District (“Local Organizations”) and one (1) licenses
shall be reserved for a national nonprofit-organization which has an office
located inside the City of Lee's Summit (e.g. the Red Cross) ("Outside
Organization”). In the event that an application is not filed on behalf of an
Outside Organization the remaining licenses may be granted to a Local
Organization. In the event that nineteen (19) applications are not filed on behalf
of Local Organizations the remaining licenses may be granted to Outside
Organization. Applications to be considered for the 20 licenses shall be selected
by lottery in the following manner. First, each applicant shall draw a number at
random at the time of filing the application. The Director of Planning and
Development, or his or her designee, shall record the number drawn with the
applicant’s application. The names of the applicants shall be listed in numerical,
sequential order of the numbers so drawn, together with the designation of
whether the applicant is a Local Organization or Outside Organization. The first
19 Local Organizations listed and the first Outside Organization listed shall be

Page 18



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

considered for the twenty available licenses. In the event that the number of
Local Organizations and Outside Organizations applying do not meet the
amount of licenses reserved for the respective class, the remaining licenses
may be awarded to qualified applicants of the other class. The license fee must
be paid prior to the erection of any tent or other such structure that will serve as
the point of sale. All applicants who obtain a license under this section will also
be required to obtain a Special Events Permit from the Department of Planning
and Development and pay the Special Events Permit Fee. The Special Events
Permit Fee must be paid within forty-eight (48) hours of notification of selection
for issuance of a license or the application will be deemed denied and the next
applicable application shall be considered in numerical, sequential order as
determined by the lottery.

B. Proof of State Permit. No application will be accepted without proof of a valid
permit issued by the Missouri Department of Public Safety for the retail sale of
consumer fireworks.

C. Proof of Insurance. No application will be accepted without proof of general
liability insurance in the amount of no less than $1,000,000.00 per occurrence
and a $2,000,000.00 aggregate limit, and covering liabilities arising from the
retail sale of fireworks during the term of the coverage shall be submitted with
every application. The amount of the insurance shall not be subject tc reduction
of the aggregate limit as a result of occurrences at locations not operated by the
seasonal retailer.

D. Setup and Removal of Stands - Bond or Security Required. No temporarily
licensed stands, nor any signs approved as part of the Special Event Permit
process, may be setup before June 23rd of the licensed year. All licensees must
display at the stand location a 32 square foot banner which recites the identity of
the licensee. This banner must be attached between two poles securely placed
in the ground. All licensees must also display near the cash register (or other
place of checkout) a sign of at least 12" by 12" which recites the identity of the
licensee. As a condition of approval of the license application, all licensees must
immediately remove any sign after being informed by City staff that the sign
violates the licensee's approved sign plan. It shall be the duty of the licensee to
completely remove all temporary licensed stands and signs, and to clear the site
where such stand and signs were erected of all debris and trash on or before
July 7th of the same year. All applicants for a license shall furnish a cash
deposit, performance bond, letter of credit, or other security approved in content
and form by the city attorney, in the face amount of $1,000.00 to secure
performance of the licensee's obligations under this section. If any persons
licensed under this section shall fail to comply with any provisions of this section,
then the bond or other security furnished with the license application shall be
forfeited to the city.

E. Security Plan. At the time of application, every applicant shall provide a narrative

description of its security plan to secure the premises when not open to the
public, including the evidence of the qualifications of the security guard or

Page 19



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

guards. At a minimum, the security plan shall provide the following:

i. The stand/tent shall be secured and a guard present any time the
business is not open to the public.

ii. The security guard shall be properly and validly licensed pursuant to the
City Code.

Section 5601.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

5601.2.4 Financial responsibility.  Before a permit is issued, as required by Section
5601.2, the applicant shall file with the jurisdiction a corporate surety bond in the principal
sum of $2,000,000 or a public liability insurance policy for the same amount, for the
purpose of the payment of all damages to persons or property which arise from, or are
caused by, the conduct of any act authorized by the permit upon which any judicial
judgment results. The fire code official is authorized to specify a greater or lesser amount
when, in his or her opinion, conditions at the location of use indicate a greater or lesser
amount is required. Government entities shall be exempt from this bond requirement.

5601.2.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

5601.2.4.1 Blasting. The issuing of Blasting Permits and regulation and inspection of
blasting operations, other than the storage and handling of explosives, is administered by
the Public Works Inspection Division and the State of Missouri. Before approval to do
blasting is issued, the applicant for approval shall file a bond or submit a certificate of
insurance in such form, amount, and coverage as determined by the legal department of
the jurisdiction to be adequate in which case to indemnify the jurisdiction against any and all
damages arising from permitted blasting.

Flammable and Combustible Liquids.

Section 5701.4 is amended to read as follows:

5701.4 Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Sections 105.6 and 105.7.
Notification, a site plan, and a list of equipment specifications shall be provided to the fire
department prior to the installation, repair or modification to equipment or facilities where
flammable or combustible liquids are produced, processed, dispensed, stored, handled, or

used in amounts greater than reportable quantity.

Exception:
1. All underground storage of any amount shall require Fire Department review.

Section 5704.2.9 is amended to read as follows:
5704.2.9 Above-ground tanks. Above-ground storage of flammable and combustible

liquids in tanks shall comply with Section 5704.2 and Sections 5704.2.9.1 through
5704.2.9.7.9. Above-ground storage tanks shall not be located in areas zoned residential.

Page 20



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

Exception:

1. Above-ground storage tanks used at construction sites that meet the requirements of
5706.2.

Liquefied Petroleum Gases.

Section 6101.2 is amended to read as follows:

6101.2 Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Sections 105.6 and 105.7. A
permit is required for any facility that uses or dispenses liquefied petroleum gas (propane)
for retail or commercial purposes in accordance with the Hazardous Material Permit
section. Distributors shall not fill or provide an LP-gas container for which a permit is
required unless a permit has been issued for that location by the code official.

Chapter 80. “Referenced Standards - is amended to read as folfows:

Lee’s Summit Subterranean Space Building/Fire Code:_Any Section of this code that
dictates regulations for underground spaces shall cite this amendment to the 2018
International Fire Code

Appendices

The following appendix is not adopted as part of the Code of Ordinances of the City of
Lee’s Summit except as noted; however, the Fire Department shall use it as reference
material:

Appendix A — Board of Appeals

The provisions of Appendices B through D are adopted as part of the Code of Ordinances
of the Lee’s Summit except as amended.

Appendix B-Table B105 is amended as follows:

Table B105.2- Decreases the reduction of fire flow in residential (R3 and R4) sprinklered
buildings from 25% to 50%.

The following appendix is amended as follows:
Appendix D- Fire Apparatus Access Roads
D103.1 is deleted.

D103.4 is amended as follows:

D103.4 Dead-ends. Dead end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet (45 720
mm) shall be provided with width and turnaround provisions in accordance with Table

Page 21



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

D103.4., or as approved by the fire code official.
D104.3 and D106.3 are amended as follows:

D104.3 and D106.3 Remoteness. Where two access roads are required, they shall be
placed a distance apart equal to not less than one half of the length of the maximum overall
diagonal dimension of the property or area to be served, measured in a straight line
between accesses or as approved by the fire code official.

D107.1 is amended to read as follows:

ONE- OR TWO-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENTS

D107.1 One- or two-family dwelling residential developments.

Developments of one- or two-family dwellings where the number of dwelling units exceeds
50 shall be provided with two separate and approved fire apparatus access roads, and shall
meet the requirements of Section D104.3.

Exceptions:
1. Where there are 50 or fewer dwelling units on a single public or private access way and
all

dwelling units are protected by approved residential sprinkler systems, access from two
directions shall not be required.
2. The number of dwelling units on a single fire apparatus access road shall not be
increased
unless fire apparatus access roads will connect with future development, as
determined by the fire code official.

Any section of this code that dictates regulations for underground spaces shall be governed
by Chapter 7, Article 13 of the Lee’'s Summit Code of Ordinances — The Subterranean
Space Building and Fire Code. In case of conflicting provisions in the Subterranean Space
Building and Fire Code and the International Fire Code, the more restrictive provision(s)
shall prevail.

SECTION 2. That it is the intention of the City Council and it is hereby ordained that the
provisions of this ordinance shall become and be made a part of the Code of Ordinances for the
City of Lee’s Summit, Missouri.

SECTION 3. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this
article is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction,
such portion shall be deemed a separate and independent provision and such holding shall not
affect the validity of the remaining portions thereof.

SECTION 4: Penalty Clause. Any person found guilty of violating this ordinance shall be
penalized in accordance with Section 1-13 A. of the Municipal Code of the City of Lee’'s Summit.

SECTION 5. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect on April 1, 2019.

Page 22



BILL NO. 19-09 ORDINANCE NO. 8537

PASSED by the City Council of the City of Lee’s Summit, Missouri, this éﬁé day of

g'ﬁd“ Q_/‘/_;[ , 2019,

i

Mayor WilliasrA. Baird

APPROVED by the Mayor of said city this \ r‘\: day of , )m QJ_\E( 2019,
3 /
A)@«/&,

Mayor William A. Baird

Page 23



U S BUED 50 YN Sa 0; Fussng uane 10] pasnbal ARG ae Sz

NG e Tvior T T
g oy w0k i s pauos Ageany pouing ag
AP S SR QPP U A50W 18 S [PUCRIA Y PSS 5 WGP S|
T TR pamnbay wiiag e Tuwng s aa|
i aueRIDI
sam abury
‘panosddle  nussad aus ansss
lon SIEIS B L S ENOW U0 ISR AJBUIMY UG ang
ansad gy o Bumnss) ) Auap 50 anaadr e pUs GG 315 § AI0UIOY
o s secop axg) [HNCW) SA2INDSOY [EINEN JO SN B IMDEIY
ay1 Ag pasodin suonenEa: MoN0; uRLEdaR UL 'WSNIG LING D1 SIEAND 0 |
uenvasas v so; axeudasdde aq o Sk
suonmeaasd sadosd gt amsua o) apew
e Saunaping L
1 505350 a et Ajensn as asay )
oul
UM 51 TSR 34 50 “SUGHE 1a6D 3N 1INPUOT O 13UMO ALIBHOI 13 AT JUFINEE U3 01 UANE S UCIESIALISK LaLiAM SSOIUR PAIPUIN A 0} 3 04 S UMM UGKR PUE| AU} J3 KUMO U B] AN S1iused puE AT wan
S35 UDFEAT IS AL W) [EACLRS SD JO 330AING a4} D] 2 © ID EYID AR a3) a4 AG POADITEE Ue[d LLING HOGUIS0IE © U saxpaesd !  Supun o1 saud 5 501 uoaes w eoyo apo) 0 1eys W a0 v
Fwi po [T g o ainien| eve wwwng $ 3
2001 PAIBAID 8 [ AT © 07 31 A ) paLEd B WO BYou
pinuing og ey P “pawgioId = e 30 Buiiing oy pauing dmag [eaiew jo aimien ]
3050 ARG F PaaE O I ARSI R ] S350 SR 91 oG] UOTFON ¥ T ARR e Sesipi0 0 9ped T SR B YT T UG5S AP ARNUSIUNG USTEIs G TASURWDIO 8 apa) WALnS a1 01 papuary| [ETTTETTE wort WS §37
[ ‘3P0 S1g1 40 SUONMOI JAPUR PaTT ALENIA3 40 1A € §0 0 VIO APO3 31| AY) 10 IAIANP J5 SIUSLNIOR UOHNIISUE) panaadde iyl 10 UBHLIO l J1OM B 40 JIEA) 'IDIE IEISU "1I0HD [IEUS DUM I J0AL SIUaM ANbiS oy o AUE i AIEWE) 1 (1 €S 40 3pD3 ) 40 LOISADIG £ IO [P DU S )
o) patagag| SUGIITND)] EROL W 5 aa|
Wag) A0 oY U UoneRn, 7601 s 78|
ameupio) oo ety jo peoy Tar asing 1,00
0 3P NG 5,037 0 A1) 1 10 T IPILY *f 193D W IR S “TRUWNG %321 [ AW ng1 J0 9P FUIBKNG A1 Ul Y10 185 S ‘SEACER O PIEOY ¢ AQ PAULIMATH 9 |IEUS APO3 S |0 UONIIAKLIAIU) U] 01 AATIFIAL S AR} U1 AQ SELI SUOKPUILLIAIAR 10/PUP 'SIAPI0 SUDISIIAR Iy PANSIGESE Seaddy 0 piE0R|  uaudojanag pus i iEdag i #) 10 SN WILND 1931 01 papuawy
g WORIRIET by TRor g £ e
aasas Juauroranag wo wusad Finpeng ¢ st 10
10 uatEhs Burkjpow vaym asurdwe>)|
apo> wiemews oF A e oSje % S4L (PRGNS pasajan v ussd Fuping
anry ApraR TEYL SIS i SUIRISAS UMII0AT 385 J0; Pansy Bumaq Auains|
B BONINIIEY ) POSENIN 10K, 10 LUOIINIISUD] 0} PUESIN, T IR Wi
Janta) Mawa UM v TAWLEdIq ik BL IO SIS UAWH0AAD AT utHas
i Aq pasy sua
mau o Bunswsed pur mesar al J0j SANEKD UANNT DA OF papusny
522501 WANGIS 12501 SUIIRE N U1I0J 3% 50 4A0M 10 Ea310) LOINAIOD 10) paseagay e ans S a1 PaTIOINE S (B0 P03 A Y | SUWIT BN UED pannbay
sud vado; g vadg| ze990n, Hwwns s aa1

G AU U0 211 10 Al KO UE 1o BuRATIUSW 10 Fumpury a1 0] pannbai 5 i

UOIIEa13) 10) PAARBD) SIS Y 3] PAIIYDE 30 IEYS WIS AL 10 SUOEINGNS PUE SUGHIISU PUnD iR aesud 50 Jgnd 10 10 pros Ay

ot jeuos esads uy Humng vadg) AN WA B WOl 5003 FUD e, | 1 sagan|

P % RapUIE 975 (0 5 Fiajpuy 16 B BUEuags ) oy SN SOpITEN 029501 s s aa)
1L yHVS) 9861 10 19 ey pu punysang | auion 4 e pasap o 53R (S . saaurTsqns 16 BUOLS J0fpur BUIIRUTY FUIOSSUEA BUISU3dRIp Fuisn a1 o) pan o a0z pue asn geno: i 443 SpUBY, _ =
Tanpeid anmorday wrosar g 53
xs0ma ) pue sansolden 50 uasad o spuay|
5095 UOHI3 I DIULPIOIIE U U 1 s (s pue sapmod e ) sopayouss Jo sanuRdnI0 uondang vorsmg i o1 P ap d
o3 a20ju 01 3 Ay SUIETa) e APO3 ;| Buniseq o) pa 10331 {0 ASOUISSHa AU 4 1P UCKING SHIOM 3| 9N | SUOIEIAAI O SUDISUALSAS ‘S0 ik panssa Aue (@ eugi0 R0 iy U1 AHISU |[FS UOEIMG SUOIIISU| YIOM AN 3 TUIINI0N FITIIA4AN 130 PUF 95 Jatden3 jo
dde au1 quum aouep urieryg o Asuafe Buiaasiaag i 0 RS UDUIAIG SLONSNICU EXX0M MGG SULSXHOMIHI TNV STAIGOTAN ‘95 13PN 10 510 iibies 1o 3k B4 14anis O UGHSIAIG SUDIISt 4D KA a1 w03 pAueIGo 9 |1t SUONEIG0 TWISeI
) 1550 jeuoRIIGO Uy * 3007 344 [OUODULAIUN TOT 3U1 16 1O UORISE PAEUSWE 235 ‘05 91APLE) 0 SIS U WY S1293a JPEats WULIAI0IA 0 ‘YIOMAN] TPISIIEW NSO IS Ja AU A j0 a5 10 e ‘Bunpa ey aRe0 a1 10y pannba ‘9'500
B - === ETEETT G g S T % a1
A o) Apqueuodsas sassowisna 0 suatiad © o “aE3 S0 HUMLNINDA A1
340 10U S0P SUORP A0 WAk 10} SHWIIG JO UONAAP L JITTS WS
o1 anp waunsedap 2 a1 Aq panss Fusag AUALND |ON SIUIA U TEYS01 6L 9501 “LE D501
BES01 BETEOL EE Y 50U
“TE9S01 6L 9501 829500
BT9'S01 ST EDL VY 50U
9501229501 (29 501
501 ETT SO0 41 50T
950151601619 50T
ZU9'501 TUaS0T 0TS 501
69501 FI 501 'L 9 500
IS0 TIS0T ST 50T
TSOLE9501 T 50T
“T'9'50T 0} Ao WiuaNnbas
Junad ay) Bunapep 4q 5 500
— ——= == = TN AL G TUDIEIEU07 3G 03 pUsLY ~ sanndag E Hms e
Uon AR 10 |4 IUEISISSY 41 S UMOLDY A0 51T [IENS STI0 300 1) Aindan axL - 1 E——
= - T 50 AP W] 0 g Tuanmaday Tl g 5 a0
By 40 001 UL SAULAP PUT IR IWALIND Wi 1UPIEIU0D BT OF PUBLIY
o it 10105 Bur AQ 13905 UD PINaY 3 OF AUUNIIORE [N} ST PUE G513 0] A 21D WL PIRDWI) A4 10U [ITS PP [PINIR API s 9 NI 0N Dits HEL _ _
e = e TustaLedap @, ) AR LB UOUIAS TG T ot W 553
PO S 10 US| aa13 )0 IO ML SHUAD PUR ADNIEIA ALIN oK UDISISUOD 30 0} PuaAkIY
s o e A i uim ) LD 114 LIS ([P WALIRGAN ) 1O TIAGUIALY WIOMS (1Y 21O 3O) Ml AL 5 APEY 51 AR 01 PSS 30 [[EUS FUE SN R D) 4T UOIIANG 31 SIAUA 1A LIRDIR Ha) I UM PIUSIIGEIS S UDOUANRLG 384 JO UOISD PUL -

SPiL o553




e E T e TT o0 T
P50 U1 ORI AU PUP TUTIBAL ] UAAMIAG SAULTIR 1AL MOYJE
@3 AHNGIXDY PUIOS IAEL S0P JETHO AP0T SN BUL TUODAIE? AL Edap Ay
IO 3P0 it} AY) AG PANDITOE S0 40 TURIHAL A € 0193 OOT UG BIHID| PUR HUILI AL ZA0IS LD b 30 iEYS SUORD oo apoy aq weus o 0 UG UL SUOIDAUD 1w AP 3a1| )0 uoNEIO| U a1 U1 10] PIEAUS €301 g SSAIPPY D1 AR LOANE Sl
T e T T T TPt S T T T 06| W ¢ aa |
SUONAPIN 553 HNGIA WAILIEID 31} 10 (3N 1S 43 A SIUIDIS TR PN UL [ 0 4 P IMONANOI] POEISAN ]S WAL Ja(AUCS 3 LI Uy WHRDI] W1 SANIOTS O UPUT 2101 SHRAPIMG | 10j SIUAWIAND3) 10913 1IN IUATSISU) I 01 BPUSLIE U9 SEY UDHIDDS L
- — “afieies ey 15 8019 THE O8] g <3
193] 100 000" WIPaaIED IR meclas ® FUIUGS 12 21| YU B g Burpnun euerd agesd arSqe SM0IS AIOLI IO O Miaey SHUIPING T LI JUALIND 1M WATSISUE) 3G 01 AR 0 SeY SIS S|
oy < “apery Bppngg o 4o 90 uon9g i s s
51 a5 SAUIPING |1F 10GUFACL PIEHAD I 3q IF4S WA EAS 13|YULKS J3PWOINE Uy ‘SaBued Jieday 167 06| .
= TRRANTIO 118 U5 .E...E. e 5 den| weion Toing ¢ a7
7w ££2) 192} a1enbs 005 Z SR SATSANIP 10 MU P st i @
) 100) oumnbs 000G SPaRIN FAR 0 etoasaues o unoum s i peerotse = Apeoh Aourdnoso o mdt
1w DEZZ) 100} Baenbs 000 P2 SPa s
sasma a1 jo auo 15 Bn0I0 ¢ BuiwieIu0D sAuIpING e o o 4 e e A SR mbin  hok
“Sapundny0 KaIe US paNGa Sl ey, o) £TE0s) g % a1
i
{zus pap) 1aa; arenbs pog's spaaa aueus 10 aIndiuing paINEIOYAN 19 P aigusquns jo nunowe s yim pRENassT 51 AEidA Asurdnaa o .uz ™
1780 0EEZ) 199) 1015 000V PoTIP SaUTTTos AUE FUPTOUL ‘.01 I U0 SER 28} A GNOJE 0 EAIE PAUIGUS) a1
oM U v
{7 STIT) 100y arenbs 00’7 T Spaa e waie ang iy dnory 1
spwna o o dnoin PING 1NOWFNGI PIRIAGIT 3 (/P18 WI15AS J3FPUNITS WEWOINE Uy A INGIS {7 £06 = .
SaraEdn3an 18 UD BANGS] 1 Bnoio)| vZioe g £ 501
i savors omi o1 p——
{20 2E2] 1933 a1 0057 SPaAT SASAI 10 @IV, LSO | T4 AN0IOY b, swnowe AE3IBA) ASUEAN3I0 40 3L S
{71 OEZZ) 4ady A1ENDS 00'VT THDIIND ‘SHUIETTRUI AUE BUDRPUS *SI00() IE UD SEAIT aNj T-4 Anos §F j0 eair panqued ay| £
ey apesd MMDGE SHHOLS DML UK DL PAEID] 5 B
7w STTT) 193} asembs DD 21 spanama ease
S351X3 SUOLPUOY TUIMOII0} A O JUO 313YM AWIETNDI0 1-4 oIy ¢ Rruiriuos SBuipyng i 1nouing i papinosd on feys waishs sapyunsds Jewame uy 1§ dnosg =
e Tl Spa 01 3oy oy gy sannbal A Hunisar % 10| g s aan|
n v huw ainjaq 30 05 1310 3pE3 ) TG0 APDY N AR PaRAIGE ¥ pUE SIEPUFS
omeryU o) un paweua e s aouridase oy 1algns o b uenon an) s aun ayeand g s acdpURTs a suaeAs fueipAy a1 ) SALEAS I Murzsar “asueidanan wonw ey )
U0 g 1 80003 WLEIPAY 0} MNIIEA0 TUALIND AUNAP B3 PapPY | oy sueIpAR 15 L05) Buwng s )
Jauung
NG © i mO[[4 NGO 30 LS SIRIPAL 1) S(AUIOGAUON ‘B3 BIURE 30 [0S WSAS UOTAIRAENS 1) SIBING L1 0L P I5e 1) (SIUPIAL AEA] SIURIBA 211) 1A TUUOR J3AITS P U D[4 010 PSR S (/e S IA 11 AU Y MOII3A 110 PaTUIPE 30 JES SIUEIAL 351 G0 Y 00— SaaeA
51 IApING posapunds| Py o s SUISAS JUBIDAK ALY 15205 Hwwng 5 207
© 30; uondaee Ay | AUEING 241 10 YIS AU LD, WEIPAL T 01 AWEISTP J0)
s FRT) 5901 009 38 (s s AN awersIp aus sanuednana fdnoss pure gy o o t| (8 EREEEEE IR L w0 popuat st e 2y
suondos|
1110 2P0 3yt Ag panbas sy pagAoic]
A [y SUrPL pur S urmpAY A Aps-uo BUpEng 10 AR ay3 0 I0HATE Gyl PUNSIE 8101 parsIdde Ue A paInLeau Se PEOs S5ad0e SEleddi ) © U0 URIRAY P WO 133] OOF U 10K S UDNDIES T U1 UM 50 0 RaOW 0 [ 0EINISU0Y 1038 8 AU SIPING J0 AW} AL J0 UDILIOH ¥ A Ay pannka aaym o
| pEa e = iapuodta) A Riaa Ty AR BRG] P ARy Ts0s| g a1
S— 0 A B W Sa9ES JUEUDL 10 ONEIIIUAP K S5 IPP 3] PApY
145 100D WIEa “JUIDIING BY: 10 5P JUIAHHA UD PAIEID| sthpung | ' 5 LIAGLING SSAIPAY GININIS U AjIJUSE O PISN 3 U VRS D UHS K10 40 20 TUSWNLOW ‘Al 31GAE 3L ...o:ua;.;ss,_..:s:;_s a1 pur pros|
1AL © 0 SUPAS AQ HTSOTIE AR UL £ 2 T) U 50 O MDA SGHIS NN ® an YER (Wie 9 L0T) Y3 0 WHURG € 93 [[FYE SOGUINN 13113 [EX12GEUCH IO SIBGUINY QR AT S SIAGUING SSAIPPY asundsa o _ s Siaquin s ppr
Jei 303 i1} A1 AQ BINDA] AIBUM. unm 15enw3 Ry Burivos g o 3a8i1 oy aprn e (o Ao 4 1t e = oo o e1iap! HpRna ikl 0 g T ‘SsoGuA 52,05 BAROKIGE M EUS SBUDIIG RIS BT maK . N = o]
T aie] amj 0 AU st AL 18} UKD PAF 01 PApUAY| ETT £E05) Hiing 5,487
LONINHY ON I Tid, R D91 4 19DI0G PUT
30 PO AT K00 AL © LA P11 ARy A 11y Sl s a1 | 05) 1) A1) PRI 10w ([ st 10 arseds “apea pausna w0 () 199 UBADE UG WIS ) 10 LGOS BL IEIH0 S0 314 U AG PINCIGAR 1M} JUMIFIIA JSUID 40 A1 € |0 ARIS A3 U0 Pawnou A jeys iy
1 AT] 530000 I3 U PR 1,7 1) 521 NN UBEY 7 UOHGD  ONINEY ON— 3NV 3 1191 “HOQUAT ULl URGIFNIRQ J0I7 SILIM © 1M [FLISTEWS SN2 I8 lews SIS sudis uIImIaa (05) 133 Al PISIE 10U e sl o Tarzests Bunwiosue 3¢ eys WG ped
anrs Ftary B a1 6 LIDLDE A Y14 ALpE1 A J0 AR AU LD LAT] SOUDU! BAIINHA 0 I |0 WAARUIG TG W 19 1506 [#1U UG PAACU 0 [P 1ENN U1 LT} 5OUSUI UBMEID PUE DI (,7T) ST 3AI3A WA Y T DD aur| i) Al olepu
o1 pasn aq st BUmn 0] 241 1 20 SIGUIIPAR §1 G SIONUNLEY 0 100 "BIINDI1 348 S3UK ) 21U 530 Ul SUBIG L ONMHY N~ INY] |
i, s S A ) 3L ST AR LS 0 1312003 ) 0F padre SHLS pas EUIE P (L8] UZULA B RaIeISUL S QD PO asaum 1rdr (51} aq LONIR Yo ON—INT TH1A. BUNELS AUS1I9) AR (b U3 00 Ll pas pajured |
aq ey Spua quna pur sy sy TRy ApO3 an; A AQ PaRGISHE S POYIAW 10 UDHEUIGITD © D U0 U PRI 3G Avs L ) |
Apgran ayenbape apmoud 0} Aessazu wym pasiedas a0 pavidas aq pus Sowrd i 1 UONIPUDD HiGHM PUT URD E N DIUIETIHEL ag |
(5 patisap 2 sauey i AQ o g o 3n115G0 31 NGO 0 SPIO) YN AJISRN 01 SPRO) £33 50y DDA 50 1S TN THLI— ININHYS N SPIOM 33 BB IPUL SHUELIIL 50 599000 PARD R 1S 50 Sulls pancudde Jr130j0 P03 38} 3wl Aq pasnbas aiam I § 05 = .
§ i T 900 Suonen Spnfaun of papuay w3 TEToR|  wnngeaa)
AR 11} A3 0 URINRUD) NS 10 KATFIPIS PN TR0 10 1m0 s "Aladan ¢ up 11029 and 1 Auages pue P 10 JEIFLEL SNOP AT J0 ASEA3) PATUDLIATLN 'S IN3I0 31 PAUR AN UE JUIS IR U] SINIAG SNOPIETEH AN —
———— = Huramp| SaAa WINOOT ST-UAT0 VRO ans & aa
[Ausedes sed 4 (3 y5y D) PUOH [ [eUwOU] SPENod /T ¢ v a1eal 10u AIedes K © GIm SuEua Celg] Ry sehgrp| A e i noid o1 peprusiy |
A e A b ST R S |
A Apue) o P aug 1 |
SUGHABINT AN AKIIEAGUISD 0 1aE; DT UM 10 S us paswany 10U e puE CauING PO D) - . . L
- e ] [FUDER 103 ¥ 10] A1 WNRUKET E U 0] PABURLIT 5 UG ST TvioE g £ a




uamas, ueyd A ra b1 03 PaTIOUINE 51 (€121 ) L S smew,
snopiwzey 4o Sunpuny 10 a4n ‘SHTIOT U3 J0 UOIFUULT) aU3 O) 1o SARD OF TSCR) I PaIIGRS 5 [IEYS UoRE|ddE UanS “Age) Hulpury 10 asn 15 ® 250( Apuaurwisad 03 |eaaidde 10} Ajdde |[rys S0LLOA TELH0 BDC D) U1 AQ BIANDI UIYM SIEHITEW 4N jo allriars pur ‘ainiaejnurl ‘sn
211 4y paveovsE suorUEUDS 1aul0 pur sainsEau Aiajes (er2ods DAl ARl UE AJ(I3E} DY) 3 IS IO PAIONS 34 01 SIFUSIE SNOPITZEY O WNOIE 34 W) Arw Jussad 3y (a) pTODS UOHPAS 1ad 1uILad © UIEIGD 0F PaNbal 5| AAOQE SASadING [PIAIWIIGD 10 [IELas 10} 3e surdo.d PoiNDI §OSUMISID S0 S35
1wt Ao € 10 101e53d0 10 15U Airy BP0 B4 [EUONIFUIIYI ZTOZ Y3 J0  TODS HORRYS AapuALE a3 (L) SaruEnh Turuurid PIGSaIL O JO TSNS 1 HE3(LUD POLSH 4O UNBURY 10 TSN WuISUOGSIP Fu1so1s S0) "ZOE ORSS Y11l TLLLL VHVS) IRST O IV UOEIUOYINEaY PUr SIAWBUaIY pungiadng
Lio suorianc.d aya o1 130(qns Saruiae} S POUISSD BiE  SSIIIIDN] (SHI) SO0UFISGNS SNODIETEN AIWSJIK], "SIUNIGNS SNORITIRY ABwanea jo Bupors 1o/pur ‘Fupury Bupndsurn Bursuadsip Trsn 2y} 10) Painbal 5| Yuiad sieaaI SNOPIEITH L SOT PUE §°S0T SIGRING Ul U0 LS 8 PIANDY) 3Q IITY SN a

e 0 OS5 10 5 atury 10U gey) ainsans Bunsma ue jo asn
5143 01 U0NE31IEOW 13 TUON I BP0 BUIPHING [FUOIEUITILY S41 §0 CIUMUAINEDI WNWILIL SY1 UM A0 30U 0P SHUIPING FUISH s g S sanbas o niFuos untus 3uipaoan i sBuping Bunsie Suikdnaoo suassad o3 Aajes sy pue au jo ol wowii e teU3 SIL1 40 WA L

Sampaaad 1501 1008 ) PALSI LI D3UIEP
1081 40 Aa € J0 J5N A1 INOYLIM ADISUI D441 LWOJ) HQEUATD 2IF SIHAIP L3NS PAAINDI "UIEYD ALLINDIS 1D 140G PEAR "WIIE] 14T U3 AITAINDa 9T 01 PANINGLIAA a3t 594 10 01 [0 PrO] Wedm30 ue Huisey
AL PIUROR-3 MY 10 QOO0 ¥ 48P 10U SABR 5100 LAY JMIELIDINE 3t SUIneL o] I0DR U1 Iyl PAPAID 'Ba%n 8 OF PA N 0 S SICT

w1 paaeEp wy
dnoin jo spun fuida
“sund w pasn P

UIRIISOI 10 UDIUAIIP |0 AL 'L

Buumopo) s 9 AuE 2uaym 1008 10 UG wanLd 0L PALINLISD BT JIFUS AT PUR B0

Ay saye ss00p any bl
) 54000 €|
2

P IET T TR [PTAER 0P IRTR g SR o7 prai]

oI sy aau o su

U AL IR 13858 U1 1A

e

(e)5 1005

T ]

iraeye Buiges 5 U0 243 01 USTERPOW 10 OREIT U T5arun s (ST g aon)
41103 axPus 0] Paimbias aq 108 [ YING 050 ADLE)
a3 At 1o 1t 0wy 1o ey S pRRG Bursu

“yae 0GEERR PRAEY ANDP |0 BTN AU 1aNI0Id 01 papusRY ) TagoIe) pur e veTotot Twwng o)

o aq fieys

S50y ) jo

GoHER peN 100 TLTI0h S s
IO 9P ) AL AQ PAADIGHE UM ALUD PUT 72206 LIS SN SIUEFOIIT UL BOIELSLY WIS USSR L 108 Ak |
im0 pareniun 5 (1rys SUDRIMA BORENIEAS (M LIOI] UOHEI0) PAPUSLIE ARUETSUD € 1E PAEAISE St [EVINS WLIERE UE UM 5330 RYOHE UDIEINR0U LSEP 34) JPAIE ] Fannbias aq 10U (RS LAIME MO JEM £ L) 10 KOG LLIE(E Ai) [ENUSW E WOL) RUTM © [0 UDIIMYIUN Syl PaIONT0 3 Buiping oyl reyl sows fupng| | 19UUDSIA0 q pue sadueraun, N
T worwaa] 77t g 5 e
A0) ¥ J5 143 DOT WM PAIEI0] G 81 UBIIUUDD WAIITEAR aH) Ay E SannboY
eI apay A ;A pancsdde SE 10 TR IRAY B PAAD 0L
it jo 303 GOT WL 30 EUS SUDHIBUND UPLILIEGIRD ) o UCHEID] Y1 TR Iedde Ay 10 1) STUIPIG Ay} O3 AN 110 10U M WaEAs Ay KNS B) PAIIAIG0D A0 Pur SMEIEddR AR TP PAIEIDY 0% 3 1145 CUGHINUUOD WALAIRISY Bt FUKIEITPUE PuE SUIDING “ATMAAR TIURIDAY oF 154851 WM
N . “apoy angfHuppng suppng punofapun) 5506 pwwng s aa|
1a1qns. Jmng =, 0] aus Y A0 [jeys sBUIPING punouRiapun)
O 2114/ IIDIING WFRUR RGNS ILLING 3971 10 AT M1 AT PAIINESH a0 O3 [[FUS 53300 PUNDIRIPUN WE) [FLIATEW 3361IMSaNS Jnang ks ads IIEL G 43 SEWEINE | $56() € LI IOUINOAR PAOINDS 30 fleys SRuipng punesfiapun) ..
Swand a1 A s g sRRu o> pur o TFEa06 g =

76 4IBPY YU 3IUEPIOTIE U1 g ys vornagosd an; ‘aBeiop

adAy Azuednoao 4
10 59041 a0 jo na|

SO0 i AN 0L NP PARBL UBYM S0 UDIIMOIE
adidpueys a1mbias ) P00 A0Y MB|IE 01 ALY

P pur an) ays 1wy @) 1duolie Aew 1oy SUDS SO 01 1aBUTD Al SaTeuNIn 3. paalo)
WIaLSAS SAPMULISE HIELIOINE U LA INOUANOL PAGTINGS S HUIPINNG DL PUE SIIAMIIEI PASOTIUIUN 10 101 ay) 03 A3anp “awun £ e ——— Taipen VES06] L K
SIESSOBLI 0 [E31IEIBRI UIPING B 01 ADIAN FUMLLIEEI0 3ty a3 W1} 5180w Sy Ayderlodo) B 1ouym UMDY 78
S5 10 SOOIYA 8O 0] SYI0P BUIpED] PaTS AT T'Y SRogs ol shoss
BUIMO(0] 3410 YA SIAISUDS 01 PaANbA 37 10U [IEN 1 “TEIIE PIGAA JUALLIEdap AN 10 |aAa| J5amo) e Buiusaiep g | UORII0H 1 PASEG sates 10} i
Bt P A a4} 0 [PUVOS O POUIES) AG PATINIR G 10U [IM SIUR 950 FSN-IUETRI0 24y SBUIPING UI BIMOIE 310 SAIIPUTTS | 5D 0
watshs I Ssuawsaseq ui pamopie ase sochdpuers | s |
56 LOILIPS I AIURRIOIIN A SRR (| 55013 0] Pasmbas se pateso] aw a1 Jeu) popinosd orzoas @3 12alams o gy 5aBese By s USG0 W DAMOYE A8 SACHTAUYTS AIp ferursa | 55T
ssae dap an) 1o janan {07 Gy) 100 05T UL 10U 10U PRTTI0N 51 00K I5AUBY 41 aaum safesed Fupiied Uada Ut PamOIe A sadidaes e | S L
S81UEANI0 3 PUE § AN0ID U1 PamOY|E 2ur sadidpues | s 7
£1TE06 48 1T T06 ondas i JnoyEnan PG i pamale ipurss | w5 1
pr——
$5370 BN I sPriaR 8} 0 (331 FAUEY A3 MOAE SAIDYS K] UEKE} 9.0 BATEI0) 51 AIOLS 1S i O 19nin 100 L'
5308 PN 1UAWILITIP 28] FY) O | 483 1SAMO) a4} BACTE SALGIS BMI U] 2101 PILEID| T AIDTS AT |
auved apesd Oy 10 AADGE AR K0TS AX0
150 SUONIPUO? Fum ol o) au) o Aur sy SEURING INOYFNDIYT PAIFSUN 3T JIFYT Swarsks adidpurss |1 s5e0) |
T = SuGnEE iy pannbay | T ooe| WG © @

pnGuIas pand gy 50} a5 SEUIPING Ul [EIHO 3PO) ] A1 AG PRI U T GOG NIRORLL ¢ 505 CUGH3PS Y1 DIIEPHO3IE UL 53 IMINS PUE SHUIPING st ul papio . an Jeus Swshs adidpurs,

e

F-i i 03 Al 10U B UBIE S [0 SudLANNDI) ] uonda]
apm any o) by o pandny
24 VAN 4 S0 b1 BUDES A4} 1M 2IURPIGI I U LIORLIO) PUF 001581 "SIE 340 ane e w e

gy iy aanssast pUNGS SAOOE BRP ST 1 AIPNC 3G 01 S 05 PAIESUI AQ IS SAIEAdE uok

s @ singn By

e aq U

SHuppng e,
1£dN330 Ajsiou 03 P
wasisuod ag

0 BpING aus us o

o U N

TTvE06 “pwns s a|

eSO wadD a3 un BN30) 10 PAYERS B YL HUAIAT n
oo uale aus i pay0) 6 pageas ase e saudua dund i o AiddnG [an) ays Ui

uanioD o oyl Uk pNI0) IO S O 10 IR AR Juird ) sanjen jpanEd 5

UONISO0 UG AN Ur PANI0] 20 IRt A4E 1) SIAEA (01U03 OUIND A0 b

45 eI o1 PUE 1aLEM HSHIOR YOG AOENG 0 PASN 51 IEW AKICNS UOWALIOD & 3434 KT Ve 4N UM SIUERIDIIE UL BajIe ISl Starshs Japyunids anmacimy ¢
EE06 UDILINS Y1 FIUTPIOTIE U1 SWALAS 1R rarr pantn] ¢
o pue -aus sapyunicts ey |

sundar

3 “saniesadun pur spana) s em o ‘Sdund ‘SKiAT RIS JELI0INE 10} AOANS 1316 3 BUNIDIUDT SIATA SHIRTE PUE USKSIAIAGNS WalsAs SIS b EOS

PapInDId 10U 51 WatsAs KapYUNS MO

L 0y angen © pur Ay

1N (011003 WARE 1) P @ 30 (1P Sa1eAS SOPYULIY [IE U0 SOYITIMS MOJII1EM PUP SAINTTAID AP [P

01 18] W WAIGEIE A1 PUE ROCH U SHE YL PANIO] PUE PRAEYD LaeA
UL U S P U1 Sangea o BUISIIOW A1) SSAPAE 91 BN UOBda] RRRY

pue uorsAsadng wazeks 1apds

Aorpyena s
sanonja se Fppng ot ok s s sarur 10w oA pur YGIPAE HUIBHING € Ul BIIIEISUN 1 WAISAS SaULIS Al H4ELIDIE Ut 10U,
Ci e e ES — = i TAMULES SIEPU 0 309 0 EmE TV E06|
180 A5RATP O EHIOU IDUSIXA AP UE I A S A DN 01 PIPUBIY
T 21 06 woriois Aq pamnbia 5 PAIEISUI 09 RS SAOUEIIDE sonawi 1O e WITEAS YIS HOWOIND U 10 USIIET PILEISE S A9 15AS WHIEYE 1§ WIU WITSAT 3 U1 paeTEA
15 3050 Y a3 1D 1AL A B 0 MO[| DS OF TUPIEAINE MOy ST AT PAIEATISE ST FUS SADD LAIFIE Mg Jatem 1oy 4ONS. UONEI0 Eas0 dde P U 50 UBKIIOY 04 N AADGT FEpng Al 10 (O WdISAS IAYULT NIDWIOIND ARAS D PATISUGET a1 RS ATARSALIDY KIEAR P RO
= i er - oA LN ey Db HUWING 5 337

 —



U 0 [JELS UDISIOP 511 BUR UGH3E P5000I0 5 JUAWLIEAAG §1h) 34110 JoD 91 AUPOL K0 “F5IMMA1 “ULILHE AEW IDUNDY A AYL “Hiateay yans,
S HOW £5 13 Dy Mawmay pue aInpatoly W d e A ] SUOREIBALL IB/pUR UOYENAROL posodold § jaiyy s ) Fuiduo)eys i) siseq ay) jussad o) Apun podds ur SARy geys soyego/aumo ay) s o aon
36 11 PRI 2q (IS J01eIAGO oumo YL TNy PIES 10 3WA pUE 18P UL 0 : Aq “pue PAT0B0T a3 IUAPITHD) IUN0Y AU Y3 310,30 HULEDY B HNBADE (045 IUSILIPRG A1 4t ‘4 MA3J D] 153NDA1 o) 0 111 uod |
UL 5 WALLAPAQ A4 U O JIED 43 ik AHE 10U 590 SOIEIOID UMD U AR SUOSEA) 2] APV IS MAIAD) D) 150 AL @310U a1 0 AT 4O SACR UL UNHIM A WLEdag

a4 1 Qi s anas 0] 15anba UaLie ® o) 15T 101eIad0/5aUMO 41 UK PI5OU0I U1 ARUAIEY 03 SANSIP O M 355 10U SAOP JOIEITN0/BUMD A I EUL IOITIHIO/IAUMD i3 WIDUI DSE [TUS 310U UL PAANDI VoW a3 g uonar p e s Aynou
HEYE SRLLIEAAC] @114 Al 10 Iy Ay Iaad Byl O SUGIIANDY PuR SWa] eyl Y FUAIWE) 10U 1 I01RIA00/5AUME AY1 13 50 Rl 4] |0 SEOIPUOD PUI SULIE I | Funueisem g f aueya | 13 aus 0 jang sys eyl iians ays Ui
WA 410 SUDIPUOS PUT UL HU) LM SISO N S|ELTIER SNOPITTEY 3015 J0 3 ) 34140 J01IBHO 0 JAUMD AN 1 31unad © ayona) Aews juawnedag ang o

a1 Fuienieas uioUNE) AID SY1 pUE pUrog Al n S w) g edun A

§a npuos
whep (1) ua

“swana nbas Burioda yg3 o1 akans 5

ang w350 salueya [EnurIsgRs J Isad ayi

OIS UE 510150 SR AUE PUR 11508 SEIMEL SRDRARTFY Y30 J0 RS IGHE UL FULAPISU0T IO} §I0108] UDITER|EAS SUITS UL ST IS FIURDY AN PUR JOATI SUL UON3E Tl 0} [raunes Ay pur soAriy syl aqurys proq A Aiages Jang gy aug

asmppom pur ey “Ataes pqnd o By
J0fpur SEUAIW SOPIETY [0 WO Yl 9] SN0 paie
TG SPIA PUP 5] 55 SR PUnD AU SN 110 SIS 13 S LI LI [FUELIUD A [Pt [0 VA 1E PaIUap O U0 e

ey e s 1ayie Ay |
1 41 40 uoeI| 3y 9
15 a1 4o uoaea) auy 5

awun) w03 pur 410Ra 10

AP e T LM SAYL I G PGS I PUT pUE s
Aoy o s Aue Suprpu

“aus au o uoie N put sajuersans a1 jo ;UTp EIUA0Y

o1 P 10 a1 10 ApRpu ey Tanba usad A UL AN LS PIFOR AIOSIARY ALAIIS HGRA A e S101e onipum pur s o

10 DUENSEH B BUIANIE) 1UNDY ALY PUE IOARA DL D1 SUONFHUIILIONS RYELS [ES BIOG DL AL S 10 PAFB] AASIARY ALa[ES IR b AT RASPISHO ag LY (10 110 ) 10] 15ANDAS U U BALMELI0D AQ 1PYS WOREIRTdS wy DL sREaC] A3 U I ULLAT # INS I} 4BTE e

190 30 4D VY

1INVIISST ONY NOLLYH Idd¥ (3] § 1005 Lendas «|

FINVNSS! ONY NOILYINAdY,

T o] T 0 T
10350 U P 0 2% angs 10] SIUPARID O AP WALM 8 1
S AT g3 U SJOMIN DT UDISING AFAPYSIP 40 S5RS50d 0} Uripiend 40 JAIRG £ JO UDISIAIIONS AY4) JAPLN SSIYUN 160 GT 4O FE DU JOPUN LOSIAE AUE X0} IOGAEIUN AT 18511 ET
FULOFF UOI% 514} AQ POIMOGINE DOMOIN DT UDIIAKG 10 ST [Ny Me| AR 01 AIGIAGOR 23 10U IS _PURDS BUR SSION 0 [0AUG) SRR SUOEINAaN, K| B3 (T 9100 O SUBHGEIT Al AJEAIUDY Sy B) AP0 AN WSS §, 0] A4l 10 SUCKSIAGS il FUBUEYIAION 7T
W% ] PIIOYID 43 PIOY 'PAIOTS A THIDMAN) I SINIL JUMTLIASUT AUE 0 °UOIIALE AU} SUHDTI ‘T UOTEE ‘SISOH gty Ha 015 LUAURLIAG AP 10 30 BIPUING MO UM DYIOMAN, 1005 10" 91PO1AD “WEDINS WS “MORLL (1245 UDSIN ON TT
tewnue 10 “ydoad jo dnoi8 “unssad Aue teau 1o je
AT A oI e a3l wossed Aue jlegs 100 ‘e B 0 jssaa Buiroy ¢ io) panse uasg sy ® asagm 100 10 SUT 0 Aur Ul 3SR DATUOIOW B ALUOH AL
ae 10y “pasors ase sysoman; 0103y ungan 30 oous Auor “Wenttson ‘yaumun Aut j0 1an) PaIpUn s Uny
BTN AUE UG TYIOMA 10D “apofxa ‘@ ‘wonp o
Sqummay g1 Bunjonys uotiad ayi Ag paumo ou kysadosd uo spueyjeasays ed Aur 1 yans ‘joasayy ed Aue oo ‘) adosd ] 1P IR © IS U *SaAap Jyaaz0uAd Fuipn) ‘apoyxa ‘asn oy o)
UFEA PUR W' DO:OT O SINON U USIMIAG WA IER O AN UD WG DOCTT PUR W OOIOT JO SINON U3 UAAMIAG JRA UIED 4O F pUR Z AINT UD P
o ] g e ssanppe ey
|0 1010 a1 18 PAURIGE 3q AVW IWIAT ay| DI O S013NE A1 Jieys pue asn 0 WOMEI0] PUE ‘S5AIPPE "ML UL LIFILOD IBUS LLLIRA 34 | ILIBE AQ LD PAMOIE BQ JIELS UONIAS SI4IAQ PATIOUINE S8 DOMMIL Oy'T UOIIAIQ |0 MEIEYISID 10 S ASS0d M) 'G,
s34 Ty e sa e 1945 1 w0 afieg B
5XHYAS 40 SHIMOHS S1IN3 NOLLAYD. 1qE] UoHnIm aul
0 HUAp A0 HULMOID] 41 11w U210 Bt LAY 10 SAIPU) T30 1) BRI 10U PUT ", S LHOATH ONY STIV DNINYTA SI00HS ONINHYA. 50 STIV DNIIWYTI SIOOHS DNINHYM. ‘190¢] UONNED a1 UD 3Uipiom Hmoio] ] 1w [5Ge) U UD _AIPUT)), PIom au3 AQ PaLIUag ‘s INOUIIM JO Yism Salpur) Uroy 3
PUR {20 IIPUADOUDE BUINSIIE |0 3500.NG 241 10} TIABPIS 10 U YU SIS T
NS v ua a0y T
“ENROMAN] DE'T UDmMIAIQ “AaI3 BUL {0 I @D "HPUR “BIDYS *SSASON ) UDEIAE AUR IO [NjMEIUN 30 [[PYS 1 T 109088 LINGSSIA THWING 5,337 |0 A1) 34 j0 $APaT PUI SarEIRIG)
quandde e pur ‘gL 1001 5114 'H2D 6F 100 '£0ST-00ST S1Td ‘U1 91 IS4 D10'F-0V ¥SD [T HNOSSY O SaINIeIS Pasiaay aus Jo GZF 4R10My) iim ATUIDD SYI0MA) LS PApIADI ‘AX> oy 1OV T uDIsINg uirsa jo asn pur unpuey ‘sl 1o1s ‘varssavsod L v
1901 3G |[PYS SHIOMIIY OF'T UEHEII] 4O 51 PUl L
PaluLId 2g fleys Y0, 10 nisa) pur NQUIaSE ‘aImDeUR WL 7
095 BOILIAS U1t 33U ERCLIO Us A{UG PRI 3G [|E4S SHIOMDIY i weLiad o atesons g1 10 1oy 1
smoyo) s 108K 'k ] 33108507 3L UM PALIGIYOIH DIE SYIOMAI JO 250 pUr Fupury “aes "ol I0]s *aInRjnURL Unissassod wy |
aauasaa ey 1150005 g % aa7|
“aauasajas s pajdope A Bumnaad 0] SIS 1P 0 Sanuenb puE sadAl oy Fspaedas sy 51 (5N o 5] UD3% 34 1A SAUAEL 10 5N AL MOE O UOI2S S SPUAY
T9T005 uoiiows qiim a5 el iq o woiEsIade| i BoD] Tols 1005 g 5 a1
a3 ey annbas o) pazviouy apa anj oy o paerey jo Furipuey 1o acn ‘aFesrs ) 0 WKL) o) 0] J01d SATP OF 35R3) IF PRLALGNS 50 ey UDrEdde Ying ‘AHe) Fupury 10 asn“aBriors ¢ 350 AQusurisad of (eaodde 0] dde 1P Taa P 1PIX0 BP0 A ays Ag pRINba UM
(Pl 1005 g 5201

{2} 5°T0as uorpas,

puing s an|

LA S|EUDLEL SIOPIETEY JYI0 AL S8 PITAI0NT 0G (IS UDIEDP £, J3I) LI LD FEaddy WMULIRIaQ Al Ml JO jIAL) Wl AG A
mojon pur spunod Q7 AADGe SarS0diNd [PJMIW0Y 10 Bri0) o) sed aurdosd patanbi SasuIsIp 10 5350 1YL

T

pansop 1 pae i ey sn

1310 SO 1ETEH UE EIGO D1 AN 51 VDA U ULIO} 195 (D] SatnUenb piousa:

suwazeyd sadosd au) pur sajes i

PIDUSANL | MD}3T SIUROLIE 1
e aurdo

{31} auediosd jo saunuenb
V1 40) AUNGECID WIS 10 WA 10U S0P AU auL saes afesors jo

1 g

@ Buippuey pus 260 i

i

 “aurdoad o Aurjpury pus o a0
iurys sy (Dal) snueny Auuueyg|
10ud 01 papaau auny e

0 sunowr ays|
500 s saduen)

Surdaig
10} essng SN OOPITEY

- |

TR To0s{
|
|
|

T 23|




9003 I 11 01 WS ING PaSUAN| AIPAER DHE ASG0KS 36 [EAr BRETTH AT au | 8 AN 1 01 Ul 190 5 Ssng)

a4y aum Aw e v pue pam s 15 3y 1 Buwmayo) au1 opinasd ey wejd Aindas ay) Wnusiuiy € Ty spend io prent 41 J0 SUOREXIENG 41 0 3 Hand 21 01 UG 10w Wam ) an
“UOIEN|AdE O S S I UL AILIATIS ] 411D 0L 01 PIRDLID] 5 IFS DI HddE saut0 wonan L ‘
SN [[EUS 35USN| € J0) STUESAOR ([y FTI SWES U1 0 1L A o pa3asa i suds p o1 pue ‘suf)

wis huw A

10 (PRGN 0 UORIPUES ¥ Ty “BaTUAN U O

[ ——
iisig 1IN 13905 ] 10 IR SE DINGICCE SUINS AU JOU ‘STURTS DISUIN] AIIEIODWI] 0N DINNDIY ATUNISS 40 DUOR - SIS |0 [FADUIAH PUR ISt () S3{IF1al [PUOSEaS aif] AT PGS 10U SUDIIEI0) I SOMALINDO J0 |{5a3 € S 31| 31EHaMie 1 10 UORINP 03 15aKANS 3G 10U | HEFTUN A4} 10 1UNGIE BUL OIE e
A5 i P HLBGNS 30 (IeUs SFEIAN0D B3 O WY U1 BUND DUOMIN [0 HES (1F13) U1 wo) Fursue sanpaey Rauana pue ‘w3 Saide 00'D00'000'ZS © PUE 2381330 10 00'000'000 TS LEUL 55| OU |0 1 ME a1 00 N 1B oy ) Suomay|
JAUIAA3 [© 3PS (P11 U 0] A13)PS N [© 10 UNBSSIA U1 AQ NSS! A THIEA E 6 (001 L1 K37 K 48 WONLENAAE DN 1AL A1ETS 10 100K T “AKRIO| 21 AQ PURIAIAIAP SE JIPI0 130N E3I4RAIT ) BRSO3 96 IS WONENORN 1GE3IdE Ik UL PUE PHUBD RALAID A |4 OTIIESE
UL SN € O IUEINSH ] LOTISW IS O USHIEIIIOU 0 N0 IR} 1FI3-ALIO] UILIM DIEC 4 1SN 304 Wik SIUIT 3305 UL 304 TR ST [FI3S 3U1 AP DUF 1US10d0[3A30 PUE FUEULIP|Y [0 1UUNIPEIE U W L1 $1UAR3 12905 © WEIED OF P2ANDI 30 DSFE 18 0N SIIL SIRUN 5N © 4T IG0 Oy ST e

1Y 1S 10 1O 1] S¢ Ina [ 1L FUTIIIS U 5910 10 Wt A @1 0ud predt g v SE[D 410 A1 0 SIUENOCE P 1END 0 BOIPME 30 AT S5UAN TIIELA) U} S5ED N1 341 0] PINISE1 ST J0 RNOWE S 193 10 07 Burd 2
T
U PRYSI B0 S TUED 31 0 TR 4 LORENKIE 5113 341 L3I AR 13N S P39 [Py S5UBRap 1 6 S 3 UGIACIOAA) PR BUINLPL [ 1380 981 U0 el 3 B) 10 91 ) 18 IOPURS 10 S9UEn © MR RS TP Uowa "ty s S oo} i i ASGLIO) ] BO135(ES T |18 e 07
L 0 01 paEst 2 dew 1O P9 U0 Py 100 5 ONEREY uE 1) 189A
1010, (55000 Pt a1 30 YSLNLING 5,901 0 A3 UL ST BRIEI0] G340 UE S m U EEUERIO HIGIIUOY (U ¢ £ TN 550 541 0 TR 5,351 0 4313 801 198 Ut B o pu pateao) suoneeia S
4120 Urhime ey A pansasax pLanbas o)
2 o 31 0 |49 O Py SO R €U0 SR AUR DUV UOIEIO] IRIrIEd € 10]
Joo “wanudopAQ pur Bue|d (0 10DANQ 1 AQ PAIAIT WI)
Jrat wand e sop § 50 7L by U1 Wasa a1 oy

0 aimanns v w1

DN 35U S9IES BEISH T
S0) puE 590RPI0

30 pasodand ay) pur Ajnua ue
2 Arus uone|des

5 SN ASAT UPLT B0 BN S ETSO]
108 papUae Iidoe

0 01708 241 HONIEIO] PUE S04 e G JAGUIN LG UOIIE Ity TOU S WORENODY OIS
OIS S D [ USRS 4G R0l 1w 10p 1910 10

1O @50 PUE 21 40 30 341 0} SIIUEUIDIO 10 APOT 11N AL 1331531 0] PAPULLY

TR = o TIota, Tty
| ians; 5,331 10 A1y 443 n P S1Um Bulgam 13 GO R WO1PR 01 PapEY| g At O 10-HI0)
P31 APEY 1] AL AQ PRI S USUIHOLAAE BINU] AN 1I0UBOY {14 SPEO1 SSaTE SHEIPHAR ) S5 PASEA U O 10U JEYS BE01 S5aTIe smedde ang B © U0 SN Ruamp 10 squn g 7|
POMa1 0 10U [IFS SUONIANE QM WS1] S5070 ‘SUIIEAL JOVFULILS [PIIUSRISO) PanCUA AQ PALYIOAE . CHAN BUSIIAD I[F DUE AP SSA20E A1EALT IO HGO IS € U UM FURIIMD S3M3] 10 05 I 3101 21 1
swondan
DI UONIS6, 0 SIMUAANDS) 641 133U P43 PUT ‘SPID) S539T SMUTIPGGE 341} PAACIIET PUT 18 A O] LI PAPADIA 30 ([P 05 TS SN BUliam jO Jaqun i 4k s Anse -3 10 30 jo 0 LN
o oa| wraum oy | £ v0la] muang ¢ a1
Q1 B3R 1 10 SAIURISWINDIN JEALIEC O3 NP WO 3 |0 5110 AL 1o 10U
| e 10 uoenas aus jo i s 1amuw 1 pagoAd 3 ey weusone k) |
TUTHIIO AP0 ) SK1E A PAACHIGE S1 40 1455330F U IMIOG S I 1S UL PRSI PIAKYS 9] O1 I 10 AL N1 10 UONSNE 19 Wi 5531 100 01 [#1ba Lede aouRTSp @ Pade)d g oyt Aai Pannbas i speos $5a3E oMl | | |
o SPU peag ¥ EOLQ! Waung ¢ a1
Jrunjja apa3 an g Aq pasa “rEota maes ul pue yipim 05 [/£45 (4 07 £ S¥) 193] 05T J0 S5O Ul EPROS ST29E SLEINGEN B3 puB-prag
paagag a0 jua 10N 011 Srg] AACUID 01 PRI WEIpAY © v pro) sy reo10] g % )
Tpana Sarnaiguma] 75016 aaeL @ adv| g+ o
a0 e aues ay enuapEsas Faeasl arQeL K05 01 %57 WOl pue shump) pu £y dnois)
(v B F3) (erapea s o) i saseanu) 4 ur
Z'50TA AL U K0S B KEE WO (v pur £yl 1envaprsas w oy an saseanul 430 SHUIBHING 40 O[3 PAANDIY
e FIPUSWE o 139943 WG %331 10 10 1 1 I 16 3RO 341 10 1/ 5% PRIJORE 30F 0 QINGIL § WRuSddy 16 SUsEReId 3u L 0 R0y v savpuaddy| a ynoag - apundy, W §
Eordony] T e F g g et Gieaaay jo pieog v pusddy] e
S o] 555 w03 oee| s a9
PO sty |EUOIIOWA U RTOZ M43 01 ISP MAE SH41 IO S SRS PUNOIHIAPUN 47 SUDIEINHA SHIEIND 141 APOY SI4LjO UG Auy| 2310 A1) au w sadrds puNaIEIapUN padolarnp Jo 95N A1 STAIPRE 0L PIPRY|  aards urausswigng UwNS 5,331
“Surdon 10] S5 0id BuriEiiad pur SaNEed WanNng o1 papumiy, i) o) aing 391
1140 a0 241y 941 Aq UOEION 1) 1T PaRS UaaG e d e £y 10} IR0 S ) U APIATID
IMOPJIETEH dYL LT 4o pay; " W IO SN 1Y) ) AUR 10} paImba 51 YWl Y 2G0T PUR GO SUDIDAS Wi Yo jas se paanba aq jjey
POOYIOTUHSY [ENUARIER) Ul fan Wing Baoy. wa 3qnd ay) daay 0 papuawy yue afiesons punoddancay| &7v0e5 wusng 5, aa)
| apesa) paunz Sease EAIEI0) Aq 10U ey Sye] 6067 Teeros pur ¢ um et ur spmby e
Pannbal 10U I [EUOHEIUD UE j LAR SPINDI| g v0s wasing 00
PQUSNAWIOD PR MO O 3FeI0T 0 uoneEa) U] 0] MOI[E 03 papuawY
<uo(jeH-D0E eyl Ja1EAH Snowe|
Wi pasn 40 ‘pagpury ‘paints pasuadsp ‘passadond ° i ase spnty 10 ajgru vy a0 10 nedn 00 PLIEIGD o0 15ALI LGNS TUAMUILITT NG D4 PUR URID 3115 © 'UONFIUON *£'S0T PUF §'S0T UDIIAS Ul yua) 1a% se paunbas ag ||eys siwiag|
13 SN ET SG TSI AT TR ang o] ErrE TyTioe| | wwwns s ool
Funrse|q patinatiad weas Besur SFEWEQ € PUE AUE ISUIEER UOTPSUNT 341 AjIULADI 0 ISE DU Ul HIETDIPE 34 01 UCKAPSUN U J0 IUALLIEdR (€58 341 AQ FAUILLIAIAP S e 13402 PUE TUNOWIE ‘LD S| UOSAIG LNOSSIPY a3 PUF Wt rdaq DAI0A MGG o4 8 195131 01 PapUNLY|
Ul 30URINSUL O 2103411143 € HLIGNS J0 PO © 1] IEYS [Facsde o] suesidd syl ‘panss 5 Bunseq ajag oA 1 y10m Sand o1 Ag sanisoydna jo Bunpuey pur a¥iols av) e a0 “suonesado Hunseja ja uonsadr p g BULERY ) y N
AR J0WINEU03] i W raue V71095, g a0
s PR sy W) s a9 RS Sori 1o sanop| 10 FSIPUE S/ES 0 230 UL 1o} SAuFUIPA0 15 ap0) 21N> aU) 1AYA1 ) PApuSLY
Pasmban o) JUADUI 1551 55 4a3ead £ A1EPUL IS JO UOLEI0] A 1€ SUOINPUDT UORAGS K04 A8 I U1 NI WAOLIE Fassal 0 K1eadl ® APIAS 0) paTIGIN g aup s AU UIRpM OGN BB D) AQ POZLIDYINE 13¢ AUE /O TINPUOD A1 AT PISIT 3 50 1O SSr g ALsacia |
0 50039 01 SSFER |17 10 ke 3u1 § 350AIN 141 10) TUNOLIE S 1 10} AWOD SIS AT HAND ¥ 10 DIDDOD'ZS 40 WS [FOIULIT U] Ul PUBT AJINS FIOtI03 F o HpSUn! 33 i 31 e 1 'z 1095 PaNSSH 4 119G © 200,98 AU e 72 1095 ¢ -
RO HNUBEI3|  SOMAl§ 0 ARORIG 133 PUT RS ot g aa1




|l d N OSSIIN
LINWNS s.331 &1

9po9 all{ |euoijeulajuj
8102 @Y} O} spusawpuawy




‘suolelado

Aouabiawae Bunp siapuodsal Aouabiaws
pue sia1ybially 0] Ai1ajes sspinold
‘'Sasiwald pue sainonis

‘sbuipjing bunsixa pue msu 0} saljddy
‘'SUOIJIPUOD snosabuep 1o uoisojdxe ‘all}

JO spiezey ay)] wody uonosjoid Ajadouid pue
A1o1es all| 10 |9A8] 8|qeuoSeal B SSPINOId
"sao110e1d

poob paziubooal Ajjeuoneu Yylim juaisisuod
Sjuswalinbal wnwiulw 8yl saysiigelsy

:9p02 aul} ay} jo asodind ay |

ap09 all4 [euoljeusalu| 8L0Z




"SOpP0D

DDl J8yjo pue Og| 8y} sjuswiidwo)
'S$9J0AD

9pP02 OM] UIYlIM 8g am Jey] salinbai QS|
04l 210z pue "Od] 900¢

04l €002 D4l 000Z D4N 1661
‘sieah

99l1y] Alens ap0o2d ay] JO suollipe maN
'S9SS920.d pue ‘sjeusiew

Bulip|ing ‘ABbojouyos) mau Ssalppy

¢ D4l 8102 @43 3dopy Aypa




Sl

'UOI109S
S |eysie|p ail{ / [IPUNOY sjsiyd ali
OJ}9|\ BOUBWY JO LieaH ay} Ag pajeyijioe}
saleddiunw Jayjo ylim suoissnosi(]
'SOOIAISG JuswdoleAa(] YlIM UOIIBUIPIOOYD) -
‘dnoub snooj JNo Ylim sabueyd pamainsy .

S$S920.d uondopy




(11 JeydeyD) sbuipjing bunsix3
‘sadlpuadde Jo uondopy

'S, 004 01 aouessi|

‘sadidpue)s pue 1ybiay bulpjing paJapulds
‘sjuelpAy 0] asuelsiq
Buiuing uadQ
SYJOMa3JIH

Sliwiad [euoneladQ

sjusawpuawy Aoeba71 g4ST




(11 sse|Q) paispjuuds

uaym swalsAs sadidpuels wol) asoy yoaul g/L/L peAoway
‘Seale all} 0] pajelal sploysaly}

MaU e Jo sey salouedndoo 3 dnoug) jo uoijosjold Jspjuuds
"9o1j0e1d Aujsnpul Jo SA13O8|48) 810w 8g O} 9p0od

ay} Inoybnouyl pasiAal Usaq aAeY SW)SAS uoIjoalep seo)
"SWIa)sAs |043U0D BYows

pue sBulpjing asu ybiy Joj pappe usaaq aney swalshs Ajajes
3Jl| pue uondajoud auly Jo) sjuswalinbal Buysa) pajeibaju|
191deyo swalsAg AbBlaug mau y

"9p02 3y} O} pappe uaaq aAey sbuipjing

Ajsianiun pue ab3]|09 1o} sjuswalinbay uoledllloN SSe
"SallIAlloe uoljoelixs pue buissaosoud jueld pue

S)onJ} pooj ajiqow ‘sallojelode| uoeonps Jaybiy ‘ebelols
19||ed Joopino 0} paje|al spiezey ssaippe suoisinold maN

M3N S JEYM




uosiad; ubspg
]O @sn ssaulsng pajeljuaduod 1o} peo| Juedndd0 mau paysiigels3

‘paziuebioal pue paosueyua

usaq aAey / Jaydeyd ul sainiea) uoloajold ayows pue ail) Jo adueUSUIBIA
"SBI}IAI}OB UOII[OWap PUB UoljoNJsuod 10} sjuswalinbal yojem aliy ay |
‘suonigiyxs

pue SMoOYSs apeJ} Joopul ‘sjuans Ajquasse JoopINo 1o} SUOISINOI-
‘solouednooo [|e 1o} eale [esiadsip ajes e o} Jo Aem oljgnd ay}

0] [9Aed] Jo yied abieyosip Jixe ay} 1o} uoleuiwni|i alinbai suoisinoid maN
‘salpuedno20 -y dnolg) ul pasinbai Jebuoj ou

aJe Wa)SAs uoj0a}eap SXOWS dljewolne ue pue wajsAs wieje allj [enuew Y
‘9b.JeyosIp 1IX3 JO |9A3] 1SOMO| BY} MOjeg JO aAode 00} Spa3dxa peo|
Juedno20 syl a19ym Os|e Ing aiow 1o QOE S! peo] Juednado sy} usym Ajuo
Jou palinbail mou ale sa1ouednd20 \y dnolo) ul swalsAs wiele allj [enuey

OM] Med -MaN S Jeym




;suolsand







"all} Jo

adA} ay} sayojew Jaysinbunxa Jo adAl ayj ains mvﬂu_,\/_ .
‘odeosa JO 81n0l 1es|0 e 9ABH .

‘ale Aay] alaym mouy]

19pJo Bupjiom ul pue pabieyd way) desy] .

"al1] 8Y] 810J8q 1l SN 0] MOY MOUYM .

'salll TIVIAS Ino bumnd Aq

Auadoud pue saAll 8ABS ued Jaysinbunxs
all] a|genod e ‘Ajuadoud pasn uaypp

sJaysinbuilxg aJli4




siaysinbuixg aii4 jo sadA]



| djgerabap) eipaw BuUNOOD |

(5104 PUE SJIO (WY SO |

sfojje P18 S[QIISNgLE0d
PUPE S|E1SW 3|gIISNQuIo)) |

i

sojesado ay) o) sabuep
noyum uswdinbes
[eausa)2 anl Buinjonul
Sauny uo pasn ag Aeyy

-spinby ajgewnruey JaY1o |
pue juied }O SUIOSED) |

m V0O X

i

| sjeiatew KIRUIpIO JIYI0 B | <

ysea o saded 'poopy, |

TOaNAS |
MM |

b

S3dld
.mD ﬂ.m.ﬁfﬁ ,

P
B, |
| o
™
‘\-0

siaysinbunix3g a4







S1

uoiow m:_aoogw

a|puey mnww:cw
911} Jo aseq je Wiy

uid |Ind










juswdinbs |eolos|a uiejuiely .
‘payiew Ajadoud
puUB SUOoIONJISO JO Jes|D S|aued [eoljosle desy] .
‘S)9|1N0 BUIPBO|ISAO PIOAY
‘1omod apinoid 0] BuiAn ate noA jeym ueyy Jayealb
10 9ZIS swes ay] 8g 0] PodU SPIOD UOISUSIXT .
‘Slew
Jleyd Jo 1adied Japun Spiod UOISUS)Xa uni Jou oq -
"SpPJ0D pakel) 10 8S00] aoe|day .

‘alnjie} 10 uoidunjjew |eos11}29|d
jo mab 2wios >n pasned aJe sall} Ssauisng sSnoJsWnNN

Alajeq |eo11}29|3




S1

‘paldnoooun sale )sap 10
‘WO0J By} Uaym Jajesy adeds syl Jo uin] =

‘Juswdinbs bunesy
wioj Aeme 199} ¢ 1se9| 1e ainjuiny 1o ‘Jaded
Se yons ‘uing ueo jeyj sbuiyy ||je dosy =

"PJOD UOISUB]Xd Ue O}ul
Janau Ajloeded juaioiyns ylim 18)1n0 ue ol
is)eay aoeds palsamod-o1i109|8 INoA bn|ds

Si9)}edH 9okedg




‘sjeuoissajold

Aousbiswa Jjo wes] e buizin Auadoud buiosyoid

pue Ysu buiziwiuit ‘Sall bBuines afiym S82INISS JUBIOIYS
pue ajes buipinoid jo uonipel) buipuejs buoj e yim
9NI8S 8M 8Soy] pue Ajunwiuwiod Ino 0} pajiuwod ale
juswipedsg alid Juwwns S,887 ayj JO Siaquia ay] ‘g

juswia)e}sS UoISSI




