CITY OF LEE'S SUMMIT, MO-PURCHASING DIVISION - UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION
This is an unofficial bid tabulation and only reflects the initial reading of the bids received, not the evaulation of such bids

BID NO.: 2017-130

PROJECT: Water Meters
DATE/TIME: June 2, 2017 @ 10:00 am

OPEN BY: ddt HD Supply Midwest Meter Mueller Systems
Material UID Description Unit| Est | Unit Cost| Total Cost | Mfr [Unit Cost| Total Cost | Mfr |Unit Cost| Total Cost Mfr
%" Positive displacement lead free bronze alloy meter w/ cast iron bottom plate, in
Mtr %” Displ + Positive disp ze atloy w/ cast i plate, 1 EA| 20 | $153.50 | $3,070.00 [sensus| $190.88| $3,817.60 |Badger| $278.25| $5,565.00 |Mueller
gallons w/ Itron connector and 100W ERT.
i 5/8” x %" Positive displacement lead free bronze alloy meter w/ cast iron bottom
Mtr 5/8” x % “ Displ 4500 . . . . . .
r5/8” x % “ Disp plate, in gallons wj Itron connector and 100W ERT. EA $93.95 |$422,775.00|Sensus| $146.00 | $657,000.00|Badger| $252.75 |$1,137,375.00 Mueller
1” Positive displacement lead free bronze alloy meter w/ cast iron bottom plate, in
Mtr 1" Displ tive disp ze atloy w/ cast i plate, | EA| 60 | $185.00 | $11,100.00 [sensus| $218.00 | $13,080.00 |Badger| $345.00| $20,700.00 |Mueller
gallons w/ Itron connector and 100W ERT.
Mtr 1%”Displ 1%” Single dial displacement meter in gallons w/ Itron connector and 100W ERT. EA| 20 | $417.00 | $8,340.00 [Sensus| $427.00| $8,540.00 [Badger| $556.50| $11,130.00 |Mueller
Mtr 2" Displ 2” Single dial displacement meter in gallons w/ Itron connector and 100W ERT. EA 30 $573.00 | $17,190.00 [Sensus| $574.15 | $17,224.50 |Badger| $609.75| $18,292.50 [Mueller
2” Omni C2 17” Length Single dial, all wheel, 100 gal Compound Meter w/ test plu . .
Mitr 2" Cmpd 17” Lgth gth >ing gal~omp /testplug | ea | 15 |$1,089.00| $13,068.00 |sensus No Bid No Bid
and Itron connector, or aa
Mtr 2" Cmpd 15.25” Lgth [2” Omni C2 15.25 Length Single dial w/ test plug and Itron connector, or aa EA 10 [$1,089.00| $10,890.00 |Sensus No Bid No Bid
3” Omni C2 Single dial, all wheel, 100 gal Compound Meter w/ test plug and Itron . .
Mitr 3" Cmpd & gal~omp / test plug EA | 10 |$1,372.00| $13,720.00 |Sensus No Bid No Bid
connector, or aa
4” Omni C2 Single dial, all wheel, 100 gal C d Met test pl dlit . .
Mitr 4" Cmpd mni C2 Single dial, all wheel, 100 gal Compound Meter w/ test plug and tron EA| 7 |$2,363.00| $16,541.00 |Sensus No Bid No Bid
connector, or aa
6” Omni C2 Single dial, all wheel, 100 gal C d Met test pl dit . .
Mtr 6" Cmpd mni C2 Single dial, all wheel, 100 gal Compound Meter w/ test plug and tron EA| 2 |$4,060.00| $8,120.00 [Sensus No Bid No Bid
connector, or aa
8” Omni C2 Single dial, all wheel, 100 gal C d Met test pl dlit . .
Mitr 8” Cmpd mni C2 Single dial, all wheel, 100 gal Compound Meter w/ test plug and tron EA| 1 |$6,995.00| $6,995.00 [Sensus No Bid No Bid
connector, or aa
TOTAL $531,809.00 $699,662.10 $1,193,062.50
Meter must meet AWWA, NSF, ANSI, & EPA Standards and the lead-free provisions of the Safe Drinking Water Act. Yes Yes Yes
Meter must be tested by manufacture prior to shipment and test results attached to meter body. Yes Yes Yes
Displacement meter encoder shall have a glass face and non corrosive bottom with an adhesive seal. Yes Yes Yes
Displacement meter encoder shall have the ability to be factory programmed to output 4,5,6,7, or 8 dials of resolution. Yes Yes Yes
Displacement meters must have a bottom plate designed to yield or break under normal freezing conditions to minimize Yes Yes Yes
damage to meter parts.
Displacement meters must have a molded ERT clip on the register casing. Yes Yes Yes
Bidder shall provide detailed specific warranties and guaranties to this bid. Yes Yes Yes
During the course of the contract year, the using department(s) may need to order items not specifically listed above. Please
. . . 10% 0% 25%
state any discounts for such purposes from your listed prices.
City standard payment terms are Net 30 after receipt of invoice. State any discounts offered for early payment. 2% 30 days, net 31
Delivery Time (after receipt of Purchase Order). 30 days 30 days
Is the pricing provided above tax exempt per the City of Lee’s Summit’s State of Missouri tax exempt status as stated under
) A ) Yes Yes Yes
section 1.0 Instructions to Bidders, paragraph 1.14?
Is the pricing provided above tax exempt per the City of Lee’s Summit’s State of Missouri tax exempt status as stated under
Yes Yes Yes

section 1.0 Instructions to Bidders, paragraph 1.14?

* 100W ERT not included

*100W




