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CITY OF LEE'S SUMMIT, MO-PURCHASING DIVISION - UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NO.:  2017-068

PROJECT: Water Operations Material

DATE/TIME: January 20, 2017 @ 10:00 am

OPEN BY: ddt (Tom and Brent present)

Material UID Description Est 

Qty

Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

Clmp 04" Bell Clamp, Bell, joint Size4 2 $99.98 $199.96 $56.75 $113.50

Clmp 06" Bell Clamp, Bell, joint Size6 2 $110.11 $220.22 $62.48 $124.96

Clmp 08" Bell Clamp, Bell, joint Size8 2 $151.36 $302.72 $86.43 $172.86

Clmp 12" Bell Clamp, Bell, joint Size12 1 $205.71 $205.71 $117.55 $117.55

Clmp 04" Bell Clamp, Bell, joint Size4 2 $99.98 $199.96 $56.75 $113.50

Clmp 04"x12"x01" Clamp, Repair, FS1-514-125-CC4 5 $66.97 $334.85 $73.09 $365.45

Clmp 04"x12"x02" Clamp, Repair, FS1-514-125-CC7 5 $76.40 $382.00 $84.43 $422.15

Clmp 04"x12"x3/4" Clamp, Repair, FS1-514-125-CC3 10 $66.63 $666.30 $73.09 $730.90

Clmp 04"x20"x01" Clamp, Repair, FS1-514-20-CC4 5 $101.93 $509.65 $114.63 $573.15

Clmp 04"x20"x3/4" Clamp, Repair, FS1-514-20-CC3 5 $101.93 $509.65 $114.63 $573.15

Clmp 06"x12"x01" Clamp, Repair, FS1-724-125-CC4 10 $78.00 $780.00 $84.05 $840.50

Clmp 06"x12"x02" Clamp, Repair, FS1-724-125-CC7 25 $86.71 $2,167.75 $95.39 $2,384.75

Clmp 06"x12"x02" IP Clamp, Repair, FS1-724-125-IP7 2 $86.93 $173.86 $92.22 $184.44

Clmp 06"x12"x3/4" Clamp, Repair, FS1-724-125-CC3 5 $78.00 $390.00 $84.05 $420.25

Clmp 06"x20"x01" Clamp, Repair, FS1-724-20-CC4 5 $123.43 $617.15 $137.60 $688.00

Clmp 08"x12"x01" Clamp, Repair, FS1-929-125-CC4 5 $88.06 $440.30 $95.52 $477.60

Clmp 08"x12"x02" Clamp, Repair, FS1-929-125-CC7 25 $96.90 $2,422.50 $106.92 $2,673.00

Clmp 08"x12"x02" IP Clamp, Repair, FS1-929-125-IP7 2 $97.39 $194.78 $103.69 $207.38

Clmp 08"x12"x3/4" Clamp, Repair, FS1-929-125-CC3 10 $87.62 $876.20 $95.52 $955.20

Clmp 10"x12"x01" Clamp, Repair, FS1-1144-125-CC4 2 $108.37 $216.74 $122.26 $244.52

Clmp 10"x12"x02" Clamp, Repair, FS1-1144-125-CC7 2 $117.70 $235.40 $133.61 $267.22

Clmp 10"x12"x02" IP Clamp, Repair, FS1-1144-125-IP7 2 $117.70 $235.40 $130.43 $260.86

Clmp 12"x12"x01" Clamp, Repair, FS1-1350-125-CC4 5 $127.54 $637.70 $138.62 $693.10

Clmp 12"x12"x02" Clamp, Repair, FS1-1350-125-CC7 10 $136.82 $1,368.20 $149.96 $1,499.60

Clmp 12"x12"x3/4" Clamp, Repair, FS1-1350-125-CC3 10 $127.54 $1,275.40 $138.62 $1,386.20

Clmp 01"x03" FLSC-132-3R 2 $10.29 $20.58 $17.36 $34.72

Clmp 01"x06" FLSC-132-6R 2 $17.96 $35.92 $31.02 $62.04

Clmp 02"x03" FLSC-238-3R 2 $14.28 $28.56 $19.89 $39.78

Clmp 02"x06" Clamp, Repair, FS1-263-6 5 $26.26 $131.30 $29.59 $147.95

Clmp 02"x08"x01" Clamp, Repair, FS1-263-75-CC4 2 $51.05 $102.10 $47.79 $95.58

Clmp 02"X08"X3/4" Clamp, Repair, FS1-263-75-CC3 2 $51.05 $102.10 $47.79 $95.58

Clmp 02"x08" Clamp, Repair, FS1-263-75 5 $26.26 $131.30 $28.36 $141.80

Clmp 02"x12" Clamp, Repair, FS1-263-125 5 $43.50 $217.50 $40.47 $202.35

This is an unofficial bid tabulation and only reflects the initial reading of the bids received, not the evaulation of such bids.

Blue Springs WinWater Schulte Supply
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Clmp 02"x15" Clamp, Repair, FS1-263-15 5 $48.75 $243.75 $53.15 $265.75

Clmp 03"x06"x3/4" FS1-400-6-CC3 2 $44.39 $88.78 $48.65 $97.30

Clmp 03"x08" FS1-400-75 2 $30.82 $61.64 $33.18 $66.36

Clmp 03"x12" FS1-400-125 2 $48.00 $96.00 $48.02 $96.04

Clmp 04"x08" FS1-514-75 2 $33.65 $67.30 $34.91 $69.82

Clmp 04"x12" FS1-514-125 20 $51.50 $1,030.00 $55.88 $1,117.60

Clmp 04"x20" FS1-514-20 25 $86.25 $2,156.25 $98.67 $2,466.75

Clmp 06"x08" FS1-724-75 5 $39.26 $196.30 $42.01 $210.05

Clmp 06"x08"x01" FS1-724-75-CC4 2 $53.55 $107.10 $61.44 $122.88

Clmp 06"x12" FS1-724-125 75 $62.55 $4,691.25 $122.33 $9,174.75

Clmp 06"x20" FS1-724-20 75 $107.99 $8,099.25 $141.70 $10,627.50

Clmp 06"x20"x3/4" FS1-724-20-CC3 20 $122.14 $2,442.80 $141.76 $2,835.20

Clmp 08"x12" FS1-929-125 75 $72.85 $5,463.75 $78.97 $5,922.75

Clmp 08"x20" FS1-929-20 75 $121.34 $9,100.50 $132.18 $9,913.50

Clmp 10"x12" FS1-1144-125 2 $94.49 $188.98 $106.53 $213.06

Clmp 10"x12"x3/4" FS1-1144-125-CC3 2 $108.92 $217.84 $125.96 $251.92

Clmp 10"x20" FS1-1144-20 2 $149.95 $299.90 $163.70 $327.40

Clmp 12"x12" FS1-1350-125 15 $112.68 $1,690.20 $123.38 $1,850.70

Clmp 12"x20" FS1-1350-20 15 $128.17 $1,922.55 $194.37 $2,915.55

Clmp 16"x12" FS2-1790-125 1 $251.21 $251.21 $208.88 $208.88

Clmp 16"x20" FS2-1790-20 1 $363.11 $363.11 $302.82 $302.82

Clmp 30"x30" Clamp, Repair, FS3-3200-30 1 $972.96 $972.96 $1,242.63 $1,242.63

Hyd Bonnet Rpr Kit K Hydrant Bonnnet Repair Kit Kennedy 1 $28.15 $28.15 $619.51 $619.51

Hyd Drain Vlv K K8456 Drain Valve F/5-1/4VO 1 $264.84 $264.84 $165.21 $165.21

Hyd Mn Vlv Rpr Kit K Hydrant Main Valve Repair Kit Kennedy 1 $268.74 $268.74 $300.91 $300.91

Hyd Riser Kit 06" K Hydrant Riser Kit Size6 Kennedy 1 $181.89 $181.89 $322.15 $322.15

Hyd Riser Kit 12" K Hydrant Riser Kit Size12 Kennedy 1 $207.66 $207.66 $385.99 $385.99

Hyd Shoe Rpr Kit K Hydrant Shoe Repair Kit Kennedy Size5.25 VO 1 $105.16 $105.16 $259.61 $259.61

Hyd Trf Rpr Kit K Hydrant Collision Repair Kit Kennedy 10 $93.47 $934.70 $149.53 $1,495.30

Hyd Upper Barrel K Hydrant Upper Barrell Kennedy 1 $975.00 $975.00 $642.52 $642.52

Hyd Upper Oper Rod K Hydrant K8114 Upper Stem F/K81 1 $96.59 $96.59 $131.58 $131.58

Hyd Riser Kit 06" M Hydrant Riser Kit Size6 Mueller 1 $233.43 $233.43 $246.40 $246.40

Hyd Riser Kit 12" M Hydrant Riser Kit Size12 Mueller 1 $275.87 $275.87 $291.20 $291.20

Hyd Riser Kit 24" M Hydrant Riser Kit Size24 Mueller 1 $353.68 $353.68 $373.33 $373.33

Hyd Trf Rpr Kit M Hydrant Traffic Repair Kit Mueller 10 $98.24 $982.40 $103.60 $1,036.00

Hyd Riser Kit 06" W Hydrant Riser Kit Size6 Waterous 1 $213.65 $213.65 $218.40 $218.40

Hyd Riser Kit 12" W Hydrant Riser Kit Size12 Waterous 1 $250.17 $250.17 $255.73 $255.73

Hyd Riser Kit 24" W Hydrant Riser Kit Size24 Waterous 1 $323.22 $323.22 $330.40 $330.40

Hyd Trf Rpr Kit W Hydrant Traffic Repair Kit Waterous 10 $88.48 $884.80 $90.44 $904.40

Fire Hyd 4 K Kennedy Hydrant 4ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1 $1,361.21 $1,361.21 $1,361.22 $1,361.22
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Fire Hyd 5 K Kennedy Hydrant 5ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1 $1,424.45 $1,424.45 $1,424.46 $1,424.46

Fire Hyd 6 K Kennedy Hydrant 6ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1 $1,484.69 $1,484.69 $1,487.70 $1,487.70

Bnd 02" 45 HxH SCH80 2 PVC 45 Bend (glue) 20 $4.20 $84.00 $7.05 $141.00

Bnd 02" 90 HxH SCH80 2 PVC 90 Bend (glue) 10 $2.00 $20.00 $2.65 $26.50

Bnd 02" 90 MIP Galv 2 Galvanized 90 Bend Male Iron Pipe 5 $4.15 $20.75 $10.33 $51.65

Bnd 02" HXH 45 SCH40 2 PVC Sch40 45 HxH 20 $1.10 $22.00 $1.05 $21.00

Adpt 02" S80 FIPxH 2 Adapter Female Iron PipexH (glue) 25 $6.30 $157.50 $9.55 $238.75

Adpt 02" S80 MIPTXH 2 PVC S80 Male Adpt MIPTxH 25 $5.00 $125.00 $7.28 $182.00

T 02" Sch40 Tee, 2 S40 PVC HxH 1 $1.50 $1.50 $1.12 $1.12

T 03"x03" Sch40 Tee, 3x3 S40 PVC HxH 1 $4.95 $4.95 $4.80 $4.80

Bnd 03" HXH 45 Sch40 Bend, 3 PVC S40 45 HxH 1 $5.00 $5.00 $4.52 $4.52

Bnd 03" HXH 90 Sch40 Bend, 3 PVC S40 90 HxH 1 $3.85 $3.85 $3.36 $3.36

Coup 03" Comp PVC 3 IPS 110-30 10 $22.00 $220.00 $20.99 $209.90

Coup 04" Comp PVC 4 IPS 110-4 10 $35.75 $357.50 $33.20 $332.00

Coup 06" SCH40 HxH 6 SCH40 Coupler HxH 50 $8.05 $402.50 $8.29 $414.50

Bnd 04" 90 flgxflg 4 FlangexFlange 90 Bend 1 $47.81 $47.81 $46.59 $46.59

Bnd 04" MJ 11 1/4 DIP Bend, 11 1/4, MJxMJ Size4 2 $24.43 $48.86 $23.81 $47.62

Bnd 04" MJ 22 1/2 DIP Bend 22 1/2, MJxMJ Size4 2 $26.18 $52.36 $25.50 $51.00

Bnd 04" MJ 45 DIP Bend, 45, MJxMJ Size4 2 $27.57 $55.14 $26.87 $53.74

Bnd 04" MJ 90 DIP Bend, 90, MJxMJ Size4 2 $33.50 $67.00 $32.65 $65.30

Bnd 06" MJ 11 1/4 DIP Bend, 11 1/4 MJxMJ Size6 2 $42.23 $84.46 $41.15 $82.30

Bnd 06" MJ 22 1/2 DIP Bend, 22 1/2, MJxMJ Size6 5 $40.83 $204.15 $39.79 $198.95

Bnd 06" MJ 45 DIP Bend, 45, MJxMJ Size6 5 $44.67 $223.35 $43.53 $217.65

Bnd 06" MJ 90 DIP Bend, 90, MJxMJ Size6 2 $54.79 $109.58 $53.39 $106.78

Bnd 08" MJ 11 1/4 DIP Bend, 11 1/4, MJxMJ Size8 5 $56.99 $284.95 $56.12 $280.60

Bnd 08" MJ 22 1/2 DIP Bend, 22 1/2, MJxMJ Size8 5 $62.52 $312.60 $61.55 $307.75

Bnd 08" MJ 45 DIP Bend, 45, MJxMJ Size8 5 $63.90 $319.50 $62.91 $314.55

Bnd 08" MJ 90 DIP Bend, 90, MJxMJ Size8 2 $79.09 $158.18 $77.88 $155.76

Bnd 10" Flg 11 1/4 DIP Bend, 10 Flg 11-1/4 (I) Di C110 1 $89.79 $89.79 $88.42 $88.42

Bnd 10" MJ 22 1/2 DIP Bend, 22 1/2, MJxMJ Size10 1 $92.22 $92.22 $90.80 $90.80

Bnd 10" MJ 90 DIP Bend, 90, MJxMJ Size10 1 $125.02 $125.02 $123.12 $123.12

Bnd 12" MJ 11 1/4 DIP Bend, 11 1/4, MJxMJ Size12 1 $112.25 $112.25 $110.53 $110.53

Bnd 12" MJ 22 1/2 DIP Bend, 22 1/2, MJxMJ Size12 1 $121.23 $121.23 $119.37 $119.37

Bnd 12" MJ 45 DIP Bend, 45, MJxMJ Size12 1 $138.84 $138.84 $136.72 $136.72

Bnd 12" MJ 90 DIP Bend, 90, MJxMJ Size12 1 $167.85 $167.85 $165.28 $165.28

Bnd 16" MJ 22 1/2 DIP Bend, 22 1/2, MJxMJ Size16 1 $255.36 $255.36 $254.05 $254.05

Cap 03" w 02" outlet DIP 3 MJ Cap w/2 Outlet 1 $21.99 $21.99 $21.42 $21.42

Cap 04" DIP Cap, Size4 2 $13.00 $26.00 $12.58 $25.16

Cap 04" w/02" outlet DIP 4x2 MJ Tapt Cap (I) CP DI 5 $23.39 $116.95 $22.79 $113.95

Cap 06" DIP Cap, Size6 2 $22.69 $45.38 $22.11 $44.22
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Cap 06" w/02" outlet MJ DIP 06 Cap w/02 Outlet MJ 5 $32.81 $164.05 $32.30 $161.50

Cap 08" MJ DIP 8 MJ Cap CP DI C153 2 $35.50 $71.00 $34.69 $69.38

Cap 08" w/02" outlet DIP Cap w/2 Outlet Size8 5 $45.25 $226.25 $44.55 $222.75

Cap 12" DIP Cap, 12 di 2 $66.31 $132.62 $65.29 $130.58

Cap 16" DIP Cap, 16 di 1 $135.72 $135.72 $134.34 $134.34

Cap 16" w/02" outlet DIP 16 Cap w/2 Outlet 1 $151.53 $151.53 $145.98 $145.98

Cap 20" DIP 20 MJ Cap (I) Cp Di 153 1 $211.89 $211.89 $209.16 $209.16

Coup 04" MJxflg 4 MJxflange Coupling 1 $33.85 $33.85 $32.98 $32.98

Coup 04"x12" Sw Anch 4x1 Swivel Anchor Coupling 1 $34.55 $34.55 $65.10 $65.10

Coup Anch 06" MJ 90 Anchor MJ 6 90 1 $86.15 $86.15 $85.36 $85.36

Coup Anch 06"x2' 6 Anchor Coupling Size2 5 $124.78 $623.90 $100.95 $504.75

Coup Anch 06"x3' 6 Anchor Coupling Size3 2 $159.64 $319.28 $149.40 $298.80

Coup Anch 06"x4' 6 Anchor Coupling Size4 2 $178.82 $357.64 $192.81 $385.62

Coup Anch 06"x5' 6 Anchor Coupling Size5 2 $217.00 $434.00 $234.70 $469.40

Coup 06"x12" sw Anch 6x1ft Swivel Anchor Coupling 1 $85.00 $85.00 $67.63 $67.63

Coup 08"x12" Sw Anch 8x1ft Swivel Anchor Coupling 1 $114.11 $114.11 $104.48 $104.48

Plug 04" MJ Plug, MJ Size4 2 $14.66 $29.32 $14.28 $28.56

Plug 04" w/02" Out Plug, MJ w/2 Outlet Size4 5 $24.35 $121.75 $24.15 $120.75

Plug 06" MJ Plug, MJ Size6 2 $26.94 $53.88 $26.53 $53.06

Plug 06" w/02" Out Plug, w/2 Outlet Size6 5 $36.89 $184.45 $36.39 $181.95

Plug 08" MJ Plug, MJ Size8 2 $41.10 $82.20 $40.47 $80.94

Plug 08" w/02" Out Plug w/2 inch Outlet Size8 5 $50.59 $252.95 $50.34 $251.70

Plug 10" MJ Plug, MJ Size10 2 $69.42 $138.84 $68.36 $136.72

Plug 12" MJ Plug, MJ Size12 2 $71.49 $142.98 $70.40 $140.80

Plug 12" w/02" Out Plug, MJx2 ip Size12 5 $80.65 $403.25 $80.26 $401.30

Plug 16" MJ Plug MJ Size16 2 $181.66 $363.32 $178.89 $357.78

Plug 16" w/02" Out Plug MJ w/ 2 Outlet Size16 2 $195.88 $391.76 $195.87 $391.74

Plug 20" MJ Plug MJ Size20 1 $287.14 $287.14 $285.69 $285.69

Plug 20" w/ 02" Out 20x2 MJ Tapt Plug (I) Cp Di C153 1 $307.32 $307.32 $305.75 $305.75

Reducer 06"x04" Reducer FL Size6x4 1 $50.95 $50.95 $49.65 $49.65

Reducer 08"x06" MJ Reducer MJ 8x6 1 $45.94 $45.94 $45.23 $45.23

Reducer 10"x6" Reducer 10x6 1 $58.71 $58.71 $57.82 $57.82

Reducer 10"x8" Reducer 10x8 1 $64.24 $64.24 $63.26 $63.26

Reducer 12"x8" Reducer 12x8 1 $79.43 $79.43 $75.89 $75.89

Solid Slv 04" Long Solid Sleeve, Long Size4 1 $28.75 $28.75 $28.23 $28.23

Solid Slv 04" Short Solid Sleeve, Short Size4 1 $24.64 $24.64 $20.06 $20.06

Solid Slv 06" Long Solid Sleeve, Long Size6 1 $50.30 $50.30 $49.99 $49.99

Solid Slv 06" PVC Solid Sleeve, PVC Size6 1 $50.30 $50.30 $49.99 $49.99

Solid Slv 06" Short Solid Sleeve, Short Size6 1 $36.15 $36.15 $35.71 $35.71

Solid Slv 08" Long Solid Sleeve, Long Size8 1 $80.10 $80.10 $76.55 $76.55
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Solid Slv 08" Short Solid Sleeve, Short Size8 1 $47.65 $47.65 $45.54 $45.54

Solid Slv 10" Solid Sleeve Size10 1 $94.98 $94.98 $93.53 $93.53

Solid Slv 10" Short Solid Sleeve, Short Size10 1 $82.00 $82.00 $81.96 $81.96

Solid Slv 12" Long Solid Sleeve, Long Size12 1 $126.83 $126.83 $126.18 $126.18

Solid Slv 16" Solid Sleeve Size16 1 $242.70 $242.70 $214.69 $214.69

Solid Slv 16" Long Solid Sleeve, Long Size16 1 $215.70 $215.70 $241.47 $241.47

Solid Slv 20" MJ 20 MJ L/P Sleeve (I) Cp Di C153 1 $366.97 $366.97 $366.97 $366.97

4 Way 10x10x8x8 10x8 MJ Cross (I) Cp Di C153 1 $181.10 $181.10 $179.23 $179.23

T 04"x04"x04" Tee, MJ Size4 1 $44.50 $44.50 $43.88 $43.88

T 04"x04"x04" Flg Tee, 04x04x04 Flange 1 $86.34 $86.34 $85.03 $85.03

T 06"X06"x04" Tee, MJ di Size6x4 1 $71.75 $71.75 $69.29 $69.29

T 06"x06"x06" Tee, MJ Size6x6x6 1 $77.50 $77.50 $77.20 $77.20

T 08"x08"x06" Tee, MJ Size8x8x6 1 $96.70 $96.70 $96.25 $96.25

T 08"x08"x08" Tee, MJ Size8x8x8 1 $116.50 $116.50 $115.98 $115.98

T 10"x10"x06" Tee, 10x6 MJ (I) CP Di C153 1 $123.15 $123.15 $123.12 $123.12

T 10"x10"x06" Flg Tee, 10MJx10MJx6flg 1 $176.85 $176.85 $176.85 $176.85

T 10"x10"x08" MJ Tee, 10x10x8MJ 1 $144.20 $144.20 $144.20 $144.20

T 10x10x10 Tee, 10x10 MJ (I) CP DI C153 1 $164.60 $164.60 $164.61 $164.61

T 12"x12"x06" Tee, FL, di Size12x12x6 1 $307.25 $307.25 $308.81 $308.81

T 12"x12"x08" Tee, MJ, di Size12x12x8 1 $179.57 $179.57 $179.57 $179.57

Angle Valve 01" AV92-444W-NL 50 $35.00 $1,750.00 $34.34 $1,717.00

Angle Valve 01" comp AV 1 compression AV94-444WNL 10 $37.00 $370.00 $36.28 $362.80

Corp Stop 01" F600-4-NL 20 $31.55 $631.00 $31.67 $633.40

Corp Stop 01" Comp F1002-4-NL 10 $46.44 $464.40 $46.59 $465.90

Mtr Expan.01" EC-4-NL 50 $25.25 $1,262.50 $22.94 $1,147.00

Yoke Bar 01" Y504 50 $14.13 $706.50 $14.30 $715.00

Yoke L 01" L92-44D-NL 50 $24.10 $1,205.00 $23.62 $1,181.00

Bnd 01" Brass 90 L44-44NL 1 NL 90 Bend 10 $20.62 $206.20 $20.65 $206.50

Bnd 01" FL 90 L22-44NL 1 90 Bend 10 $20.31 $203.10 $20.39 $203.90

Coup 01" Comp C44-44-NL 5 $14.20 $71.00 $14.23 $71.15

Coup 01"x1/4" Comp Coupling 1x1/4 Compression Zinc Plated 2 $23.50 $47.00 $24.58 $49.16

Curb Stop 01" FL Curb Stop 1 Flare 1 $64.44 $64.44 $63.20 $63.20

Plug 01" Brass Plug, Brass Size1 5 $3.00 $15.00 $3.36 $16.80

Plug 01" CC Brass Plug, Brass, cc Size1 5 $9.20 $46.00 $7.87 $39.35

Bush 01"x3/4" Brass Bushing, Brass Size1 CCx3/4 CC 5 $10.45 $52.25 $8.86 $44.30

T 01" flx3/4" FL serv T222-334-NL 5 $25.70 $128.50 $25.77 $128.85

T 01"x01"x01" T222-444-NL 2 $36.06 $72.12 $36.18 $72.36

Coup 01" FLXFL Coupling 1 3 Part CFxCF NL 100 $20.05 $2,005.00 $20.09 $2,009.00

Coup 01" FLxMIP C28-44-NL 1 CFxMIP CPLG 5 $12.94 $64.70 $12.97 $64.85

Coup 01" Mtr Str Coupling, Meter, Straight Size1 2 $10.20 $20.40 $9.92 $19.84
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Coup 01" PtrBurg L PL-4-NL 10 $25.98 $259.80 $26.06 $260.60

Gasket 01" Copper Copper Gaskets for 1 Flare SLC-4 10 $1.35 $13.50 $1.25 $12.50

Corp Stop 2" IP Corp Stop 2 - IP Thread 50 $173.00 $8,650.00 $160.80 $8,040.00

Coup 2" Cmprs PJxMIP C84-77-NL 100 $47.61 $4,761.00 $48.31 $4,831.00

Custom Setter 02" VBH77-15B-11-77-NL 50 $701.34 $35,067.00 $708.50 $35,425.00

Valve Ang Ball 2" BFA13-777wNL 2 Ang Ball Meter Valve FIPxMF NL 2 $181.10 $362.20 $181.65 $363.30

Yoke L 02" Comp Yoke Ell 01 Compression L94-44DNL 1 $27.08 $27.08 $26.49 $26.49

Bnd 02" Comp 90 2 Compression 90 degree Bend L44-77NL 2 $133.85 $267.70 $134.26 $268.52

Plug 02" Brass 2 Brass SQ Head Cored Plug Low 5 $8.25 $41.25 $10.04 $50.20

Coup 02" Comp. C44-77NL 2 NL Coupling PJCTS 20 $64.14 $1,282.80 $64.31 $1,286.20

Coup 02" MIPxPJ C84-77NL 2 Coupling MIPxPJCTS 100 $47.60 $4,760.00 $48.30 $4,830.00

Reducer 02"x3/4" Bra 2x3/4 Brass Bell Reducer NL 1 $29.00 $29.00 $24.05 $24.05

Angle Valve 3/4" AV92-323W-NL 300 $22.20 $6,660.00 $22.30 $6,690.00

Angle Valve 3/4" Comp AV92-323W-NL 5/8x3/4 Ang Mtr Vlv w/ LW CFxMtr NL 20 $23.42 $468.40 $22.94 $458.80

Corp Stop 3/4" F600-3-NL 300 $20.39 $6,117.00 $20.70 $6,210.00

Mtr Expan. 3/4" EC-23-NL 300 $13.61 $4,083.00 $13.63 $4,089.00

Yoke Bar 3/4" Str Y503 50 $8.93 $446.50 $9.02 $451.00

Yoke Bar 3/4"" Y502 300 $7.66 $2,298.00 $7.90 $2,370.00

Yoke L 3/4" L92-23D-NL 300 $16.47 $4,941.00 $16.52 $4,956.00

Yoke L 3/4" Comp L94-23D-NL 5/8x3/4 90 Mtrxcf w/dr NL 25 $18.40 $460.00 $18.02 $450.50

Bnd 3/4" Comp 90 3/4 PJCTS 90 Bend Brass - L44-33NL 10 $16.03 $160.30 $16.08 $160.80

Bnd 3/4" FL 90 L22-33NL 3/4 90 Bend 10 $12.20 $122.00 $12.22 $122.20

Bnd 3/4" FCTXCF 90 L02-33NL 3/4 90  Bend FCTxCF 10 $13.49 $134.90 $13.50 $135.00

Bush 3/4"FIPx01"MIP Bushing, Brass Size3/4 FIPx1 mip 1 $3.15 $3.15 $3.53 $3.53

Bush Incrsr 3/4"x01" Bushing, Increaser Size3/4x1 fl 1 $15.00 $15.00 $12.35 $12.35

Corp Stop 3/4" Comp F100-3-NL 20 $27.52 $550.40 $22.29 $445.80

Corp Stop 3/4" IP F700-3-NL 5 $20.68 $103.40 $20.72 $103.60

Coup 3/4"x01" Comp C44-34NL 3/4x1 PJCTS Coupling NL 5 $14.42 $72.10 $14.45 $72.25

Coup 3/4"x01" FL C22-34-NL 3/4x1 (3 part) cfxcf cplg NL 5 $16.96 $84.80 $17.00 $85.00

Curb stop 3/4 Curb Stop Size3/4 1 $45.62 $45.62 $45.74 $45.74

Plug 3/4" Brass 3/4 Brass SQ Head Cored Plug 5 $2.15 $10.75 $2.56 $12.80

Plug 3/4" Brass IP Plug, Brass, IP Size3/4 5 $2.75 $13.75 $2.56 $12.80

T 3/4" fl T222-333-NL 5 $21.44 $107.20 $21.54 $107.70

T 3/4"x01" Comp T444-334NL 5 $31.98 $159.90 $32.09 $160.45

T 3/4"x3/4"x01" FL T222-333-NL 5 $30.00 $150.00 $21.54 $107.70

T 3/4"x3/4"x3/4" Ser U23-33-NL 5 $30.05 $150.25 $75.12 $375.60

T 3/4"x3/4"x3/4"comp T444-333-NL 5 $30.05 $150.25 $30.12 $150.60

Coup 3/4 FLxFL C-22-33-NL 3/4 Copper FlarexCopper Flare 100 $11.43 $1,143.00 $11.47 $1,147.00

Coup 3/4" Comp C44-33-NL 3/4 NL Coupling PJ CTS 100 $12.41 $1,241.00 $12.43 $1,243.00

Coup 3/4" CompxFL C24-33-NL 10 $17.08 $170.80 $17.12 $171.20
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Coup 3/4" CompxMIP C84-33-NL 3/4 MIPxPJ NL 10 $10.20 $102.00 $10.21 $102.10

Coup 3/4" FLxMIP Coupling 3/4 CFxMIP Compression Fitting Male Iron Pipe 10 $9.06 $90.60 $9.08 $90.80

Coup 3/4" PtrBurg L PL-3-NL 10 $18.21 $182.10 $10.61 $106.10

Coup 3/4"x01" COMP C44-34-NL 5 $15.00 $75.00 $14.45 $72.25

Gasket 3/4" Copper Copper Gaskets for 3/4 Flare SLC-3 10 $0.95 $9.50 $0.88 $8.80

Gasket 3/4" Rubber Rubber Gasket 3/4 GT-172 20 $0.21 $4.20 $0.80 $16.00

Nipple 01"x04" Nipple, Brass 1x4 20 $4.75 $95.00 $5.77 $115.40

Nipple 02"x04" Brass Nipple, Brass 2x4 10 $10.20 $102.00 $13.04 $130.40

Nipple 02"x06" Brass Nipple, Brass Size2x6 20 $15.00 $300.00 $19.25 $385.00

Nipple 02"x12" Brass Nipple, Brass Size2x12 10 $29.75 $297.50 $37.93 $379.30

Nipple 1/2"x02" Brass Nipple, Brass 1/2x2 NL 1 $1.75 $1.75 $1.71 $1.71

Nipple 3/4"x02" Brass Nipple, Brass 3/4x2 NL 1 $2.09 $2.09 $2.28 $2.28

Nipple 3/4"xCL Brass Nipple, Brass 3/4 CL 1 $1.55 $1.55 $1.81 $1.81

Coup 02" Hymax 860-56-0054-16 2 Hymax 10 $76.45 $764.50 $76.85 $768.50

Coup 03" Hymax 2000-0433-260 3 Hymax 10 $100.89 $1,008.90 $101.39 $1,013.90

Coup 04" Hymax 860-56-0108-16C 4 Hymax 40 $129.00 $5,160.00 $129.90 $5,196.00

Coup 06" Hymax 860-56-0163-16 6 Hymax 50 $171.00 $8,550.00 $171.99 $8,599.50

Coup 08" Hymax 860-56-0217-16 8 Hymax 50 $193.00 $9,650.00 $194.24 $9,712.00

Coup 10" Hymax 2000-1200-260 10 Hymax 2 $248.00 $496.00 $249.90 $499.80

Coup 12" Hymax 860-56-0315-16 12 Hymax 10 $293.00 $2,930.00 $294.95 $2,949.50

Coup 16" Hymax 200-1920-260 16 Hymax 2 $786.00 $1,572.00 $792.40 $1,584.80

Gasket 04" MJ MJ 4 Gasket 5 $1.71 $8.55 $1.76 $8.80

Gasket 06" MJ MJ 6 Gasket 5 $1.71 $8.55 $1.76 $8.80

Gasket 08" MJ MJ 8 Gasket 5 $2.18 $10.90 $2.10 $10.50

Gasket 10" MJ MJ 10 Gasket 2 $2.91 $5.82 $2.82 $5.64

Gasket 12" MJ MJ 12 Gasket 5 $3.64 $18.20 $3.53 $17.65

Gasket 12"x1/8" Flg 12x1/8 Flg FF RR Gasket 5 $6.52 $32.60 $6.60 $33.00

Gland 04" MJ Gland, MJ Size4 2 $4.00 $8.00 $10.43 $20.86

Gland 04" Split MJ Gland, Split, MJ Size4 10 $4.00 $40.00 $7.65 $76.50

Gland 06" MJ Gland, MJ Size6 2 $4.80 $9.60 $11.13 $22.26

Gland 06" Split MJ Gland, Split, MJ Size6 10 $5.00 $50.00 $9.74 $97.40

Gland 08" MJ Gland, MJ Size8 2 $6.00 $12.00 $13.91 $27.82

Gland 08" Split MJ Gland, Split, MJ Size8 10 $6.00 $60.00 $11.82 $118.20

Gland 10" MJ Gland, MJ Size10 1 $9.60 $9.60 $20.17 $20.17

Gland 10" Split 10 3010S Split Stargrip w/acc f/DIP 1 $9.85 $9.85 $84.66 $84.66

Gland 12" Gland, MJ Size12 2 $10.00 $20.00 $20.86 $41.72

Gland 12" Split Gland 12 Split 2 $10.50 $21.00 $19.47 $38.94

Gland 16" MJ Gland, MJ Size16 2 $16.40 $32.80 $38.25 $76.50

Gland Pack 02" MJ 02 MJ Gland Pack 2 $9.75 $19.50 $24.04 $48.08

Gland Pack 03" MJ 03 MJ Gland Pack 2 $11.00 $22.00 $21.56 $43.12
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Gland Pack 04" 4 Gland Packs Size4 10 $14.05 $140.50 $25.04 $250.40

Gland Pack 06" Gland Packs Size6 20 $21.00 $420.00 $31.29 $625.80

Gland Pack 08" 8 Gland Packs Size8 20 $21.05 $421.00 $34.77 $695.40

Gland Pack 10" 10 MJ Regular Acc Set 2 $29.50 $59.00 $47.98 $95.96

Gland Pack 12" 12 MJ Regular Acc Set 10 $31.15 $311.50 $50.07 $500.70

Mega Lug 03" 3 Mega Lug 10 $16.01 $160.10 $13.58 $135.80

Mega Lug 04" Gland, Retaining/Mega Lug Size4 10 $17.06 $170.60 $14.39 $143.90

Mega Lug 04" PVC 4 PVC 4004 Stargrip Restr Gland Only 20 $20.95 $419.00 $17.79 $355.80

Mega Lug 04" Split Gland, Split Mega Lug Size4 5 $37.31 $186.55 $30.22 $151.10

Mega Lug 06" Gland, Retaining/Mega Lug Size6 10 $20.08 $200.80 $17.79 $177.90

Mega Lug 06" PVC 6 Camlock PVC Mega Lug 20 $25.39 $507.80 $21.62 $432.40

Mega Lug 06" Split Gland, Split Mega Lug Size6 5 $52.84 $264.20 $40.81 $204.05

Mega Lug 08" Gland, Retaining/Mega Lug Size8 10 $30.65 $306.50 $26.10 $261.00

Mega Lug 08" PVC Mega Lug 08 /PVC 20 $37.57 $751.40 $33.74 $674.80

Mega Lug 08" Split Gland, Split Mega Lug Size8 5 $64.99 $324.95 $49.96 $249.80

Mega Lug 10" Gland, Retaining/Mega Lug Size10 2 $45.35 $90.70 $39.65 $79.30

Mega Lug 12" Gland, Retaining/Mega Lug Size12 5 $65.98 $329.90 $56.38 $281.90

Mega Lug 12" PVC Mega Lug 12 /PVC 10 $74.64 $746.40 $63.96 $639.60

Mega Lug 12" Split Gland, Split Mega Lug Size12 2 $134.81 $269.62 $115.47 $230.94

Mega Lug 16" Gland, Retaining/Mega Lug Size16 1 $120.33 $120.33 $105.45 $105.45

Mega Lug 16" Split Gland, Split Mega Lug Size16 1 $332.89 $332.89 $274.87 $274.87

Mega Lug 20" 20 EBAA Mega Lug MJ Di 1120 Rst F/Di Pipe, Black 1 $211.38 $211.38 $181.02 $181.02

MW Adpt 24"x18" C&B 24x18 Adapter Ring W2424 10 $23.75 $237.50 $22.33 $223.30

MW Lid 18" 2210 2210 MP Lid Only (IMP) 300 $9.00 $2,700.00 $8.10 $2,430.00

MW Ring 18" 2210 2210 18 IMP Ring Only SIP 300 $11.75 $3,525.00 $11.14 $3,342.00

MW Ring & Lid 36" MC-36 36 Monitor Cover w/Locking Lid 75 $400.00 $30,000.00 $434.20 $32,565.00

MW Ring Adpt 18"x24" Ring MW Adptr 18x24 5 $23.75 $118.75 $22.33 $111.65

MW Ring Adpt 18"x36" Ring MW Adptr 18x36 5 $73.68 $368.40 $71.06 $355.30

Acc. Kit 02" SS Flg FLG PACKx2 150# 304 RRFF 1/8 2 $5.00 $10.00 $6.84 $13.68

Acc. Kit 03" SS Flg 3 SS FGL Acc Kit-Steel for 3 meter 2 $5.05 $10.10 $7.07 $14.14

Acc. Kit 04" SS Flg 4 Flg Accessories 2 $11.00 $22.00 $12.83 $25.66

Acc. Kit 08" SS Flg 8 Flg Accessories 2 $19.00 $38.00 $23.33 $46.66

Mtr Adpt 03" Flg 912-90039603-000 3 Flg Adpt 10 $82.26 $822.60 $100.56 $1,005.60

Mtr Adpt 04" Flg 912-90048604-000 4 Flg Adpt 15 $102.17 $1,532.55 $102.88 $1,543.20

Mtr Adpt 06" Flg 912-90069606-000 6 Flg Adpt 1 $129.80 $129.80 $139.09 $139.09

Mtr Adpt 08" Flg 912-90091108-000 8 Flg Adpt 1 $178.17 $178.17 $186.25 $186.25

Mtr Ext 12" VBH-72-15W-11-33-NL 1 $130.00 $130.00 $99.41 $99.41

Pipe 04" C900 Pipe, Water C900 Size4 (10') 500 $2.06 $1,030.00 $3.05 $1,525.00

Pipe 06" C900 Pipe, Water C900 Size6 (20') 500 $3.97 $1,985.00 $5.85 $2,925.00

Pipe 08" C900 Pipe, Water C900 Size8 (20') 500 $6.74 $3,370.00 $10.05 $5,025.00
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Pipe 10" C900 Pipe, Water C900 Size10 (20') 40 $10.60 $424.00 $15.30 $612.00

Pipe 12" C900 Pipe, Water C900 Size12 (20') 500 $14.99 $7,495.00 $21.60 $10,800.00

Pipe 16" C900 Pipe, Water C900 Size16 (20') 20 $27.28 $545.60 $38.97 $779.40

Pipe 01" Copper Copper Tubing Size1 200 $3.37 $674.00 $4.90 $980.00

Pipe 02" Copper Copper Tubing, Type K Size2 100 $8.46 $846.00 $13.15 $1,315.00

Pipe 1 1/2" Copper Copper Tubing, Type K Size1.5 20 $6.00 $120.00 $8.15 $163.00

Pipe 1 1/4" Copper Copper Tubing, Type K Size1.25 20 $5.95 $119.00 $6.25 $125.00

Pipe 3/4" Copper 3/4  Copper Tubing Type K Size.75 500 $2.61 $1,305.00 $4.00 $2,000.00

Pipe 01" Poly 1 Poly Pipe 50 $0.31 $15.50 $0.50 $25.00

Pipe 01" Sch40 Pipe, Water SCH40 Size1(10') 50 $0.30 $15.00 $0.39 $19.50

Pipe 02" Sch40 Pipe, Water SCH40 Size2 (10') 100 $0.60 $60.00 $0.82 $82.00

Pipe 03" Sch40 Pipe, Water SCH40 Size3 (10) 50 $1.19 $59.50 $1.70 $85.00

Pipe 04" Sch40 Pipe, Water SCH40 Size4 (10') 200 $1.45 $290.00 $2.40 $480.00

Pipe 06" Sch40 Pipe, Water SCH40 Size6 (10) 500 $2.61 $1,305.00 $4.50 $2,250.00

Pipe 08" Sch40 Pipe, Water SCH40 Size8 (10') 20 $4.64 $92.80 $6.65 $133.00

Pipe 1 1/2" Sch40 Pipe, Water 1.5 SCH40 (10') 10 $0.46 $4.60 $0.65 $6.50

Pipe 1 1/4" Sch40 Pipe, Water 1.25'  SCH40 (10') 10 $0.44 $4.40 $0.60 $6.00

Pipe 2" Poly 2x100' CTS PE Tubing 200 PSI 100 $1.00 $100.00 $1.75 $175.00

Pipe 3/4" Poly 3/4 Poly Pipe 100 $0.19 $19.00 $0.35 $35.00

Tap Sdl 02"x01" S70-204 2 $13.64 $27.28 $14.12 $28.24

Tap Sdl 02"x3/4" S90-203 5 $15.85 $79.25 $14.96 $74.80

Tap Sdl 03"x01" S70-304 2 $18.03 $36.06 $18.63 $37.26

Tap Sdl 03"x3/4" S70-303 5 $17.94 $89.70 $18.63 $93.15

Tap Sdl 04"x01" S90-404 2 $27.00 $54.00 $23.96 $47.92

Tap Sdl 04"x01"thinw S70-404 2 $21.11 $42.22 $21.92 $43.84

Tap Sdl 04"x3/4" S90-403 20 $22.90 $458.00 $23.95 $479.00

Tap Sdl 06"x01" S90-604 10 $31.30 $313.00 $32.71 $327.10

Tap Sdl 06"x01"thinw S70-604 5 $31.30 $156.50 $32.71 $163.55

Tap Sdl 06"x02" S90-607 5 $59.05 $295.25 $61.75 $308.75

Tap Sdl 06"x3/4" S90-603 100 $31.11 $3,111.00 $32.71 $3,271.00

Tap Sdl 06"x3/4"cc T S70-603 5 $31.20 $156.00 $32.71 $163.55

Tap Sdl 08"x01" S90-804 10 $43.60 $436.00 $45.81 $458.10

Tap Sdl 08"x3/4" S90-803 200 $43.55 $8,710.00 $45.80 $9,160.00

Tap Sdl 12"x3/4" S90-1203 25 $136.96 $3,424.00 $133.39 $3,334.75

Tap Sdl 12"x3/4" IP S91-1203 2 $127.61 $255.22 $133.39 $266.78

Vlv Ball 01" Brass 1 Brass Ball Valve 25 $12.10 $302.50 $54.53 $1,363.25

Vlv 02" MJxMJ Valve, MJxMJ Size2 5 $185.00 $925.00 $185.01 $925.05

Vlv 02" Thrd AFC Valve, 2 AFC 2502SS Thrd RW GV OL 20 $179.00 $3,580.00 $178.51 $3,570.20

Vlv 03" MJxMJ Valve, MJ Size3 5 $261.80 $1,309.00 $262.01 $1,310.05

Vlv 04" MJ Wheel Valve, MJ Wheel Size4 1 $290.25 $290.25 $292.51 $292.51
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Vlv 04" MJxFlg Valve, Gate MJxFlange Size4 1 $279.25 $279.25 $279.26 $279.26

Vlv 04" MJxMJ Valve, Gate MJxMJ Size4 5 $292.75 $1,463.75 $292.51 $1,462.55

Vlv 06" MJxMJ Valve, Gate MJxMJ Size6 w/accessories 5 $373.50 $1,867.50 $435.52 $2,177.60

Vlv 08" MJxMJ Valve, Gate MJxMJ Size8 5 $594.75 $2,973.75 $594.51 $2,972.55

Vlv 10" MJxMJ Valve, Gate MJxMJ Size10 1 $927.25 $927.25 $927.01 $927.01

Vlv 12" AVK DI MJ GT 12 AVK #65 DI MJ GT Vlv 5 $1,173.25 $5,866.25 $1,173.01 $5,865.05

Vlv 12" Butterfly Valve, Butterfly Size12 MJ 5 $851.00 $4,255.00 $850.01 $4,250.05

Vlv 16" Butterfly Valve, Butterfly Size16 1 $1,452.00 $1,452.00 $1,450.01 $1,450.01

Vlv 01" Air Relief 01 ARI S-050 Water ARV 15 $122.00 $1,830.00 $144.00 $2,160.00

Vlv 3/4" Air Relief 3/4 ARI S-050 Water ARV 5 $122.00 $610.00 $144.00 $720.00

VB Lid 06" Mushroom 59L06W 6 Mushroom Lid 10 $8.00 $80.00 $7.60 $76.00

VB Lid 2194 2194 Valve Box Lid 100 $5.75 $575.00 $5.05 $505.00

VB Ring 2194 2194 Valve Box Ring 100 $8.09 $809.00 $7.85 $785.00

VB Ring 2195 2195 Valve Box Frame Only 100 $10.31 $1,031.00 $10.03 $1,003.00

VB Riser Rng 01" VB Riser Rngs Size1 50 $4.00 $200.00 $3.03 $151.50

VB Riser Rng 02" VB Riser Rngs Size2 100 $4.75 $475.00 $4.05 $405.00

VB Riser Rng 03" VB Riser Rngs Size3 100 $6.75 $675.00 $6.56 $656.00

VB Riser Rng 04" VB Riser Rngs Size4 50 $7.30 $365.00 $7.08 $354.00

VB Riser Rng 06" VB Riser Rngs Size6 50 $9.80 $490.00 $9.59 $479.50

VB Screw Type Riser 69 Tyler Screw Type Adj Riser 10 $18.23 $182.30 $17.66 $176.60

VB Throat Riser 69-A CI Adj Slip Vlv Box Throat Riser 50 $18.00 $900.00 $17.66 $883.00

Vlv Ext 01" Valve Ext. Size1 10 $32.25 $322.50 $35.79 $357.90

Vlv Ext 02" Valve Ext. Size2 20 $37.20 $744.00 $39.95 $799.00

Vlv Ext 03" Valve Ext. Size3 20 $40.50 $810.00 $42.10 $842.00

Vlv Ext 04" Valve Ext. Size4 20 $43.20 $864.00 $45.26 $905.20

Vlv Ext 05" Valve Ext. Size5 10 $47.15 $471.50 $49.47 $494.70

Vlv Ext 06" Valve Ext. Size6 10 $50.15 $501.50 $52.63 $526.30

Bnd 03" GXG 90 3 90° GXG Bend 1 $3.00 $3.00 $3.36 $3.36

Bnd 03" HXH 45 3 45° HXH Bend 1 $3.10 $3.10 $4.52 $4.52

Bnd 03" HXH 90 3 90° HXH Bend 1 $3.00 $3.00 $3.36 $3.36

Bnd 04" GXG 11-1/4 4 11-1/4 GXG  Bend 1 $17.00 $17.00 $14.81 $14.81

Bnd 04" GXG 22-1/2 4 22-1/2 GXG Bend 1 $12.80 $12.80 $13.72 $13.72

Bnd 04" GXG 45 4 45° Bend 1 $9.90 $9.90 $10.33 $10.33

Bnd 04" GXG 90 4 90° GXG Bend 1 $17.00 $17.00 $18.36 $18.36

Bnd 04" GXSP 22-1/2 4 22-1/2 GXStreet Bend 1 $12.15 $12.15 $13.13 $13.13

Bnd 04" GXSP 45 4 45 GXStreet Bend 1 $9.25 $9.25 $9.53 $9.53

Bnd 04" HXH 11-1/4 4 11-1/4 HXH Bend 1 $4.50 $4.50 $17.80 $17.80

Bnd 04" HXH 22-1/2 4 22-1/2  HXH Bend 1 $4.00 $4.00 $7.03 $7.03

Bnd 04" HXH 45 4 45° HXH Bend 1 $4.65 $4.65 $11.30 $11.30

Bnd 04" HXH 90 4 90° HXH Bend 1 $5.10 $5.10 $16.71 $16.71



401

402

403

404

405

406

407

408

409

410

411

412

413

414

415

416

417

418

419

420

421

422

423

424

425

426

427

428

429

430

431

432

433

434

435

436

437

438

439

440

A B F G H I J

Bnd 06" GXG 11-1/4 6 11-1/4 GXG Bend 1 $30.00 $30.00 $26.90 $26.90

Bnd 06" GXG 22 1/2 6 22 1/2 GXG Bend 1 $23.50 $23.50 $13.72 $13.72

Bnd 06" GXG 45 6 45° GXG Bend 1 $17.50 $17.50 $18.97 $18.97

Bnd 06" GXG 90 6 90° GXG Bend 1 $18.45 $18.45 $20.41 $20.41

Bnd 06" HXH 11-1/2 6 11-1/4 HXH Bend 1 $34.00 $34.00 $22.66 $22.66

Bnd 06" HXH 22-1/2 6 22-1/2 HXH Bend 1 $17.00 $17.00 $17.58 $17.58

Bnd 08" GXG 11-1/4 8 11-1/4 GXG Bend 1 $85.00 $85.00 $49.45 $49.45

Bnd 08" GXG 22-1/2 8 22-1/2 GXG Bend 1 $41.50 $41.50 $45.92 $45.92

Bnd 08" GXG 45 8 45° GXG Bend 1 $42.50 $42.50 $47.15 $47.15

Bnd 08" GXG 90 8 90° GXG Bend 1 $82.00 $82.00 $85.69 $85.69

Bnd 08" HXH 11-1/4 8 11-1/4 HXH Bend 1 $65.00 $65.00 $48.91 $48.91

Bnd 08" HXH 22-1/2 8 22-1/2 HXH Bend 1 $48.00 $48.00 $47.95 $47.95

Cap 03" 3 GXG Cap 1 $2.15 $2.15 $2.00 $2.00

Plug 08" Gripper 08 Gripper Plug 6 $26.00 $156.00 $26.15 $156.90

Cap 03" 3 GXG Cap 1 $2.15 $2.15 $2.00 $2.00

Coup 04" CXP Fernco 4 CXP Strongback Coupling 12 $12.50 $150.00 $22.63 $271.56

Coup 04" PXP Fernco 4 PXP Strongback Coupling 12 $8.50 $102.00 $15.44 $185.28

Coup 06" CXP Fernco 6 CXP Strongback Coupling 8 $26.00 $208.00 $38.37 $306.96

Coup 06" PXP Fernco 6 PXP Strongback Coupling 8 $17.00 $136.00 $29.41 $235.28

Coup 08" CXP Fernco 8 CXP Strongback Coupling 20 $24.25 $485.00 $43.64 $872.80

Coup 08" PXP Fernco 8 PXP Strongback Coupling 20 $24.75 $495.00 $43.64 $872.80

Coup 10" CXP Fernco 10 CXP Strongback Coupling 2 $56.15 $112.30 $56.78 $113.56

Coup 10" PXP Fernco 10 PXP Strongback Coupling 2 $36.00 $72.00 $56.78 $113.56

Coup 12" CXP Fernco 12 CXP Strongback Coupling 6 $85.47 $512.82 $69.51 $417.06

Coup 12" PXP Fernco 12 PXP Strongback Coupling 6 $46.00 $276.00 $69.51 $417.06

Coup 15" CXP Fernco 15 CXP Strongback Coupling 2 $146.84 $293.68 $131.23 $262.46

Coup 15" PXP Fernco 15 PXP Strongback Coupling 2 $121.00 $242.00 $118.77 $237.54

Nipple 01"x03" SS 1x3 Nipple 10 $5.25 $52.50 $2.65 $26.50

Nipple 02"x03" SS 2x3 Nipple 10 $7.10 $71.00 $5.00 $50.00

Nipple 02"x04" SS 2x4 Nipple 10 $9.15 $91.50 $6.46 $64.60

Nipple 03"x03" SS 3x3 Nipple 10 $17.00 $170.00 $14.60 $146.00

Nipple 04"xCL SS 4x4 Nipple 10 $39.00 $390.00 $30.99 $309.90

Nipple 3/4"x 02" SS 3/4x 02 SS Nipple 10 $2.50 $25.00 $1.46 $14.60

Nipple 3/4"x 06 SS 3/4x6 SS Nipple 10 $5.55 $55.50 $3.85 $38.50

Nipple 01"x03" SS 1x3 Nipple 10 $5.25 $52.50 $2.65 $26.50

Nipple 02"x06" SS 2x6 SS Nipple 10 $13.25 $132.50 $9.43 $94.30

Tee 06"x"06"x04" 6x6x4 Gasketed Tee 8 $28.00 $224.00 $31.08 $248.64

Tee 06"x06"x06" 6x6x6 Gasketed Tee 6 $30.00 $180.00 $33.43 $200.58

Tee 08"x08"x04" 8x8x4 Gasketed Tee 8 $37.50 $300.00 $42.14 $337.12

Tee 08"x08"x06" 8x8x6 Gasketed Tee 8 $43.00 $344.00 $64.93 $519.44
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Tee 08"x08"x08" 8x8x8 Gasketed Tee 8 $64.00 $512.00 $69.45 $555.60

Tee 10"x10"x04" 10x10x4 Gasketed Tee 8 $95.50 $764.00 $105.30 $842.40

Tee 10"x10"x06" 10x10x6 Gasketed Tee 8 $96.40 $771.20 $107.40 $859.20

Tee 12"x12"x04" 12x12x4 Gasketed Tee 8 $119.50 $956.00 $134.47 $1,075.76

Tee 12"x12"x06" 12x12x6 Gasketed Tee 8 $125.00 $1,000.00 $140.83 $1,126.64

Tee 06"x"06"x04" 6x6x4 Gasketed Tee 8 $28.00 $224.00 $31.08 $248.64

Wye 06"x06"x04" 6x6x4 Gasketed Wye 8 $27.50 $220.00 $30.99 $247.92

Wye 06"x06"x06" 6x6x6 Gasketed Wye 8 $34.45 $275.60 $38.01 $304.08

Wye 08"x08"x04" 8x8x4 Gasketed Wye 8 $38.50 $308.00 $42.98 $343.84

Wye 08"x08"x06" 8x8x6 Gasketed Wye 8 $65.50 $524.00 $49.33 $394.64

Wye 08"x08"x08" 8x8x8 Gasketed Wye 8 $77.50 $620.00 $86.43 $691.44

Wye 10"x10"x04" 10x10x4 Gasketed Wye 8 $97.25 $778.00 $108.76 $870.08

Wye 10"x10"x06" 10x10x06 Gasketed Wye 8 $99.00 $792.00 $110.52 $884.16

Wye 12"x12"x04" 12x12x4 Gasketed Wye 8 $132.75 $1,062.00 $148.60 $1,188.80

Wye 12"x12"x06" 12x12x6 Gasketed Wye 8 $134.25 $1,074.00 $150.53 $1,204.24

Wye 15"x15"x06" 15x15x06 Gasketed Wye 4 $225.95 $903.80 $254.20 $1,016.80

Wye 06"x06"x04" 6x6x4 Gasketed Wye 4 $27.50 $110.00 $30.99 $123.96

MH Ring 23.5" Stndrd 250-24A Import Manhole Ring Only 5 $85.00 $425.00 $66.25 $331.25

MH Riser Rng HDPE 1" 24R125 1-1/4 Ladtech Riser 50 $22.50 $1,125.00 $27.45 $1,372.50

MH Riser Rng HDPE 2" MH Riser Ring HDPE 24x2 50 $22.50 $1,125.00 $27.45 $1,372.50

MH Riser Rng HDPE 4" MH Riser Ring HDPE 24x4 50 $33.00 $1,650.00 $38.45 $1,922.50

MH Slp Riser HDPE 1" 24S150 1-1/2 Slope Ladtech 50 $22.50 $1,125.00 $27.45 $1,372.50

MH St. Riser 23.25x2 250-24Ax2 IMPT Manhole Riser 50 $30.00 $1,500.00 $28.03 $1,401.50

MH St. Riser 23.25x3 250-24Ax3 IMPT Manhole Riser 50 $43.00 $2,150.00 $42.30 $2,115.00

MH St. Riser 24"x2" 3101 2 Manhole Riser Import 25 $30.00 $750.00 $27.52 $688.00

MH St. Riser 24"x3" 300-24Ax3 Impt MH Riser 25 $47.50 $1,187.50 $46.13 $1,153.25

MH Ring 23.5" Stndrd 250-24A Import Manhole Ring Only 25 $85.00 $2,125.00 $66.25 $1,656.25

Pipe 04" 4 SDR26 Sewer Pipe 60 $0.90 $54.00 $1.35 $81.00

Pipe 06" 6 SDR26 Sewer Pipe 60 $1.82 $109.20 $2.80 $168.00

Pipe 08" 8 SDR26 Sewer Pipe 180 $3.26 $586.80 $5.00 $900.00

Pipe 10" 10 SDR26 Sewer Pipe 40 $4.92 $196.80 $7.80 $312.00

Pipe 12" 12 SDR26 Sewer Pipe 60 $7.31 $438.60 $11.75 $705.00

Pipe 15" 15 SDR26 Sewer Pipe 20 $11.05 $221.00 $16.90 $338.00

Red Water Plug Red Water Plug Hyd Cement 5 $26.00 $130.00 $27.00 $135.00

Blue Water Plug Blue Water Plug Hyd Cement 5 $26.00 $130.00 $27.00 $135.00

Trace-a-leak dye tabs Yellow-Green Dyetabs 5 $42.00 $210.00 $26.99 $134.95

Vlv 01" Ball 1 SS Threaded Ball Valve 5 $18.00 $90.00 $49.20 $246.00

Vlv 02" Air Rel GA 2 GA Sewer Air/Vac Valve 60448 3 $770.00 $2,310.00 $816.00 $2,448.00

Vlv 02" Air Relief 2 ARI Sewer Air/Vac Valve 3 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,249.00 $3,747.00

Vlv 02" Ball 2 SS Ball Valve 3 $44.00 $132.00 $148.71 $446.13
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Vlv 03" Air Rel Val-Mat 49A.2 Air Release Valve 3 $600.00 $1,800.00 $739.00 $2,217.00

Vlv 04" Air Rel Val-Mat 49A.3 Air Release Valve 3 $650.00 $1,950.00 $810.00 $2,430.00

Vlv 3/4" Ball SS 3/4 SS Ball Valve 3 $13.75 $41.25 $34.15 $102.45

Vlv 01" Ball SS 1 SS Threaded Ball Valve 5 $18.00 $90.00 $49.20 $246.00

Vlv 03" Ball SS 3 SS Stainless Steel Ball Valve 5 $119.00 $595.00 $424.99 $2,124.95

Vlv 3 threaded" D-023-250psi ARIThreaded Combo Valve All Threaded SS 3 $5,393.00 $16,179.00 $5,535.00 $16,605.00

Vlv 2" Nylon Body D-025  ARI 150 PSI Nylon Combo Air Valve 3 $1,011.00 $3,033.00 $1,249.00 $3,747.00

Vlv 3" nylon Body D-025 ARI 150 PSI Nylon Combo Air Valve 3 $1,278.00 $3,834.00 $1,450.00 $4,350.00

Vlv 4" nylon body D-025 ARI 150 PSI Nylon Combo Air Valve 3 $1,437.00 $4,311.00 $1,575.00 $4,725.00

Vlv 2" All SS D-025 ARI 150 PSI SS Combo Air Valve 3 $3,159.00 $9,477.00 $3,315.00 $9,945.00

Vlv 3" All SS D-025 ARI 150 PSI SS Combo Air Valve 3 $3,731.00 $11,193.00 $3,915.00 $11,745.00

Vlv 4" All SS D-025 ARI D-025 ARI 4 Valve 3 $4,139.00 $12,417.00 $4,321.05 $12,963.15

Vlv 6" D-026 ARI Combo Valve D-026 ARI 6 Valve 3 $10,189.00 $30,567.00 $10,299.00 $30,897.00

Vlv 8" D-026 ARI Combo Valve D-026 ARI 8 Valve 3 $14,165.00 $42,495.00 $14,499.00 $43,497.00

Hyd Ext Kit 06" AVK 6 AVK Hydrant Ext. Kit 1 $213.65 $213.65

Hyd Ext Kit 12" AVK 12 AVK Hydrant Ext. Kit 1 $250.17 $250.17

Hyd Ext Kit 24" AVK 24 AVK Hydrant Ext. Kit 1 $323.22 $323.22

Hyd Trf Rpr Kit AVK AVK Traffic Repair Kit 2700 3 $85.68 $257.04

Hyd Bonnet Rpr Kit M Hydrant Bonnnet Repair Kit Mueller 1 $34.95 $34.95

Hyd Ft Vlv Rpr Kit M Hydrant Foot Valve Kit Mueller 1 $325.00 $325.00

Hyd Upper Barrel M Hydrant Upper Barrel Mueller 1 $1,015.00 $1,015.00

Hyd Bonnet Rpr Kit W Hydrant Bonnnet Repair Kit Waterous 1 $88.48 $88.48

Hyd Ft Vlv Rpr Kit W Hydrant Foot Valve Repair Kit Waterous 1 $75.61 $75.61

Hyd Shoe Rpr Kit M Hydrant Shoe Repair Kit Mueller Size5.25 VO Before 1997 1 $83.65 $83.65

Mtr Box Ext 18"x24" Meter Box Ext. Size18x24 50 $44.62 $2,231.00

MW 18"x36" PVC Meter Well 18x36 PVC 300 $25.30 $7,590.00

MW 24"x36" PVC Meter Well 24x36 PVC 50 $43.50 $2,175.00

MW 36"x36" PVC Meter Well 36x36 PVC 75 $155.00 $11,625.00

MW Ext 18" Sltd Meter Well 18x22 Slanted Ext. 20 $30.00 $600.00

MW Ext 18"x03" Meter Box Ext. Size18x3 50 $26.44 $1,322.00

MW Ext 18"x06" Meter Box Ext. Size18x6 50 $29.02 $1,451.00

MW Ext 18"x12" Meter Box Ext. Size18x12 50 $36.98 $1,849.00

MW Ext 24"x12" Meter Box Ext. Size24x12 10 $64.53 $645.30

MW Ext 36"x03" Meter Box Ext. Size36x3 5 $59.15 $295.75

MW Ext 36"x04" 36 ADS N-12 Solid 36x4 Riser 5 $103.87 $519.35

MW Ring 24" 2209 24 Ring Only 50 $72.00 $3,600.00

MW Lid 24" 2209 24 Lid Only 50 $56.00 $2,800.00

Mtr Ext 06" Meter Ext. 6 1 $123.00 $123.00

Blk Concrete 4x8x16 Concrete Block 4x8x16 100 $1.14 $114.00

TOTAL - ITEMS BID ON BY BOTH SUPPLIERS = 487 $504,967.89
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Blk Concrete 8x8x16 Concrete Block 8x8x16 100 $1.55 $155.00

Bricks Concrete Concrete Bricks 200 $0.59 $118.00

ALOCK 12" 12 ALOK G3-1208 4 $30.00 $120.00

ALOCK 12" 12 ALOK G3-1208 4 $30.00 $120.00

Bnd 03" GXG 11-1/4 3 11-1/4 GXG Bend 1 $14.00 $14.00

Bnd 03" GXG 22-1/2 3 22-1/2 GXG Bend 1 $14.50 $14.50

Bnd 03" HXH 11-1/4 3 11-1/4 GXG Bend 1 $14.00 $14.00

Bnd 03" HXH 22-1/2 3 22-1/2 HXH Bend 1 $14.50 $14.50

Bnd 03" GXG 11-1/4 3 11-1/4 GXG Bend 1 $14.00 $14.00

Cap 04" Swr 4 GXG Cap 1 $9.00 $9.00

Cap 06" Swr 6 GXG Cap 8 $20.00 $160.00

Cap 08" 8 GXG Cap 8 $29.00 $232.00

Cap 10" 10 GXG Cap 1 $58.00 $58.00

Cap 12" 12 GXG Cap 2 $87.00 $174.00

Coup 03" CXP Fernco 3 CXP Strongback Coupling 2 $15.00 $30.00

Coup 03" CXP Fernco 3 CXP Strongback Coupling 1 $15.00 $15.00

MH Ring 24" Low Prof 24 Low Profile 3 MH ring 5 $222.69 $1,113.45

MH Ring 24" Standard LS101A Manhole Ring & Lid LS101B 5 $371.14 $1,855.70

MH Ring 24x4" Lo Pro 24 Low Profile 4 MH Ring 5 $222.69 $1,113.45

MH Ring Std. boltdo Slab Bolt Down Manhole Ring Size 5 $418.11 $2,090.55

MH St. Riser 23.25x1 1 Manhole Riser 23.25x1 Street Riser 50 $180.81 $9,040.50

MH St. Riser 24"x1" 1 Manhole Riser 24x1 Street Riser 25 $180.81 $4,520.25

Pipe Patch 08"x24" W 8x24 Pipe patch Kit 4 $460.00 $1,840.00

Pipe Patch 08"x48" W 8x48 Pipe Patch Kit 4 $665.00 $2,660.00

Pipe Patch 10"x24" W 10x24 Pipe Patch Kit 1 $533.00 $533.00

Pipe Patch 10"x48" W 10x48 Pipe Patch Kit 1 $733.00 $733.00

Pipe Patch 12"x24" W 12x24 Pipe Patch Kit 1 $665.00 $665.00

Pipe Patch 12"x48" W 12x48 Pipe Patch Kit 1 $800.00 $800.00

CCW-704 (Mastic) 30 oz Tube of Mastic 40 $13.50 $540.00

Expanding Foam Expanding Foam (Great Stuff) 40 $12.50 $500.00

Expanding Foam Clnr Expanding Foam Cleaner (Great Stuff) 20 $8.00 $160.00

Hyperflex 300 MIL SG-HF6 Hyperflex 300 MIL 6 PK 5 $140.00 $700.00

Proselect Self Leveling Proselect Sealant 5 $12.75 $63.75

Ram-nek 1" (Kent Sl) Kent Seal  (14.5 LF per Roll) 10 $6.00 $60.00

SealGuard II SealGuard II Reorder Kit 5 $355.00 $1,775.00

XSEAL SG-X -12 Sewer Seal 5 $255.00 $1,275.00

Vlv 3" D-23 NS ARI Combination Air Valve SS 3 $5,200.00 $15,600.00

Pipe 03" 3 SDR26 Sewer Pipe 40 $1.70 $68.00

TOTAL - ITEMS BID ON ONLY BY BLUE SPRINGS WINWATER = 62 $88,507.82 NO BID

TOTAL - ITEM BID ON BY ONLY SCHULTE SUPPLY = 1 NO BID $68.00
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Fire Hyd 4 AVK AVK Hydrant 4ft bur 6MJ Yellow 5

Fire Hyd 5 AVK AVK Hydrant 5ft bur 6MJ Yellow 5

Fire Hyd 6 AVK AVK Hydrant 6ft bur 6MJ Yellow 2

Fire Hyd 7 AVK 2780-12 AVK Hydrant 7 ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1

Fire Hyd 8 AVK 2780-14 AVk Hydrant 8 ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1

Fire Hyd 9  AVK 2780-16 AVK Hydrant 9 ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1

Fire Hyd 4 W Waterous Hydrant 4ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1

Fire Hyd 5 W Waterous Hydrant 4ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1

Fire Hyd 6 W Waterous Hydrant 4ft bur 6MJ Yellow 1

Mtr 01 1/2" 1-1/2” Omni R2, all wheel 100 gal w/100W Itron Ert 15

Mtr 01" 1” Sensus Meter in gals w/100W Itron Ert 20

Mtr 02" 2” Omni R2, all wheel 100 gal w/100W Itron Ert 25

Mtr 02" Cmpd 2” Omni C2 Turbo Lenght Compound Meter, all wheel 100 gal w/100W Itron Ert 5

Mtr 03" Cmpd 3” Omni C2 Compound Meter, 100 gal w/Itron Ert all wheel 100 gal w/100W Itron 5

Mtr 04" Cmpd 4” Omni C2 Compound Meter, 100 gal w/Itron Ert all wheel 100 gal w/100W Itron 5

Mtr 06" Turbine 6” Omni C2 Compound Meter, 100 gal w/Itron Ert all wheel 100 gal w/100W Itron 5

Mtr 3/4" Str Meter Water, (straight 3/4) Size0.75 20

Mtr 5/8"x3/4" 5/8”x¾” Sensus Meter in gals w/100 W Itron Ert 300

Based on the items bid by both companies (487 Items-Line 495)-Blue Springs Winwater pricing is 8% less than Schulte Supply pricing. 
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TOTAL - ITEMS NOT BID ON BY BOTH SUPPLIERS = 18 NO BID NO BID
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