
Bid 2024-050

Open date: January 19, 2024 @ 3:00 PM

ITEM DESCRIPTION EST QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

4.10 Concrete Curb Edging- New  12” H x 6” W 1-100 L.F. $16.95 $25.17 $38.00 $90.00

4.20 Concrete Curb Edging- New  12” H x 6” W 101-200 L.F. $16.95 $22.65 $37.00 $65.00

4.30 Concrete Curb Edging- New  12” H x 6” W 201-500 L.F. $15.08 $20.39 $36.00 $60.00

4.40 Concrete Curb Edging- New  12” H x 6” W 501-750 L.F. $14.19 $18.35 $34.00 $56.00

4.50 Concrete Curb Edging- New  12” H x 6” W 751-1000 L.F. $13.79 $16.51 $33.00 $56.00

4.60 Concrete Curb Edging- New  12” H x 6” W 1001-2000 L.F. $13.18 $14.86 $31.00 $56.00

4.70 Concrete Curb Edging- Replacement 12”Hx6”W 1-100 L.F. $30.40 $37.76 $41.00 $90.00

4.80 Concrete Curb Edging- Replacement 12”Hx6”W 101-200 L.F. $26.43 $33.98 $41.00 $75.00

4.90 Concrete Curb Edging- Replacement 12”Hx6”W 201-500 L.F. $22.94 $30.59 $41.00 $67.00

4.10 Concrete Curb Edging- Replacement 12”Hx6”W 501-750 L.F. $22.13 $27.53 $40.00 $65.00

4.11 Concrete Curb Edging- Replacement 12”Hx6”W 751-1000 L.F. $21.47 $24.77 $39.00 $65.00

4.12 Concrete Curb Edging- Replacement 12”Hx6”W 1001-2000 L.F. $21.18 $22.30 $38.00 $65.00

4.13 Concrete Curb Edging- New 6"x12"wide 1-100 L.F. $14.81 $25.17 $38.00 $100.00

4.14 Concrete Curb Edging- New 6"x12"wide 101-200 L.F. $14.19 $22.65 $37.00 $65.00

4.15 Concrete Curb Edging- New 6"x12"wide 201-500 L.F. $13.39 $20.39 $36.00 $60.00

4.16 Concrete Curb Edging- New 6"x12"wide 501-750 L.F. $13.11 $18.35 $34.00 $56.00

4.17 Concrete Curb Edging- New 6"x12"wide 751-1000 L.F. $12.72 $16.51 $33.00 $56.00

4.18 Concrete Curb Edging- New 6"x12"wide 1001-2000 L.F. $12.72 $14.86 $31.00 $56.00

4.19 Concrete Curb Edging- Replace 6"x12"wide 1-100 L.F. $29.40 $37.76 $41.00 $100.00

4.20 Concrete Curb Edging- Replace 6"x12"wide 101-200 L.F. $27.83 $33.98 $41.00 $75.00

4.21 Concrete Curb Edging- Replace 6"x12"wide 201-500 L.F. $26.33 $30.59 $40.00 $67.00

4.22 Concrete Curb Edging- Replace 6"x12"wide 501-750 L.F. $26.05 $27.53 $40.00 $65.00

4.23 Concrete Curb Edging- Replace 6"x12"wide 751-1000 L.F. $25.50 $24.77 $39.00 $65.00

4.24 Concrete Curb Edging- Replace 6"x12"wide 1001-2000 L.F. $24.83 $22.30 $37.00 $65.00

4.25 CG-1 Curbing - New 1-100 L.F. $35.11 $42.47 $41.00 $100.00

4.26 CG-1 Curbing - New 101-200 L.F. $28.56 $38.61 $41.00 $75.00

4.27 CG-1 Curbing - New 201-500 L.F. $27.37 $35.10 $40.00 $70.00

4.28 CG-1 Curbing - New 501-750 L.F. $26.01 $31.59 $40.00 $62.00

4.29 CG-1 Curbing - New 751-1000 L.F. $25.29 $28.43 $39.00 $62.00

4.30 CG-1 Curbing - New 1001-2000 L.F. $24.93 $25.59 $37.00 $62.00

Quality Custom Hotmer Excavation

SECTION 1: Concrete Curb Edging- New 12” H x 6” W

SECTION 2: Concrete Curb Edging- Replacement 12”Hx6”W

McConnell & AssociatesLegacy Underground

SECTION 5: CG-1 Curbing – New

SECTION 4: Concrete Curb Edging- Replace 6"x12"wide

SECTION 3: Concrete Curb Edging- New 6"x12"wide



4.31 CG-1 Replacement 1-100 L.F. $44.60 $63.70 $48.00 $100.00

4.32 CG-1 Replacement 101-200 L.F. $42.35 $57.33 $48.00 $90.00

4.33 CG-1 Replacement 201-500 L.F. $39.92 $51.60 $46.00 $80.00

4.34 CG-1 Replacement 501-750 L.F. $35.46 $46.44 $46.00 $75.00

4.35 CG-1 Replacement 751-1000 L.F. $34.23 $41.80 $44.00 $75.00

4.36 CG-1 Replacement 1001-2000 L.F. $31.65 $37.62 $41.00 $75.00

4.37 CG-2 Curbing - New 1-100 L.F. $34.91 $42.47 $41.00 $100.00

4.38 CG-2 Curbing - New 101-200 L.F. $28.73 $38.61 $41.00 $75.00

4.39 CG-2 Curbing - New 201-500 L.F. $27.80 $35.10 $40.00 $70.00

4.40 CG-2 Curbing - New 501-750 L.F. $27.20 $31.59 $40.00 $62.00

4.41 CG-2 Curbing - New 751-1000 L.F. $27.00 $28.43 $39.00 $62.00

4.42 CG-2 Curbing - New 1001-2000 L.F. $26.76 $25.59 $37.00 $62.00

4.43 CG-2 Replacement 1-100 L.F. $46.50 $63.70 $48.00 $100.00

4.44 CG-2 Replacement 101-200 L.F. $41.05 $57.33 $48.00 $90.00

4.45 CG-2 Replacement 201-500 L.F. $40.37 $51.60 $46.00 $80.00

4.46 CG-2 Replacement 501-750 L.F. $38.33 $46.44 $46.00 $75.00

4.47 CG-2 Replacement 751-1000 L.F. $35.74 $41.80 $44.00 $75.00

4.48 CG-2 Replacement 1001-2000 L.F. $31.58 $37.62 $41.00 $75.00

4.49 Concrete Steps – New price - sq ft of stair tread 1-200 Tread Ft. $96.15 $43.19 $105.00 $170.00

4.50 Concrete Steps – New price - sq ft of stair tread 201-1000 Tread Ft. $92.88 $38.87 $100.00 $65.00

4.51 Concrete Steps – New price - sq ft of stair tread 1001-4,000 Tread Ft. $81.27 $34.98 $95.00 $45.00

4.52 Concrete Steps – New price - sq ft of stair tread 4,001-6,000 Tread Ft. $76.65 $31.49 $90.00 $45.00

4.53 Concrete Steps – New price - sq ft of stair tread 6,001-8,000 Tread Ft. $75.15 $28.34 $90.00 $45.00

4.54 Concrete Steps – New price - sq ft of stair tread 8,001-10,000 Tread Ft. $73.66 $25.50 $90.00 $45.00

4.55 Concrete Steps – New price - sq ft of stair tread 10,000 & up Tread Ft. $69.84 $22.95 $90.00 $45.00

4.56 Concrete Steps – Replace price - sq ft of stair tread 1-200 Tread Ft. $101.20 $64.79 $125.00 $175.00

4.57 Concrete Steps – Replace price - sq ft of stair tread 201-1000 Tread Ft. $96.11 $58.31 $120.00 $75.00

4.58 Concrete Steps – Replace price - sq ft of stair tread 1001-4,000 Tread Ft. $93.08 $52.47 $115.00 $55.00

4.59 Concrete Steps – Replace price - sq ft of stair tread 4,001-6,000 Tread Ft. $90.00 $47.22 $110.00 $55.00

4.60 Concrete Steps – Replace price - sq ft of stair tread 6,001-8,000 Tread Ft. $87.42 $42.51 $110.00 $55.00

4.61 Concrete Steps – Replace price - sq ft of stair tread 8,001-10,000 Tread Ft. $79.38 $38.25 $110.00 $55.00

4.62 Concrete Steps – Replace price - sq ft of stair tread 10,000 & up Tread Ft. $73.10 $34.43 $110.00 $55.00

SECTION 9: Concrete Steps – New price based on square footage of stair tread

SECTION 10: Concrete Steps – Replacement price based on square footage of stair tread

SECTION 6: CG-1 Replacement

SECTION 7: CG-2 Curbing – New

SECTION 8: CG-2 Replacement



4.63 Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom/Pour finish. Saw cut. 1-200 Sq.Ft. $8.31 $3.39 $10.50 $35.00

4.64 Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom/Pour finish. Saw cut. 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $8.00 $3.22 $10.50 $15.00

4.65 Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom/Pour finish. Saw cut. 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $5.60 $3.06 $10.50 $11.00

4.66 Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom/Pour finish. Saw cut. 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $3.55 $2.91 $10.00 $11.00

4.67 Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom/Pour finish. Saw cut. 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $3.02 $2.76 $10.00 $11.00

4.68 Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom/Pour finish. Saw cut. 8,001-10,000 Sq.Ft. $2.95 $2.62 $9.50 $11.00

4.69 Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom/Pour finish. Saw cut. 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $2.88 $2.49 $9.50 $11.00

4.70 Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel/Pour finish. Saw cut. 1-200 Sq.Ft. $9.01 $3.73 $12.50 $35.00

4.71 Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel/Pour finish. Saw cut. 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $8.00 $3.54 $12.50 $15.00

4.72 Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel/Pour finish. Saw cut. 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $4.95 $3.37 $12.50 $11.00

4.73 Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel/Pour finish. Saw cut. 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $2.88 $3.20 $11.50 $11.00

4.74 Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel/Pour finish. Saw cut. 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $2.46 $3.04 $11.50 $11.00

4.75 Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel/Pour finish. Saw cut. 8,001-10,000 Sq.Ft. $2.41 $2.89 $10.50 $11.00

4.76 Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel/Pour finish. Saw cut. 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $1.91 $2.74 $10.50 $11.00

4.77 ADA Ramp – New (concrete portion only) Each Sq.Ft. $13.40 $24.95 $22.00 $2,750.00

4.78 ADA Ramp – Replacement (concrete portion only) Each Sq.Ft. $16.16 $37.43 $28.00 $3,000.00

4.79 ADA Detectable Surface – Cast In Place Panels Each Sq.Ft. $56.50 $30.95 $35.00 $500.00

4.80 ADA Detectable Surface – Grouted In Place Bricks Each Sq.Ft. $66.96 $36.70 $45.00 $700.00

4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick

4.81 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 1-200 Sq.Ft. $12.55 $13.96 $8.97 $10.44 $9.50 $12.50 $50.00 $50.00

4.82 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $9.40 $10.38 $8.07 $9.40 $9.50 $12.50 $16.00 $18.00

4.83 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $8.31 $8.82 $7.27 $8.46 $9.50 $12.50 $12.00 $15.00

4.84 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $7.65 $8.82 $6.54 $7.61 $9.00 $12.00 $12.00 $15.00

4.85 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $7.16 $7.38 $5.89 $6.85 $9.00 $12.00 $12.00 $15.00

4.86 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $6.77 $7.27 $5.30 $6.16 $8.50 $11.50 $12.00 $15.00

4.87 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $6.38 $7.07 $4.77 $5.55 $8.50 $11.50 $12.00 $15.00

4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick

4.88 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 1-200 Sq.Ft. $12.31 $12.57 $13.46 $15.66 $12.50 $14.50 $100.00 $100.00

4.89 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $12.15 $12.26 $12.11 $14.10 $12.50 $14.50 $30.00 $30.00

4.90 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $11.60 $11.60 $10.90 $12.68 $12.50 $14.50 $16.00 $18.00

4.91 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $10.51 $11.08 $9.81 $11.42 $12.00 $14.00 $14.00 $17.00

4.92 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $10.11 $10.51 $8.83 $10.27 $12.00 $14.00 $14.00 $17.00

4.93 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $9.46 $10.25 $7.95 $9.25 $11.50 $13.50 $13.50 $17.00

4.94 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $8.95 $8.43 $7.15 $8.32 $11.50 $13.50 $13.50 $17.00

SECTION 15: Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom finish

SECTION 11: Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom Finish-Pour finish and saw cut only

(forming, reinforcement placement, concrete and all other related materials will be furnished by the City)

SECTION 12: Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel Finish-Pour finish and saw cut only

(forming, reinforcement placement, concrete and all other related materials will be furnished by the City)

SECTION 13: Ramps

SECTION 14: Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish



4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick

4.95 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 1-200 Sq.Ft. $12.66 $12.83 $9.87 $11.48 $14.50 $17.00 $50.00 $50.00

4.96 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $10.25 $10.78 $8.88 $10.34 $14.50 $17.00 $16.00 $18.00

4.97 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $9.57 $10.04 $7.99 $9.30 $14.50 $17.00 $12.00 $15.00

4.98 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $9.04 $9.47 $7.19 $8.37 $14.00 $16.50 $12.00 $15.00

4.99 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $8.24 $8.57 $6.47 $7.53 $14.00 $16.50 $12.00 $15.00

4.100 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $7.39 $7.96 $5.83 $6.78 $13.50 $16.00 $12.00 $15.00

4.101 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $7.13 $7.49 $5.24 $6.10 $13.50 $16.00 $12.00 $15.00

4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick

4.102 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 1-200 Sq.Ft. $14.93 $15.55 $14.81 $17.22 $17.00 $21.00 $100.00 $100.00

4.103 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $14.45 $15.13 $13.32 $15.50 $17.00 $21.00 $30.00 $30.00

4.104 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $10.35 $10.78 $11.99 $13.95 $17.00 $20.00 $16.00 $18.00

4.105 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $9.82 $9.83 $10.79 $12.55 $16.50 $20.00 $14.00 $17.00

4.106 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $8.79 $9.32 $9.71 $11.30 $16.50 $20.00 $14.00 $17.00

4.107 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $8.43 $8.95 $8.74 $10.17 $16.00 $19.00 $13.50 $17.00

4.108 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $8.14 $8.43 $7.87 $9.15 $16.00 $19.00 $13.50 $17.00

4.109 10” Thick Concrete Patch 0 – 20 Sq.Ft. $22.09 $50.00 $21.00 $225.00

4.110 10” Thick Concrete Patch 21 – 70 Sq.Ft. $20.73 $35.00 $21.00 $200.00

4.111 10” Thick Concrete Patch 71 - 260 Sq.Ft. $19.17 $30.00 $19.00 $95.00

4.112 10” Thick Concrete Patch > 260 Sq.Ft. $17.94 $15.00 $19.00 $32.00

8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut

4.113 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 1-200 Sq.Ft. $15.10 $15.05 $12.15 $14.14 $21.00 $23.00 $75.00 $75.00

4.114 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $10.80 $11.25 $10.94 $12.73 $21.00 $23.00 $37.00 $40.00

4.115 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $10.04 $10.52 $9.84 $11.45 $21.00 $23.00 $21.00 $24.00

4.116 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $9.47 $10.04 $8.86 $10.31 $19.00 $21.00 $18.00 $21.50

4.117 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $9.00 $9.49 $7.97 $9.28 $19.00 $21.00 $16.00 $20.00

4.118 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $8.43 $9.01 $7.17 $8.35 $19.00 $21.00 $16.00 $20.00

4.119 Concrete Flat Work-New- broom finish 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $8.22 $8.56 $6.46 $7.51 $19.00 $21.00 $16.00 $20.00

8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut

4.120 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 1-200 Sq.Ft. $14.44 $15.10 $18.23 $21.21 $23.00 $25.00 $75.00 $75.00

4.121 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $13.78 $14.44 $16.41 $19.09 $23.00 $25.00 $40.00 $45.00

4.122 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $12.91 $13.68 $14.77 $1.18 $23.00 $25.00 $25.00 $30.00

4.123 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $12.62 $13.04 $13.29 $15.46 $21.00 $22.00 $23.50 $28.00

4.124 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $12.39 $12.59 $11.96 $13.92 $21.00 $22.00 $22.50 $28.00

4.125 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $12.23 $12.39 $10.76 $12.52 $21.00 $22.00 $22.50 $28.00

4.126 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- broom 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $11.46 $12.07 $9.69 $11.27 $21.00 $22.00 $22.50 $28.00

SECTION 20: Concrete Flat Work-Replacement- Broom/Pour Finish

SECTION 19: Concrete Flat Work-New Broom/Pour Finish

SECTION 17: Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish

SECTION 16: Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish

SECTION 18: Concrete Street Repairs



8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut

4.127 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 1-200 Sq.Ft. $15.27 $15.48 $12.63 $13.89 $21.00 $23.00 $75.00 $75.00

4.128 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $11.60 $12.00 $11.37 $12.50 $21.00 $23.00 $37.00 $40.00

4.129 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $10.20 $10.42 $10.23 $11.25 $21.00 $23.00 $21.00 $24.00

4.130 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $9.74 $10.05 $9.21 $10.13 $19.00 $21.00 $18.00 $21.50

4.131 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $9.27 $9.47 $8.29 $9.11 $19.00 $21.00 $16.00 $20.00

4.132 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $8.76 $9.05 $7.46 $8.20 $19.00 $21.00 $16.00 $20.00

4.133 Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel Finish 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $8.40 $8.65 $6.71 $7.38 $19.00 $21.00 $16.00 $20.00

8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut

4.134 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 1-200 Sq.Ft. $14.70 $15.27 $18.95 $20.84 $23.00 $25.00 $75.00 $75.00

4.135 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $14.07 $14.44 $17.06 $18.76 $23.00 $25.00 $40.00 $45.00

4.136 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $13.05 $13.78 $15.35 $16.88 $23.00 $25.00 $25.00 $30.00

4.137 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $12.83 $12.92 $13.81 $15.19 $21.00 $22.00 $23.50 $28.00

4.138 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $12.60 $12.65 $12.43 $13.67 $21.00 $22.00 $22.50 $28.00

4.139 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $11.60 $12.00 $11.19 $12.31 $21.00 $22.00 $22.50 $28.00

4.140 Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $10.35 $11.65 $10.09 $11.08 $21.00 $22.00 $22.50 $28.00

4.141 each $4.05 $9.10 $25.00 $5.50

4.142 4” Compacted Aggregate Base 1-200 Sq.Ft. $1.48 $1.00 $3.00 $50.00

4.143 4” Compacted Aggregate Base 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $1.25 $0.95 $3.00 $15.00

4.144 4” Compacted Aggregate Base 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $0.96 $0.90 $3.00 $3.00

4.145 4” Compacted Aggregate Base 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $0.77 $0.85 $3.00 $2.00

4.146 4” Compacted Aggregate Base 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $0.67 $0.80 $3.00 $2.00

4.147 4” Compacted Aggregate Base
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $0.66 $0.75 $3.00 $2.00

4.148 4” Compacted Aggregate Base 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $0.55 $0.70 $3.00 $2.00

Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

4.149 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Sand Base 1-100 Sq.Ft. $31.48 $30.20 $24.50 $36.75 $25.00 $27.00 $25.00 no bid

4.150 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Sand Base 101-200 Sq.Ft. $28.75 $27.45 $24.00 $36.00 $25.00 $27.00 $20.00 no bid

4.151 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Sand Base 201-500 Sq.Ft. $25.56 $24.26 $23.50 $35.25 $25.00 $27.00 $18.00 no bid

4.152 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Sand Base 501-750 Sq.Ft. $24.08 $22.80 $23.00 $34.50 $22.00 $24.00 $18.00 no bid

4.153 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Sand Base 751-1,000 Sq.Ft. $19.85 $18.55 $22.50 $33.75 $22.00 $24.00 $18.00 no bid

4.154 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Sand Base 1,001-2,500 Sq.Ft. $17.76 $16.49 $22.00 $33.00 $20.00 $21.00 $18.00 no bid

4.155 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Sand Base 2,501-4,000 Sq.Ft. $17.52 $16.23 $21.50 $32.25 $20.00 $21.00 $18.00 no bid

Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

4.156 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Concrete Base 1-100 Sq.Ft. $43.18 $41.90 $28.00 $42.00 $33.00 $35.00 $25.00 no bid

4.157 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Concrete Base 101-200 Sq.Ft. $39.15 $37.85 $27.50 $41.25 $33.00 $35.00 $20.00 no bid

4.158 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Concrete Base 201-500 Sq.Ft. $30.77 $29.46 $27.00 $40.50 $33.00 $35.00 $18.00 no bid

4.159 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Concrete Base 501-750 Sq.Ft. $29.28 $28.00 $65.50 $39.75 $30.00 $32.00 $18.00 no bid

4.160 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Concrete Base 751-1,000 Sq.Ft. $27.65 $26.35 $26.00 $39.00 $30.00 $32.00 $18.00 no bid

4.161 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Concrete Base 1,001-2,500 Sq.Ft. $24.26 $22.96 $25.50 $38.25 $28.00 $29.00 $18.00 no bid

4.162 Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Concrete Base 2,501-4,000 Sq.Ft. $22.72 $21.45 $25.00 $37.50 $28.00 $29.00 $18.00 no bid

SECTION 23: Dowel Bars

SECTION 26: Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Concrete Base

SECTION 25: Pavestone Concrete Pavers over Sand Base

SECTION 24: 4” Compacted Aggregate Base

Dowel Bars Installed

SECTION 22: Concrete Flat Work-Replacement-Trowel Finish

SECTION 21: Concrete Flat Work-New- Trowel/Pour Finish



Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

4.163 Brick Pavers over Sand Base 1-100 Sq.Ft. $31.50 $30.20 $24.00 $36.00 $25.00 $27.00 $25.00 no bid

4.164 Brick Pavers over Sand Base 101-200 Sq.Ft. $31.35 $30.05 $23.50 $35.25 $25.00 $27.00 $20.00 no bid

4.165 Brick Pavers over Sand Base 201-500 Sq.Ft. $28.15 $26.86 $23.00 $34.50 $25.00 $27.00 $18.00 no bid

4.166 Brick Pavers over Sand Base 501-750 Sq.Ft. $26.66 $25.40 $22.50 $33.75 $22.00 $24.00 $18.00 no bid

4.167 Brick Pavers over Sand Base 751-1,000 Sq.Ft. $22.45 $21.15 $22.00 $33.00 $22.00 $24.00 $18.00 no bid

4.168 Brick Pavers over Sand Base 1,001-2,500 Sq.Ft. $20.35 $19.05 $21.50 $32.25 $22.00 $21.00 $18.00 no bid

4.169 Brick Pavers over Sand Base 2,501-4,000 Sq.Ft. $20.15 $18.85 $21.00 $31.50 $22.00 $21.00 $18.00 no bid

Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

4.170 Brick Pavers over Concrete Base 1-100 Sq.Ft. $45.78 $44.48 $27.50 $41.25 $33.00 $35.00 $25.00 no bid

4.171 Brick Pavers over Concrete Base 101-200 Sq.Ft. $41.75 $40.43 $27.00 $40.50 $33.00 $35.00 $20.00 no bid

4.172 Brick Pavers over Concrete Base 201-500 Sq.Ft. $33.38 $33.38 $36.50 $39.75 $33.00 $35.00 $18.00 no bid

4.173 Brick Pavers over Concrete Base 501-750 Sq.Ft. $33.20 $31.89 $26.00 $39.00 $30.00 $32.00 $18.00 no bid

4.174 Brick Pavers over Concrete Base 751-1,000 Sq.Ft. $30.24 $30.24 $25.50 $38.25 $30.00 $32.00 $18.00 no bid

4.175 Brick Pavers over Concrete Base 1,001-2,500 Sq.Ft. $26.87 $25.56 $25.00 $37.50 $28.00 $29.00 $18.00 no bid

4.176 Brick Pavers over Concrete Base 2,501-4,000 Sq.Ft. $25.33 $24.02 $24.50 $36.75 $28.00 $29.00 $18.00 no bid

Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

4.177 4” Prism P5040 Taupe Stamped Concrete* 1-200 Sq.Ft. $16.39 $16.39 $14.58 $21.87 $22.00 $22.00 $100.00 no bid

4.178 4” Prism P5040 Taupe Stamped Concrete* 201-1000 Sq.Ft. $15.72 $15.72 $13.50 $20.25 $22.00 $22.00 $32.00 no bid

4.179 4” Prism P5040 Taupe Stamped Concrete* 1001-4,000 Sq.Ft. $14.20 $14.20 $12.50 $18.75 $22.00 $22.00 $24.00 no bid

4.180 4” Prism P5040 Taupe Stamped Concrete* 4,001-6,000 Sq.Ft. $12.60 $12.60 $11.50 $17.25 $21.00 $21.00 $24.00 no bid

4.181 4” Prism P5040 Taupe Stamped Concrete* 6,001-8,000 Sq.Ft. $11.92 $11.92 $10.58 $15.87 $21.00 $21.00 $24.00 no bid

4.182 4” Prism P5040 Taupe Stamped Concrete*
8,001-

10,000
Sq.Ft. $11.05 $11.05 $9.73 $14.60 $20.00 $20.00 $24.00 no bid

4.183 4” Prism P5040 Taupe Stamped Concrete* 10,000 & up Sq.Ft. $10.25 $10.25 $8.95 $13.43 $20.00 $20.00 $24.00 no bid

"RED"=3500 mobilize fee*Denotes or approved equal

SECTION 29: 4” Brick Red Stamped Concrete Flatwork

SECTION 28: Brick Pavers over Concrete Base

SECTION 27: Brick Pavers over Sand Base



UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

$65.50 $110.50

$56.00 $108.92

$41.50 $55.35

$36.50 $35.74

$34.50 $34.72

$34.00 $34.22

$72.00 $175.00

$63.00 $168.92

$48.50 $115.92

$39.50 $95.92

$38.50 $94.62

$37.00 $94.62

$65.50 $110.50

$56.00 $108.92

$41.50 $55.35

$36.50 $35.74

$34.50 $34.72

$34.00 $34.22

$72.00 $172.36

$63.00 $168.92

$48.50 $115.92

$39.50 $95.92

$38.50 $94.62

$37.00 $94.42

$82.50 $97.30

$81.00 $95.50

$70.50 $65.50

$60.00 $35.50

$59.00 $34.50

$57.50 $34.50

Phillips Paving Precision Construction

SECTION 1: Concrete Curb Edging- New 12” H x 6” W

SECTION 2: Concrete Curb Edging- Replacement 12”Hx6”W

SECTION 5: CG-1 Curbing – New

SECTION 4: Concrete Curb Edging- Replace 6"x12"wide

SECTION 3: Concrete Curb Edging- New 6"x12"wide



$94.50 $178.60

$93.00 $175.50

$82.50 $145.50

$72.00 $65.50

$71.00 $64.50

$69.50 $64.50

$81.50 $11,000.00

$80.00 $95.50

$69.50 $65.50

$59.00 $35.50

$58.00 $34.50

$54.50 $34.50

$93.50 $18,000.00

$92.00 $175.50

$81.50 $145.50

$71.00 $65.50

$70.00 $64.50

$66.50 $64.50

$90.00 $95.00

$84.00 $92.00

$82.00 $88.00

$80.00 $78.60

$80.00 $75.30

$80.00 $73.60

$80.00 $70.83

$135.00 $105.00

$130.00 $103.00

$128.00 $99.00

$126.00 $96.60

$125.00 $95.60

$125.00 $95.60

$125.00 $95.50

SECTION 9: Concrete Steps – New price based on square footage of stair tread

SECTION 10: Concrete Steps – Replacement price based on square footage of stair tread

SECTION 6: CG-1 Replacement

SECTION 7: CG-2 Curbing – New

SECTION 8: CG-2 Replacement



$8.00 $45.00

$5.00 $31.82

$3.50 $6.91

$3.00 $4.68

$2.90 $2.27

$2.50 $2.27

$2.50 $2.00

$9.50 $50.00

$6.00 $20.10

$4.50 $10.26

$3.75 $2.57

$3.50 $2.56

$3.50 $2.54

$3.50 $2.50

$12.50 $68.75

$18.00 $98.23

$48.00 $25.60

$112.00 $176.30

4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick

$18.50 $21.00 $69.00 $71.00

$15.00 $17.50 $67.32 $65.26

$13.50 $16.00 $34.43 $35.94

$13.00 $15.50 $10.15 $11.64

$12.00 $14.50 $8.34 $9.82

$11.00 $13.50 $7.43 $8.92

$10.00 $12.50 $6.89 $8.37

4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick

$22.50 $25.00 $99.00 $101.00

$19.00 $21.50 $98.36 $99.84

$17.50 $20.00 $23.98 $27.02

$17.00 $19.50 $15.50 $16.50

$16.00 $18.50 $13.25 $15.28

$15.00 $17.50 $12.75 $14.75

$14.00 $165.00 $12.50 $14.50

SECTION 11: Concrete Flat Work-New-Broom Finish-Pour finish and saw cut only

(forming, reinforcement placement, concrete and all other related materials will be furnished by the City)

SECTION 12: Concrete Flat Work-New-Trowel Finish-Pour finish and saw cut only

(forming, reinforcement placement, concrete and all other related materials will be furnished by the City)

SECTION 13: Ramps



4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick

$19.50 $22.00 $52.00 $55.00

$16.00 $18.50 $51.79 $53.27

$14.50 $17.00 $22.28 $23.76

$14.00 $16.50 $14.50 $16.37

$13.00 $15.50 $14.32 $16.33

$12.00 $14.50 $12.48 $13.96

$11.00 $13.50 $12.46 $13.94

4” Thick 6” Thick 4” Thick 6” Thick

$23.50 $26.00 $75.00 $77.00

$20.00 $22.50 $74.27 $76.91

$18.50 $21.00 $50.03 $52.89

$18.00 $20.50 $15.08 $17.34

$17.00 $19.50 $13.37 $15.43

$16.00 $18.50 $13.25 $15.36

$15.00 $17.50 $13.05 $15.16

$250.00 $150.00

$90.00 $135.00

$65.00 $87.32

$58.00 $25.89

8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut

$25.00 $28.00 $50.00 $53.00

$21.00 $24.00 $48.29 $49.91

$18.50 $21.00 $18.42 $20.04

$17.50 $20.00 $14.70 $16.32

$16.50 $19.00 $14.65 $16.28

$16.00 $19.00 $14.63 $16.25

$16.00 $19.00 $13.20 $13.57

8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut

$31.00 $34.00 $85.00 $87.00

$26.50 $29.50 $79.39 $81.96

$25.50 $28.50 $54.39 $56.01

$24.00 $26.00 $19.13 $21.36

$22.00 $24.50 $17.33 $19.35

$20.50 $23.00 $17.30 $19.32

$19.50 $22.00 $17.15 $19.15

SECTION 18: Concrete Street Repairs



8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut

$26.00 $29.00 $60.00 $62.00

$22.00 $25.00 $55.67 $57.53

$19.50 $22.00 $25.28 $27.18

$18.50 $21.00 $16.50 $18.50

$17.50 $20.00 $18.32 $20.32

$17.00 $20.00 $14.48 $16.48

$17.00 $20.00 $14.48 $16.48

8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut 8” Saw Cut 10” Saw Cut

$32.00 $35.00 $85.00 $90.00

$27.50 $30.50 $79.59 $82.16

$26.50 $29.50 $54.59 $56.21

$25.00 $27.00 $19.33 $21.56

$23.00 $25.50 $17.53 $19.55

$21.50 $24.00 $17.50 $19.42

$20.50 $23.00 $17.35 $19.25

$9.00 $6.88

$1.45 $33.00

$1.25 $31.82

$1.15 $6.91

$1.00 $1.73

$1.00 $1.71

$0.95 $1.70

$0.95 $1.36

Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

$93.00 $108.00 $98.00 T&M

$87.00 $102.00 $94.89 T&M

$85.00 $100.00 $72.89 T&M

$83.00 $98.00 $64.89 T&M

$83.00 $98.00 $58.33 T&M

$78.00 $93.00 $56.94 T&M

$75.00 $90.00 $55.87 T&M

Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

$103.00 $118.00 $120.00 T&M

$97.00 $112.00 $105.94 T&M

$95.00 $110.00 $83.37 T&M

$93.00 $107.00 $75.35 T&M

$93.00 $107.00 $69.05 T&M

$88.00 $102.00 $67.69 T&M

$85.00 $97.00 $65.73 T&M

SECTION 23: Dowel Bars

SECTION 24: 4” Compacted Aggregate Base



Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

$88.00 $103.00 $98.00 no bid

$82.00 $97.00 no bid no bid

$80.00 $95.00 no bid no bid

$78.00 $93.00 no bid no bid

$78.00 $93.00 no bid no bid

$73.00 $88.00 no bid no bid

$70.00 $85.00 no bid no bid

Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

$98.00 $113.00 no bid no bid

$92.00 $108.00 no bid no bid

$90.00 $105.00 no bid no bid

$88.00 $102.00 no bid no bid

$88.00 $102.00 no bid no bid

$83.00 $97.00 no bid no bid

$80.00 $92.00 no bid no bid

Installation Replacement Installation Replacement

$22.50 $27.50 $170.00 $210.00

$19.00 $24.00 $160.00 $195.00

$17.50 $21.50 $22.50 $32.50

$17.00 $21.00 $20.50 $30.50

$16.00 $20.00 $18.50 $28.50

$16.00 $20.00 $16.00 $36.00

$15.00 $19.00 $16.00 $26.00


