LEE'S SUMMIT

[ LE53 300

BID NUMBER: 2022-057

PROJECT: Tires & Service

BID OPENING: 06/01/2022 at 3:00PM
OPENED BY: Tarah Daugherty

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

This is the unofficial bid tabulation and only reflects the reading of the bids and not the evaluation process of bids received.

Bidder
Heartland Tires & Treads of KC, Inc.
Kansas City, MO

Bidder
Oades Brothers, LLC
Lee's Summit, MO

Bidder
DLS Tire Centers, LLC
Lee's Summit, MO

REQUIRED (CURRENTLY USED BY THE CITY)

Continental/General

Continental/General

Continental/General

Type of Tire
P % off Catalog List % off Catalog List % off Catalog List
2.1 Passenger Light Truck Tires 49.5% P/LT: 49%, Police Pursuit 63.25% 49%
2.2 Premium Heavy Duty Truck & Bus 29% 29%

2.3 Tire Delivery:

**Will you charge a delivery Fee for Tires Only? If so, what is the flat
rate delivery fee?

**Does your company have a Delivery Minimum?

Yes, $2/per tire

NO Delivery Fee, NO Minimum

NO Delivery Fee, NO Minimum

ADDITIONAL OPTIONS OFFERED (PREFERRED, NOT REQUIRED)

Premium Heavy

Premium Heavy

Premium Heavy

B P Light Truck Bl P: Light Truck B P Light Truck
i g % off Catalog List g % off Catalog List i e % off Catalog List
2.4 . . N
Bridgestone/Firestone Bidder notated "State Contract 7490" Goodyear ) 48/0_ 60%
Police Pursuit 52.5%
2.5
2.6

GENERAL INFORMATION

2.13 State hours & days of operation

Mon-Fri 7am-5pm

7-6 M-F, 8-5 Sat, Closed Sundays

7:30am--5:00pm, Mon-Fri

2.14 Delivery Time (after receipt of PO):

2 Days

ASAP

As Soon as product is needed

2.15 The City's standard payment terms are Net 30 after
receipt of invoice. State any discounts offered:

None

None

None

2.16 Describe Warranty for Tires AND Service:

Tire=Manufacturers
Service=No Charge re-do for workmanship

Tires: Workmanship & Material Guaranteed by Manufacturer
Service: 2 yrs, 24k Miles

Workmanship & material standard on all new tires.
Service work guaranteed for what is done

2.17 State Contact Name, position, email & phone number for
Customer Service related issues:

Douglas Post
Vice President
dpost@httofkc.com
913-281-4054

Jimmy Oades, Owner
W: 816-246-7177
jimmy.oades@oadesbrothers.com

John LuAllen, President
john@dlscommercial.com
816-556-6242

2.18 Please list the nearest store location (full address &
phone number) closest to Lee's Summit, MO for tires to be
purchased & services to be performed:

100 W 18th Avenue
N. Kansas City, MO 64116

12 NE Sycamore Street Lee's Summit MO 64086

400 SE Fleetway Drive
Lee's Summit, MO 64081

2.19 For other Tire Brands not specifically identified, may the
Department call you for quotations if the tires are offered by

your entity?

Yes

Yes

Yes




LEE'S SUMMIT

MISSOURI

BID NUMBER: 2022-057

PROJECT: Tires & Service

BID OPENING: 06/01/2022 at 3:00PM
OPENED BY: Tarah Daugherty

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

This is the unofficial bid tabulation and only reflects the reading of the bids and not the evaluation process of bids received.

Bidder
Heartland Tires & Treads of KC, Inc.
Kansas City, MO

Bidder
Oades Brothers, LLC
Lee's Summit, MO

Bidder
DLS Tire Centers, LLC
Lee's Summit, MO

HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE & TRAILER TIRE SERVICE

Description of Service

Price Price Price
31 Service Call or Field ServmeACaIIto Lee's Summit, MO $119.50 No Bid $50.00
(See Section 1.8)
3.2 |Change tire, Mount AND Dismount $40.00 No Bid $30.00
3.3 |Tire Installation $17.00 No Bid $0.00
3.4 |Flat repair, remove, repair and mount $50.00 No Bid $35.00
3.5 [Flat repair, off vehicle $40.00 No Bid $25.00
3.6 |Rotate mounted tires $17.00 No Bid $10.00
3.7 |New Valve Stem (heavy duty metal type) $8.00 No Bid $5.00
3.8 |Computer spin balance $39.00 No Bid $30.00
3.9 |Wheel balance valve stem combo $47.00 No Bid $30.00
3.10 |Standard 2 Wheel Alignment $169.95 No Bid $105.00
3.11 [Standard 4 Wheel Alignment $199.95 No Bid $125.00
3.12 [Studding N/A No Bid
3.13 |Used tire recycle/disposal $7.00 No Bid $3.00
3.14 |Wheel Refurbishment $35.00 No Bid $28.00
LIGHT DUTY VEHICLE TIRE SERVICE
Description of Service Price Price Price
315 Service Call or Field Serwce'CaII to Lee's Summit, MO $119.50 $50.00 $50.00
(See Section 1.8)
3.16 [Change tire, Mount AND Dismount $12.50 $7.50 $7.50
3.17 |Tire Installation $7.00 $0.00 $0.00
3.18 [Flat repair, remove, repair and mount $24.95 $24.95 w/ balance $20.00
3.19 [Flat repair, off vehicle $19.95 $24.95 w/ balance $17.50
3.2 |Rotate mounted tires $12.00 $5.00 $5.00
3.21 |New Valve Stem (snap in rubber type) $4.00 $0.00 $3.00
3.22 |Computer spin balance $12.50 $7.50 $7.50
3.23 |Wheel balance valve stem combo $16.50 $15.00 $10.00
3.24 |Standard 2 Wheel Alignment $69.95 $69.95 $60.00
3.25 |Standard 4 Wheel Alignment $99.95 $69.95 $60.00
3.26 [Studding N-A No Bid
3.27 |Used tire recycle/disposal $4.00 $3.00 $2.00
3.28 |Wheel Refurbishment $35.00 No Bid
For Services not specifically identified above, may the
3.29 [Department contact you for quotations on such Yes Yes Yes

services if offered by your entity?

UNOFFICIAL




