BILL NO. 19-52

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 7 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF
LEE'S SUMMIT, MISSOURI, THE LEE'S SUMMIT BUILDING CODE TO CORRECT
SCRIVENER’'S ERRORS BY REPEALING THE ENTIRETY OF CHAPTER 7; AND ADOPTING
A NEW CHAPTER 7 PERTAINING TO THE SAME SUBJECT MATTER TO INCORPORATE
NEW PROVISIONS OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODES AND THE 2017
NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE AND MODIFY OR RETAIN CERTAIN EXISTING PROVISIONS
OF THE BUILDING CODE AND ELECTRICAL CODE.

WHEREAS, the 2018 International Building Code, 2018 International Residential Code, 2017
National Electrical Code, 2018 International Plumbing Code, 2018 International Mechanical Code,
2018 International Fuel Gas Code and other revised building regulations have been extensively
reviewed by the Development Services Department, the Fire Department, the Board of Appeals,
members of professional trade associations, members of the construction community, and the
Community & Economic Development Committee; and,

WHEREAS, after much technical study and ample public input, the Development Services
Department, the Board of Appeals, and the Community & Economic Development Committee
believe that it is in the best interests of the City of Lee’s Summit to repeal in its entirety Chapter
7, Building and Building Regulations of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Lee’'s Summit,
Missouri to remain current with the most recently published International Codes, including the
2018 International Building Code, the 2018 International Residential Code, the 2017 National
Electrical Code, the 2018 International Plumbing Code, the 2018 International Mechanical Code,
the 2018 International Fuel Gas Code, and State law; and,

WHEREAS, based on staff reports and public comment, the City Council desires to protect
the public health, safety, and welfare by repealing Chapter 7; and adopting a new Chapter 7
pertaining to the same subject matter; and,

WHEREAS, The City of Lee’s Summit pursuant to the Lee’s Summit City Charter, the
Missouri State Constitution, and the City’s police powers has the authority to regulate for the
public health, safety, and welfare.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LEE'S SUMMIT,
MISSOURI, as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapter 7, Building and Building Regulations, of the Code of Ordinances of the
City of Lee’s Summit, Missouri, is hereby amended by (i) adopting into Chapter 7 those parts of the
2018 International Building Code as published by the International Code Council, Inc. (First Printing,
August 2017, ISBN 978-1-60983-735-8) (the “2018 IBC”) as set forth below in this Section, (ii)
modifying certain sections and portions of the 2018 IBC as set forth below in this Section and (iii)
retaining those portions of the current Chapter 7 as set forth below:

ARTICLE | ADMINISTRATION
Sec. 7-100. - Title.

These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of Lee's Summit, Missouri
hereinafter "Code."

Page 1



BILL NO. 19-52

Sec. 7-101. - Scope.

This Code shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement,
repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and demolition of every
building or structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures.
Detached one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more than three (3) stories in height
with separate means of egress, and their accessory structures shall comply with Article 1X
(International Residential Code) of this chapter.

Sec. 7-102. - Intent.

The purpose of this Code is to establish the minimum requirements to safeguard the public
health, safety and general welfare through structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability,
sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy conservation, property maintenance, and safety
to life and property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built environment.

Sec. 7-103. - Applicability.
Where, in any specific case, different sections of this Code specify different materials,
methods of construction, or other requirements, the most restrictive shall govern. Where there is

a conflict between a general requirement and a specific requirement, the specific requirement
shall be applicable.

Sec. 7-104. - Other laws.
The provisions of this Code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of local, state, or
federal law.
Sec. 7-105. - Application of references.
References to chapter or section numbers, or to provisions not specifically identified by
number, shall be construed to refer to such chapter, section, or provision of this Code.
Sec. 7-106. - Referenced codes and standards.
The codes and standards referenced in this Code shall be considered part of the
requirements of this Code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where differences

occur between provisions of this Code and referenced codes and standards, the provisions of this
Code shall apply.

Sec. 7-107. - Partial invalidity.
In the event any part or provision of this Code is held to be illegal or void, this shall not have
the effect of making void or illegal any of the other parts or provisions.
Sec. 7-108. - Existing structures.
The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this Code shall be
permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this Code, the Property

Maintenance Code or the International Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building
Official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public.

Sec. 7-109. - Duties and powers of building official.

Page 2



BILL NO. 19-52

The Building Official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce the provisions of this Code.
The Building Official shall have the authority to render interpretations of this Code and to adopt
policies and procedures in order to clarify the application of its provisions. Such interpretations,
policies, and procedures shall comply with the intent and purpose of this Code. Such policies and
procedures shall not have the effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in this Code.
The Building Official shall be known as the Director of Codes Administration, and such term shall
include his/her authorized representatives. Further, whenever the term or title "Administrative
Authority," "Code Enforcement Officer," "Responsible Official," "Codes Administrator," "Director"
or other similar designation is used in any of the codes adopted by reference by this Code, it shall
be construed to mean the Building Official.

Sec. 7-110. - Applications and permits.

The Building Official shall receive applications, review construction documents and issue
permits for the erection, and alteration, demolition and moving of buildings and structures, inspect
the premises for which such permits have been issued and enforce compliance with the provisions
of this Code.

Sec. 7-111. - Notices and orders.

The Building Official shall issue all necessary notices or orders to ensure compliance with
this Code.

Sec. 7-112. - Inspections.

The Building Official shall make all of the required inspections, or the Building Official shall
have the authority to accept reports of inspection by approved agencies or individuals. Reports of
such inspections shall be in writing and be certified by a responsible officer of such approved
agency or by the responsible individual. The Building Official is authorized to engage such expert
opinion as deemed necessary to report upon unusual technical issues that arise, subject to the
approval of the appointing authority.

Sec. 7-113. - Right-of-entry.

A. Where itis necessary to make an inspection to enforce the provisions of this Code, or where
the Building Official has reasonable cause to believe that there exists in a structure or upon
a premises a condition which is contrary to or in violation of this Code which makes the
structure or premises unsafe, dangerous or hazardous, the Building Official is authorized to
enter the structure or premises at reasonable times to inspect or to perform the duties
imposed by this Code, provided that if such structure or premises be occupied that credentials
be presented to the occupant and entry requested. If such structure or premises be
unoccupied, the Building Official shall first make a reasonable effort to locate the owner or
other person having charge or control of the structure or premises and request entry. If entry
is refused, the Building Official shall have recourse to the remedies provided by law to secure
entry, including the procurement of an administrative search warrant as provided in this
section.

B. If no consent has been given to enter or inspect any building or structure, no entry or
inspection shall be made without the procurement of a warrant from the judge presiding in
the Municipal Court of Lee's Summit, Missouri. Any request for such a warrant shall be in
writing and made by the Building or Code Official, any police officer, City Attorney or

Page 3



BILL NO. 19-52

prosecuting attorney of the City, stating that he/she has probable cause to believe there exists
in a building or structure, more patrticularly described therein, a violation or violations of
provisions of this chapter and is within the territorial jurisdiction of the City, and verified by
oath or affirmation stating evidential facts.

C. The Court may consider any of the following factors along with such other matters as it
deems pertinent in its decision as to whether a warrant shall issue:

Eye witness account of violation;
Citizen complaint(s);
Tenant complaint(s);
Plain view violations;

Violations apparent from City records;

N T o

Nature of alleged violation, the threat to life or safety, and imminent risk of significant
property damage; or

7. Previous unabated violations in the building or structure or on the premises.

D. Cause supporting issuance of a warrant shall be deemed to exist in light of reasonable
legislative and administrative standards which show that there is reason to believe a condition
of non-conformity exists with respect to a building in violation of the provisions of the Lee's
Summit Building Code.

E. If such judge determines the existence of probable cause, then such judge shall issue a
search warrant directed to the authorized person to search the structure or premises therein
described for the purposes requested. Such search warrant may be executed and returned
only within ten (10) days after the date of its issuance.

F. The person authorized to search shall make a return promptly after concluding the search,
and such return shall contain an itemization of all violations of this chapter discovered
pursuant to such search. Refusal to allow entry upon presentation of a search warrant shall
be an ordinance violation.

G. Execution of a search warrant issued under this section shall not be by forcible entry.
Sec. 7-114. - Records.

The Building Official shall keep official records of applications received, permits and
certificates issued, fees collected, reports of inspections, and notices and orders issued. Such
records shall be retained in the official records for the period required for retention of public
records.

Sec. 7-115. - Liability.

The Building Official, member of the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals or employee
charged with the enforcement of this Code, while acting for the jurisdiction in good faith and
without malice in the discharge of the duties required by this Code or other pertinent law or
ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally and is hereby relieved from personal
liability for any damage accruing to persons or property as a result of any act or by reason of an
act or omission in the discharge of official duties. Any sulit instituted against an officer or employee
because of an act performed by that officer or employee in the lawful discharge of duties and

Page 4



BILL NO. 19-52

under the provisions of this Code shall be defended by legal representative of the jurisdiction until
the final termination of the proceedings. The Building Official or any subordinate shall not be liable
for cost in any action; suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of this
Code.

Sec. 7-116. - Approved materials and equipment.

Materials, equipment, and devices approved by the Building Official shall be constructed and
installed in accordance with such approval.

Sec. 7-117. - Used materials and equipment.

The use of used materials, which meet the requirements of this Code for new materials, is
permitted. Used equipment and devices shall not be reused unless approved by the Building
Official.

Sec. 7-118. - Insurance proceeds from damage or loss to buildings or structures.

A. Ifthere are proceeds of any insurance policy based on a covered claim payment for damage
or loss to a building or other structure arising out of or caused by fire, explosion or other
casualty loss, and the covered claim payment exceeds fifty (50) percent of the face value of
the policy covering such building or other structure, then the insurer shall pay to the
Department of Finance a sum equal to twenty-five (25) percent of the covered claim, within
thirty (30) days of the determination of coverage, to be held by the City in an interest-bearing
account. The proceeds shall be used to reimburse the City for its costs in the removal of such
building or other structure, if necessary.

B. The City shall release the proceeds paid to it pursuant to subsection (a) of this section to the
insured or in accordance with the provisions of the insurance policy and endorsements
thereto as directed by the insurer unless within 30 days after receipt of the insurance
proceeds the designated official of the City has commenced an action under Section 7-1204
et seq., for the building or other structure to be repaired, secured or demolished.

C. The City shall apply the insurance proceeds first to the cost of the removal of any building
or other structure found to be a nuisance under this article, less any salvage value, prior to
the expenditure of any City funds. Should any balance of insurance proceeds remain in the
interest-bearing account after the expense of removal of such building or structure has been
paid, the balance shall be paid over to the insured.

D. Nothing in this section shall be construed to affect the priority of a named mortgagee on the
insurance policy to the proceeds of the policy.

E. It shall be unlawful for an insurance carrier to fail to pay insurance proceeds to the City after
being notified pursuant to this article.

Sec. 7-119. - Sanitary sewer service construction and connection.

Residential properties with one hundred fifty (150) feet of public sewer and non-residential
properties within three hundred (300) feet of public sewer shall be required to connect to the public
sewer in accordance with the Plumbing Code and Chapter 32 of the Lee's Summit Code of
Ordinances. When public sewers are not available, permits for private sewage systems must be
obtained from the Jackson County Public Works Department prior to issuance of the building
permit.

Page 5



BILL NO. 19-52

Sec. 7-120. - Sanitary facilities for construction workers.

The contractor, builder, or other person having the management and control of construction
work shall prevent the commission of any nuisance by the workers on the premises connected
therewith and if a temporary privy is located on the premises it shall be properly screened and
maintained in a sanitary manner.

Sec. 7-121. - Barbed wire and electric fences.

It shall be unlawful to erect or maintain barbed wire or electric fences other than in zoning
districts AG and PI; provided, however, that not more than three (3) strands of barbed wire shall
be permitted on top of a chain link or other type of fence not less than six (6) feet in height as
outside security for storage of equipment or materials in any zoning district other than residential.
The provisions of this section shall not apply when a special use permit specifically authorizes a
different type or method of fencing.

Sec. 7-122. - Excavations.

Any excavation for foundations and/or footings of buildings and structures shall be backfilled
within twenty-eight (28) days from the date of excavation unless otherwise approved by the
Building Official.

Sec. 7-123. - Natural gas detectors.

A. Dwelling units, congregate residences, and hotel or lodging houses erected within a natural
gas or oil field as identified by the State of Missouri Department of Natural Resources, shall
be provided with at least one approved detector, unless otherwise required by the Building
Official, capable of detecting natural gas. Detectors shall be installed and located in
accordance with the approved manufacturer's instructions.

B. In new construction, required natural gas detectors shall receive their primary power from
the building wiring when such wiring is served from a commercial source and shall be
equipped with a battery backup. The detector shall emit a signal when the batteries are low.
Wiring shall be permanent without a disconnecting switch other than those required for
overcurrent protection. Natural gas detectors may be solely battery operated when installed
in existing buildings; or in buildings without commercial power; or in buildings which undergo
alterations, repairs, or additions as regulated by this section.

Sec. 7-124. - Modifications.

Wherever there are practical difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions of this Code,
the Building Official shall have the authority to grant modifications for individual cases, upon
application of the owner or owner's representative, provided the Building Official shall first find
that special individual reason makes the strict letter of this Code impractical and the modification
is in compliance with the intent and purpose of this Code and that such modification does not
lessen health, accessibility, life and fire safety, or structural requirements. The details of action
granting modifications shall be recorded and entered in the files of codes administration.

Sec. 7-125. - Alternative materials, design, and methods of construction and equipment.

The provisions of this Code are not intended to prevent the installation of any material or to
prohibit any design or method of construction not specifically prescribed by this Code, provided

Page 6



BILL NO. 19-52

that any such alternative has been approved. An alternative material, design or method of
construction shall be approved where the Building Official finds that the proposed design is
satisfactory and complies with the intent of the provisions of this Code, and that the material,
method or work offered is, for the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed in
this Code in quality, strength, effectiveness, fire resistance, durability and safety.

Sec. 7-126. - Tests.

Whenever there is insufficient evidence of compliance with the provisions of this Code, or
evidence that a material or method does not conform to the requirements of this Code, or in order
to substantiate claims for alternative materials or methods, the Building Official shall have the
authority to require tests as evidence of compliance to be made at no expense to the jurisdiction.
Test methods shall be as specified in this Code or by other recognized test standards. In the
absence of recognized and accepted test methods, the Building Official shall approve the testing
procedures. Tests shall be performed by an approved agency. Reports of such tests shall be
retained by the Building Official for the period required for retention of public records.

Sec. 7-127. - Permits.

Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move,
demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to erect, install, enlarge, alter,
repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing, or elevator system,
the installation of which is regulated by this Code, or to cause any such work to be done, shall
first make application to the Building Official and obtain the required permit.

In addition, a hazardous materials permit may be required based upon the type and quantities
of materials proposed to be used or stored. When required by the fire chief, a hazardous materials
permit application must be submitted prior to the issuance of the building permit.

Sec. 7-128. - Work exempt from permit.

Exemptions from permit requirements of this Code shall not be deemed to grant authorization
for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this Code or any other laws
or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following:

A. Building:

1. Retaining walls which are not over four (4) feet (1,219 mm) in height measured from
the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or
impounding Class I, Il or lll-A liquids. In addition, the Building Official may waive the
requirements for a permit or engineered drawings for walls over four (4) feet in height
if it is deemed unnecessary to require such submittals due to the location and type
of wall to be installed.

2. Exterior decks, walkways and balconies accessory to one- and two-family dwellings
and townhouses, when no portion of the walking surface is constructed more than
thirty (30) inches (762 mm) above grade and not supporting a roof.

Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.
Temporary motion picture, television, and theater stage sets and scenery.

Swings and other playground equipment.

Page 7



BILL NO. 19-52

6. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R-3 and Group U
occupancies.

7. Movable cases, counters and partitions not over five (5) feet nine (9) inches (1,753
mm) in height.

8. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses, and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed one hundred
twenty (120) square feet.

9. Fences not over six (6) feet high.

10. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a group R-3 occupancy, which are
less than twenty-four (24) inches deep, do not exceed five thousand (5,000) gallons
and are installed entirely above grade.

11. Oil derricks.

12. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed five
thousand (5,000) gallons and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not
exceed two (2) to one.

B. Electrical:

1. Repairs and maintenance: Minor repair work, including the replacement of lamps or
the connection of approved portable electrical equipment to approved permanently
installed receptacles.

2. Radio and television transmitting stations: The provisions of this Code shall not
apply to electrical equipment used for radio and television transmissions, but does
apply to equipment and wiring for power supply, the installations of towers and
antennas.

3. Temporary testing systems: A permit shall not be required for the installation of any
temporary system required for the testing or servicing of electrical equipment or
apparatus.

C. Fuelgas:
1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliance.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or make
such equipment unsafe.

D. Mechanical:
Portable heating appliance;
Portable ventilation equipment;

Portable cooling unit;

P w0 NP

Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling equipment regulated
by this Code;

Replacement of any part which does not alter its approval or make it unsafe;

Portable evaporative cooler;

Page 8



BILL NO. 19-52

E.

F.

7. Self-contained refrigeration system containing ten (10) pounds (4.54 kg) or less of
refrigerant and actuated by motors of one horsepower (746 W) or less.

Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided, however,
that if any concealed trap, drainpipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes
defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the same with new
material, such work shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be obtained
and inspection made as provided in this Code.

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures, and
the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not involve
or require the replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes, or fixtures.

3. The replacement of water heaters in one- and two-family dwellings.

Emergency repairs. Where equipment replacements and repairs must be performed in
an emergency, the permit application shall be submitted within the next working business
day to the Building Official.

Repairs. Application or notice to the Building Official is not required for ordinary repairs
to structures, replacement of lamps or the connection of approved portable electrical
equipment to approved permanently installed receptacles. Such repairs shall not include
the cutting away of any wall, partition or portion thereof, the removal or cutting of any
structural beam or load bearing support, or the removal or change of any required means
of egress, or rearrangement of parts of a structure affecting the egress requirements;
nor shall ordinary repairs include addition to, alteration of, replacement or relocation of
any standpipe, water supply, sewer, drainage, drain leader, gas, soil, waste, vent or
similar piping, electric wiring or mechanical or other work affecting public health or
general safety.

Public service agencies. A permit shall not be required for the installation, alteration, or
repair of generation, transmission, distribution or metering or other related equipment
that is under the ownership and control of public service agencies by established right.

Sec. 7-129. - Application for permit.

To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first file an application therefore in writing on a form
furnished by the Building Official for that purpose.

Sec. 7-130. - Intent.

Sections 7-130 through 7-130.15 shall be known as "Contractor Licensing Regulations" and
shall pertain to the licensing of contractors involved in the construction of structures within the
City of Lee's Summit. The purpose of Contractor Licensing Regulations is to protect the public
health, safety, and welfare by assuring that those undertaking the construction, alteration, repair,
or demolition of structures are qualified to perform such services. It is further the intent that owner-
occupants of single-family residential structures be permitted, without first obtaining a contractor's
license, to perform minor work on such homeowner's residence.

Sec. 7-130.1. - Contractor defined.

Page 9



BILL NO. 19-52

A "contractor" shall mean any person or firm that undertakes with or for another to construct,
alter, repair, or demolish any structure or any portion thereof including every i) plumbing
contractor, ii) electrical contractor, iii) mechanical heating, ventilation, and air conditioning
("HVAC) contractor, and iv) general contractor, building contractor, and residential contractor. For
the purposes of this definition:

"Firm" shall mean any sole proprietorship, partnership, association, limited liability company,
or corporation.

The following persons shall not be considered "contractors" as defined herein:

A. An employee or agent working for and under the supervision of a contractor licensed
under this article for any type of construction being undertaken; and,

B. A homeowner who personally occupies and undertakes the construction, alteration,
repair, or maintenance of such homeowner's single-family residence or any accessory
structure thereto. Notwithstanding the foregoing, for purposes of this section, any
homeowner who undertakes the construction of a new residence for his personal
occupancy more than one time in any five (5) year period shall be deemed to be a
"contractor".

Sec. 7-130.2. - Contractor responsible for all work.

Upon issuance of a building permit to a contractor, such contractor shall be responsible for
all work undertaken pursuant to such building permit or portions thereof, including work done by
the contractor's employees, agents, and subcontractors. Said work shall be performed in
accordance with all applicable codes as adopted and amended from time to time.

Sec. 7-130.3. - Contractor insurance.

Every licensed contractor shall keep in force a policy of general liability insurance, including
completed operations coverage during the term of the building permit or during actual
construction, whichever date is later. Such insurance policy shall be written with an insurance
company licensed to do business in the State of Missouri. All contractors shall maintain general
liability coverage in an amount not less than three hundred thousand dollars ($300,000.00). In
addition, every such contractor shall procure and maintain workers compensation insurance as
required by law. Proof of insurance shall be provided at the time of licensure and shall be a current
copy of the "Certificate of Insurance" naming the City of Lee's Summit, Missouri as a certificate
holder.

Sec. 7-130.4. - Licenses authorized.

There shall be four (4) separate classes of licenses authorized for contractors as provided:

Class A—General contractor. A general contractor license shall entitle the holder thereof to
construct, remodel, demolish or repair any structure. Said contractor shall not engage in any
mechanical (HVAC), plumbing, or electrical services unless also properly licensed as a Class D
Contractor.

Class B—Building Contractor. A building contractor license shall entitle the holder thereof to
construct, remodel, demolish or repair all structures not exceeding three (3) stories in height. A
Class B License shall also entitle the license holder to perform non-structural remodeling, tenant

Page 10



BILL NO. 19-52

finish, and repairs of all structures. Said contractor shall not engage in any mechanical (HVAC),
plumbing, or electrical services unless also properly licensed as a Class D Contractor.

Class C—Residential Contractor. A Class C License shall entitle the holder thereof to
construct, remodel, demolish or repair any single family, duplex, or townhouse structure and
buildings accessory thereto. Said contractor shall not engage in any mechanical (HVAC),
plumbing, or electrical services unless also properly licensed as a Class D Contractor.

Class D—Mechanical, electrical and plumbing contractors. A Class D License shall entitle
the holder thereof to perform mechanical (HVAC) services, plumbing services, or electrical
contractor services. Said contractors shall be specifically licensed for each trade in which they
desire to perform work and shall not engage in any work entitled by Class A, Class B, or Class C
contracting services unless also properly licensed to perform said work.

Sec. 7-130.5. - Application and fee.

The Codes Administration Department shall receive and process contractor license
applications. A fee for each contractor license shall be paid prior to issuance of said license, in
accordance with the City of Lee's Summit Fee Schedule.

Sec. 7-130.6. - Renewal of license.

Every contractor license shall be issued on a one year basis to expire on June 30 ™ of the
year of expiration as noted on the license. A contractor shall be entitled to renew such contractor's
license upon satisfaction of the licensing requirements.

A. Any contractor who does not provide evidence of obtaining the required number of
continuing education units (CEU's) as required by Section 7-130.8 and wishes to renew
their contractor license shall be assessed a one hundred dollars ($100.00) renewal fee
for failure to complete required continuing education.

B. Any contractor whose license is suspended for any code-related violation must provide
satisfactory evidence to the Board of Appeals that the violation has been corrected in
accordance with the applicable Code. Failure to provide such evidence may result in the
revocation of the contractor's license.

C. When a contractor's license is revoked, a new license shall not be granted until the
contractor has provided the Board with satisfactory evidence that issuance of a new
license is warranted. If the contractor's license is revoked as the result of a code-related
violation, such contractor may not be re-licensed unless the Building Official determines
that the violation has been corrected.

Sec. 7-130.7. - Inactive license.

During the annual renewal period, a licensed contractor who has completed the annual
requirement for continuing education may, upon the payment of twenty dollars ($20.00) have the
contractor's license declared inactive. No building permit shall be issued to a contractor with an
inactive license. The holder of an inactive license may annually renew the inactive license upon
the completion of all continuing code education requirements and the payment of the annual
renewal fee. The holder of an inactive license may obtain an active contractors license at any
time upon the payment of the required business license fee.

Sec. 7-130.8. - Examinations, license approval, and issuance.

Page 11



BILL NO. 19-52

Contractor applicants shall be licensed by satisfying one or more of the following provisions:

A. Obtain or possess a certificate of competency from a nationally recognized testing
institution such as Prometric or ICC Contractor Examination Services or other
recognized equivalent with a seventy (70) percent passing score; or

B. Hold a bachelor's degree in engineering, architecture, or construction science from an
accredited college or university.

The Building Official shall expeditiously process all license applications. The Building Official
shall adopt reciprocity rules and regulations to allow persons and firms from other cities or states
to obtain a contractor's license based upon such person's or firm's Prometric or ICC Contractor
Examination Service in such other city or state. Reciprocity will be given to Johnson County,
Kansas license holders or other municipality where equivalency of licensing can be substantiated.
Eight (8) hours of continuing education units (CEU) are required for license renewals or approvals.
Every Contractor shall complete at least eight (8) hours of continuing education each calendar
year. The Building Official shall provide for the recognition of codes-related education provided
by governmental entities, trade associations, contractor education providers and others for
courses and instruction directly related to those codes adopted by the City of Lee's Summit,
Missouri.

The contractor-applicant shall disclose, at the time of application, any current or previous
contractor license held in Missouri or any other state and any disciplinary actions taken against
such contractor-applicant. If the contractor-applicant is employed by or a principal of a firm, the
application shall disclose whether the firm or the firm's employees or principals have had any
contractor-related disciplinary action taken against them in Missouri or any other state. No license
shall be issued to any contractor-applicant who has had a license suspended or revoked for
disciplinary reasons, or who has surrendered a license during any disciplinary proceeding or
investigation, within the immediately preceding five (5) years. Any contractor-applicant denied a
license under the provisions of this section may appeal such denial to the Board of Appeals.

The City of Lee's Summit will sponsor an individual for their testing by Prometric in return for
their payment of a forty-five dollars ($45.00) fee to the City. Persons requesting the City of Lee's
Summit to sponsor a master certification examination must submit a completed examination form
and documentation of three (3) years of related experience working under a person with a master
certification, or equivalent. A decision not to sponsor an applicant may be appealed in the manner
provided hereunder. The City of Lee's Summit will not sponsor persons to take examinations other
than for master certifications.

Sec. 7-130.9. - Firms/designated representatives.

A firm may obtain, in the firm's name, a contractor's license provided that such firm has at
least one full-time employee who is designated by the firm as it's representative and such
designated representative satisfies one of the requirements of Section 7-130.8. A designated
representative must spend a minimum of thirty (30) hours per week carrying out meaningful
supervision of the construction work of the firm. Whenever a building permit is issued in the name
of a firm, the firm shall be subject to these regulations and the jurisdiction of the Board of Appeals.

Sec. 7-130.10. - Business license.

Page 12



BILL NO. 19-52

It shall be unlawful for any person to engage in the construction contracting business without
first obtaining a business license as required under the applicable provisions of Chapter 28 of the
Lee's Summit Code of Ordinances.

Sec. 7-130.11. - Administrative appeals.

For the purpose of administering contractor licensing provisions, the Board of Appeals, as
established by Section 7-173, shall hear appeals of decisions rendered by the Building Official, in
accordance with the following provisions.

A. Any person directly affected by a decision of the Building Official made pursuant to
Section 7-130, and after receiving a notice or order issued under Section 7-130, shall
have the right to appeal to the Board of Appeals, provided that a written application for
appeal is filed within ten (10) days after the day the decision, notice or order was served.
If a person fails to appeal a decision within thirty (30) days as set forth in this subsection,
the decision shall be final and no appeal shall be heard. An application for appeal shall
be based on a claim that the applicable code provisions have been incorrectly interpreted
or applied, or that the decision was based on erroneous facts.

B. The following information must be contained in a written appeal made by any person
entitled to appeal pursuant to this section:

1. A brief statement in ordinary and concise language of the specific order or action
protested, together with any material facts claimed to support the contentions of the
appellant.

2. A brief statement in ordinary and concise language of the relief sought and the
reasons why it is claimed the protested order or action should be reversed, modified,
or otherwise set aside.

3. The signatures of all parties named as appellants and their official mailing
addresses.

C. Upon receipt of any appeal filed pursuant to this section, the Building Official shall
provide notice to the person of the date, time and place of hearing, where the person will
have full opportunity to present evidence and testimony in support of the person's appeal.
The hearing shall be conducted as a contested case under the provisions of Chapter
536 RSMo., and the Board of Appeals shall issue a Final Decision within ten (10) days
of the hearing date. The decision shall include written findings of fact and conclusions of
law. The decision of the Board shall be final for purposes of appeal pursuant to Chapter
536, RSMo.

Sec. 7-130.12. - Contractor discipline.

The Board of Appeals shall have the authority to admonish, reprimand, and otherwise
discipline any contractor subject to the provisions set forth in Sections 7-130 through 7-130.10,
including the suspension or revocation of the contractor's license issued under the said provisions.
Before a contractor is disciplined, a hearing shall be held following not less than ten (10) days
notice to the effected contractor. The hearing shall be conducted as a contested case under the
provisions of Chapter 536 RSMo. The Board of Appeals may suspend or revoke a contractor's
license if the Board concludes, following a hearing, that the contractor's action or inaction is:

Page 13



BILL NO. 19-52

A. A serious or repeated violation of the contractor licensing provisions, any applicable
Code, or the failure to comply within a reasonable time to any lawful written order of the
Building Official,

B. A knowing and intentional misrepresentation of a material fact made in connection with
obtaining a contractor's license or a building permit;

C. Afraudulent or deceitful use of a contractor's license to obtain a building permit;

D. A failure to obtain a building permit or to obtain a required inspection of an on-going
project as required by any applicable code;

E. Afailure to exercise regular, routine control and supervision over an on-going project for
which the contractor has obtained a building permit;

F. A failure to timely obtain a certificate of occupancy for a completed structure, prior to
occupancy, as required by the applicable building code;

G. A failure to hire a licensed electrical, plumbing, or mechanical (HVAC) contractor to
perform any electrical, plumbing, or mechanical (HVAC) work on the job site for which
the contractor obtained a building permit; or

H. Afailure by a contractor to pay the required application or licensing fee(s) for a building
permit, contractor license, or inspection fee.

Sec. 7-130.13. - Board action.

Upon a finding by a majority of the members present at the hearing that a contractor has
violated one or more of the provisions of Section 7-130.12, the Board of Appeals may admonish,
reprimand, or take other appropriate disciplinary action against such contractor including, but not
limited to:

A. Suspension of the contractor's license for a fixed period not to exceed ninety (90) days.

B. Suspension of the contractor's license for a fixed period exceeding ninety (90) days,
provided however, the contractor shall have the right to have the suspension and the
terms thereof reconsidered by the Board at the expiration of the first ninety (90) days
and every ninety (90) days thereafter to determine if just cause exists to modify or
terminate the suspension. Such reconsideration may, at the Board's option, include a
hearing.

C. Revocation of the contractor's license for a period not less than twelve (12) months from
the date of revocation. A contractor's license shall be revoked if the contractor has been
suspended five (5) times during any thirty-six (36) month period.

D. Any decision of the Board of Appeals shall be made in writing and mailed to the
contractor within ten (10) days of the hearing date. Any decision of the Board shall be
final for purposes of appeal pursuant to Chapter 536, RSMo.

Sec. 7-130.14. - Safe harbor provision.
A contractor shall not be found in violation of these provisions, nor disciplined by the Board,

for a violation of an applicable building safety code provision if the contractor performs the work
in accordance with and reliance upon duly certified plans and specifications prepared or approved

Page 14



BILL NO. 19-52

by an architect or engineer licensed in Missouri without knowledge by the contractor that such
plans and specifications, or pertinent parts thereof, are in violation of applicable Codes.

Sec. 7-130.15. - Rules and regulations.

The Board of Appeals may adopt rules, regulations, and procedures for conducting its
business.

Sec. 7-131. - Action on application.

The Building Official shall examine or cause to be examined applications for permits and
amendments thereto within a reasonable time after filing. If the application or the construction
documents do not conform to the requirements of pertinent laws, the Building Official shall reject
such application in writing, stating the reasons therefore. If the Building Official is satisfied that
the proposed work conforms to the requirements of this Code and laws and ordinances applicable
thereto, the Building Official shall issue a permit therefore as soon as practicable.

Sec. 7-132. - Time limitation of application.

An application for a permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned
one hundred eighty (180) days after the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued
in good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the Building Official is authorized to grant
one or more extensions of time for additional periods not exceeding ninety (90) days each. The
extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

Sec. 7-133. - Validity of permit.

The issuance or granting of a permit shall not be construed to be a permit for, or an approval
of, any violation of any of the provisions of this Code or of any other ordinance of the jurisdiction.
Permits presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Code or other
ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid. The issuance of a permit based on construction
documents and other data shall not prevent the Building Official from requiring the correction of
errors in the construction documents and other data. The Building Official is also authorized to
prevent occupancy or use of a structure where in violation of this Code or of any other ordinances
of this jurisdiction.

Sec. 7-134. - Expiration.

Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such
permit is commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days after its issuance, or if the work
authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of one hundred
eighty (180) days after the time the work is commenced.

Permits for exterior work, i.e., walls, fences, decks, patios, patio covers and similar type work
requiring permits, as well as permits for residential room additions and remodels shall be limited
to one hundred eighty (180) days duration. Permits for other new construction shall be limited to
one-year duration. The Building Official is authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions
of time, for periods not more than one hundred eighty (180) days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated upon finding by same that substantial
progress has been made toward completion. Substantial progress is to mean that the project is
over fifty (50) percent complete and, in the opinion of the Building Official; the project applicant
has the capability to finish the work permitted within one time period extension. If questionable,

Page 15



BILL NO. 19-52

the Building Official may require proof of performance, i.e., a list of contractors and subcontractors
under contract for the completion of the project, before the granting of the time extension. Failure
to complete a project in the time limits stated above or failure to maintain a valid permit constitutes
a violation of this Code.

Sec. 7-135. - Suspension or revocation.

The Building Official is authorized to suspend or revoke a permit issued under the provisions
of this Code wherever the permit is issued in error or based on incorrect, inaccurate, or incomplete
information, or in violation of any ordinance or regulation or any of the provisions of this Code.

Sec. 7-136. - Placement of permit.

A. All permits shall be posted to be visible from the street and kept on the site of the work until
the completion of the project.

Exceptions:

1. Permits for the construction of one- and two-family dwellings are not required to be
posted on the site when the property address is clearly identified and visible from the
street.

2. Permits for other than one- and two-family dwellings are not required to be visible from
the street when kept on the site in a location accessible to the Building Official.

B. Whenever permits are not visible from the street, the property address must be clearly
identified. Failure to clearly identify the address or display permits may result in inspections
not being performed.

Sec. 7-137. - Submittal documents.

A. Construction documents, special inspection and structural observation programs, and other
data shall be submitted in two (2) or more sets with each application for a permit. A registered
design professional licensed by the State of Missouri shall prepare the construction
documents. Where special conditions exist, the Building Official is authorized to require
additional construction documents to be prepared by a registered design professional
licensed by the State of Missouri.

B. Exception: The Building Official is authorized to waive the submission of construction
documents and other data not required to be prepared by a registered design professional if
it is found that the nature of the work applied for is such that reviewing of construction
documents is not necessary to obtain compliance with this Code.

Sec. 7-138. - Information on construction documents.

Construction documents shall be dimensioned and drawn upon suitable material.
Construction documents shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the location, nature and extent of
the work proposed and show in detail that it will conform to the provisions of this Code and relevant
laws, ordinances, rules and regulations, as determined by the Building Official. The construction
documents shall show in sufficient detail the location, construction, size, and character of all
portions of the means of egress in compliance with the provisions of this Code. In other than
occupancies in Groups R-2, R-3, and I-1, the construction documents shall designate the number
of occupants to be accommodated on every floor, and in all rooms and spaces. Construction

Page 16



BILL NO. 19-52

documents for all buildings shall describe the exterior wall envelope in sufficient detail to
determine compliance with this Code.

Sec. 7-139. - Fire protection system shop drawings.

Shop drawings for the fire protection system(s) shall be submitted to indicate conformance
with this Code and the construction documents and shall be approved before the start of system
installation. Shop drawings shall contain all information as required by the referenced installation
standards in this Code.

Sec. 7-140. - Site plan.

There shall be a site plan showing to scale the size and location of all the new construction
and all existing structures on the site including but not limited to easements, distances from lot
lines, established street grades, existing and proposed finished grades, drainage swales and
proposed storm water drainage flow patterns for the site. In addition to identifying flow patterns
proposed for the site, flow patterns for areas five (5) feet adjacent to property lines of the site shall
be shown. Proposed finished grades and storm water drainage flow patterns for the site shall
conform to the Master Drainage Plan for the development unless otherwise approved by the
Building Official. All decks, balconies, overhangs, or other building protrusions shall be indicated
and dimensioned. In the case of partial demolition, the plot plan shall show all construction to be
demolished and the location and size of all existing structures and construction that are to remain
on the site of the plot. The Building Official is authorized to waive or modify the requirement for a
site plan when the application for permit is for alteration or repair and does not affect the exterior
features of the building.

Sec. 7-141. - Examination of documents.

The Building Official shall examine or cause to be examined the accompanying construction
documents and shall ascertain by such examinations whether the construction indicated and
described is in accordance with the requirements of this Code and other pertinent laws or
ordinances. Fees shall be assessed at the time the building permit is issued for such examination.
Such fee shall be based on the City of Lee's Summit Fee Schedule. The Building Official reserves
the right to have such examination performed by a third party when deemed necessary. Any plan
review fees associated with a third party examination will be assessed to the cost of the permit
unless other arrangements have been approved and properly documented by the Building Official.

Sec. 7-142. - Approval of construction documents.

When the Building Official issues a permit, the construction documents shall be stamped
"Released For Construction.” The Building Official shall retain one set of construction documents
in accordance with State record retention regulations. The other set shall be returned to the
applicant, shall be kept at the site of work and shall be open to inspection by the Building Official
or his or her authorized representative. Failure to maintain City stamped construction documents
on site may result in inspections not being performed.

Sec. 7-143. - Previous approvals.

This Code shall not require changes in the construction documents, construction or
designated occupancy of a structure for which a lawful permit has been heretofore issued or

Page 17



BILL NO. 19-52

otherwise lawfully authorized, and the construction of which has been pursued in good faith within
one hundred eighty (180) days after the effective date of this Code and has not been abandoned.

Sec. 7-144. - Phased approval.

The Building Official is authorized to issue a permit for the construction of foundations or any
other part of a building or structure before the construction documents for the whole building or
structure have been submitted, provided that adequate information and detailed statements have
been filed complying with pertinent requirements of this Code. The holder of such permit for the
foundation or other parts of a building or structure shall proceed at the holder's own risk with the
building operation and without assurance that a permit for the entire structure will be granted.

Sec. 7-145. - Design professional in responsible charge.

When it is required that documents be prepared by a registered design professional, the
Building Official shall be authorized to require the owner to engage and designate on the building
permit application a registered design professional who shall act as the registered design
professional in responsible charge. If the circumstances require, the owner shall designate a
substitute registered design professional in responsible charge who shall perform the duties
required of the original registered design professional in responsible charge. The owner shall
notify the Building Official in writing if the registered design professional in responsible charge is
changed or is unable to continue to perform the duties. The registered design professional in
responsible charge shall be responsible for reviewing and coordinating submittal documents
prepared by others, including phased and deferred submittal items, for compatibility with the
design of the building. Where structural observation is required by this Code, the inspection
program shall name the individual or firms who are to perform structural observation and describe
the stages of construction at which structural observation is to occur.

Sec. 7-146. - Deferred submittals.

For the purposes of this section, deferred submittals are defined as those portions of the
design that are not submitted at the time of the application and that are to be submitted to the
Building Official within a specified period. Deferral of any submittal items shall have the prior
approval of the Building Official. The registered design professional in responsible charge shall
list the deferred submittals on the construction documents for review by the Building Official.
Submittal documents for deferred submittal items shall be submitted to the registered design
professional in responsible charge who shall review them and forward them to the Building Official
with a notation indicating that the deferred submittal documents have been reviewed and that
they have been found to be in general conformance with the design of the building. The deferred
submittal items shall not be installed until the Building Official has approved their design and
submittal documents.

Sec. 7-147. - Amended construction documents.
Work shall be installed in accordance with the reviewed construction documents, and any

changes made during construction that are not in compliance with the approved construction
documents shall be resubmitted for approval as an amended set of construction documents.

Sec. 7-148. - Temporary structures and uses general.

Page 18



BILL NO. 19-52

The Building Official is authorized to issue a permit for temporary structures and temporary
uses. Such permits shall be limited as to time of service and in accordance with the requirements
of the ordinances of the City of Lee's Summit. The Building Official is authorized to grant
extensions for demonstrated cause.

Sec. 7-149. - Conformance.

Temporary structures and uses shall conform to the structural strength, fire safety, means of
egress, accessibility, light, ventilation and sanitary requirements of this Code as necessary to
ensure the public health, safety and general welfare.

Sec. 7-150. - Temporary power.

The Building Official is authorized to give permission to temporarily supply and use power in
part of an electric installation before such installation has been fully completed and the final
certificate of completion has been issued. The part covered by the temporary certificate shall
comply with the requirements specified for temporary lighting, heat, or power in the National
Electrical Code.

Sec. 7-151. - Termination of approval.

The Building Official is authorized to terminate such permit for a temporary structure or use
and to order the temporary structure or use to be discontinued.

Sec. 7-152. - Payment of fees.

A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by law have been paid. Nor shall an
amendment to a permit be released until the additional fee, if any, has been paid.

Sec. 7-153. - Schedule of permit fees.

On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations
requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid prior to issuance of said permit, in
accordance with the City of Lee's Summit Fee Schedule.

Sec. 7-154. - Building permit valuations.

The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit value at time of application.
Permit valuations shall include total value of work, including materials and labor, for which the
permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing equipment, and permanent
systems. If in the opinion of the Building Official, the valuation is underestimated on the application
the valuation shall be determined by using the most current Building Valuation Data Table
published by the International Code Council as a guide.

Sec. 7-155. - Work commencing before permit issuance.

Any person who commences any work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical,
elevator equipment, or plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject
to an additional fee equal to the amount of the permit as established by the City of Lee's Summit
Fee Schedule. The payment of such fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all
other provisions of this Code nor from any penalty prescribed by law. Work that has commenced

Page 19



BILL NO. 19-52

on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical, elevator equipment, or plumbing system
before obtaining the necessary permits constitutes a violation of this Code.

Sec. 7-156. - Related fees.

The payment of the fee for the construction, alteration, removal or demolition for work done
in connection with or concurrently with the work authorized by a building permit shall not relieve
the applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of other fees that are prescribed by law.

Sec. 7-157. - Refunds.

The Building Official may authorize refunding of any fee paid hereunder, which was
erroneously paid or collected. The Building Official may authorize refunding of not more than
eighty (80) percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this Code. The Building Official shall not authorize refunding of any fee paid
except on written application filed by the original permittee.

Sec. 7-158. - Inspections general.

Construction or work for which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by the
Building Official and such construction or work shall remain accessible and exposed for inspection
purposes until approved. Approval because of an inspection shall not be construed to be an
approval of a violation of the provisions of this Code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction.
Inspections presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Code or of other
ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not be valid. It shall be the duty of the permit applicant to cause
the work to remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes. Neither the Building Official
nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement of any
material required to allow inspection.

Sec. 7-159. - Preliminary inspection.

Before issuing a permit, the Building Official is authorized to examine or cause to be
examined buildings, structures and sites for which an application has been filed.

Sec. 7-160. - Required inspections.

The Building Official, upon notification, shall make the inspections set forth in this Code and
the policies and procedures for required inspections.

A. Footing or foundation inspection. Footing and foundation inspections shall be made after
excavations for footings are complete and any required reinforcing steel is in place. For
concrete foundations, any required forms shall be in place before inspection. Materials
for the foundation shall be on the job, except where concrete is ready mixed in
accordance with ASTM C 94, the concrete need not be on the job.

Exception: Foundations for one- and two-family dwellings and accessory structures less
than ten (10) feet in height.

B. Suspended concrete slab or under-floor inspection. Suspended concrete slab and
under-floor inspections shall be made after in-slab or under-floor reinforcing steel and
building service equipment, conduit, piping accessories and other ancillary equipment

Page 20



BILL NO. 19-52

items are in place, but before any concrete is placed or floor sheathing installed, including
the sub floor.

C. Elevation/grading survey. An "as built" grading survey and elevation certification for
each individual lot shall be prepared by a registered land surveyor after utility installation,
final grading and all associated storm water drainage improvements required for the site
have been completed unless specifically waived by the Building Official and City
Engineer or their designated representatives, after, by visual inspection they have
determined that proper drainage is being achieved. The survey shall include information
necessary to substantiate conformance with the Master Drainage Plan. Said survey shall
be submitted and approved prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy.

D. Frame inspection. Framing inspections shall be made after the roof deck or sheathing,
all framing, fire blocking and bracing are in place and pipes, chimneys and vents to be
concealed are complete and the rough electrical, plumbing, heating wires, pipes and
ducts are approved.

E. Lath or gypsum board inspection. Lath and gypsum board inspections shall be made
after lathing and gypsum board, interior and exterior, is in place, but before any plastering
is applied or before gypsum board joints and fasteners are taped and finished.

Exceptions:

1. Gypsum board that is not part of a fire-resistive assembly or a shear assembly.
2. One- and two-family dwellings.

F. Fire-resistant penetrations. Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-resistance-rated
assemblies shall not be concealed from view until inspected and approved.

G. Other inspections. In addition to the inspections specified above, the Building Official is
authorized to make or require other inspections of any construction work to ascertain
compliance with the provisions of this Code and other laws that are enforced by the
Building Official.

H. Special inspections. Special inspections as required by this Code and the Building
Official.

I.  Fire protection inspections. Inspection of all fire protection systems.

J. Final inspection. The final inspection shall be made after all work required by the building
permit is completed.

K. Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed in accordance with the City's
Schedule of Fees, for each inspection or reinspection when such portion of work for
which inspection is called is not complete or when corrections called for are not made.
This subsection is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job
is rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this Code, but as controlling the
practice of calling for inspection before the job is ready for such inspection or
reinspection. For the purpose of this section, reinspection fees will be assessed on the
second reinspection if corrections have not been made or work is not ready for
inspection. Reinspection fees may be assessed for failure to comply with: The provision
of Section 7-136, Placement of permit, the approved plans are not available to the
inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested, or

Page 21



BILL NO. 19-52

for deviating from plans requiring the approval of the Building Official. A temporary
certificate of occupancy may be issued with reinspection fees outstanding; however, no
permit will be finaled out or receive a full certificate of occupancy without all associated
fees being received.

Sec. 7-161. - Inspection agencies.

The Building Official is authorized to accept reports of approved inspection agencies,
provided such agencies satisfy the requirements as to qualifications and reliability.

Sec. 7-162. - Inspection requests.

It shall be the duty of the holder of the permit or their duly authorized agent to notify the
Building Official when work is ready for inspection. It shall be the duty of the permit holder to
provide access to and means for inspection of such work for any inspections that are required by
this Code. Inspection requests shall be made in advance and in accordance with the most current
written policies of the Codes Administration Department.

Sec. 7-163. - Approval required.

Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each successive inspection without first
obtaining the approval of the Building Official. The Building Official, upon natification, shall make
the requested inspections and shall either indicate the portion of the construction that is
satisfactory as completed, or shall notify the permit holder or an agent of the permit holder wherein
the same fails to comply with this Code. Any portions that do not comply shall be corrected and
such portion shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by the Building Official.

Sec. 7-164. - Use and occupancy.

No building or structure shall be used or occupied, and no change in the existing occupancy
classification of a building or structure or portion thereof shall be made until the Building Official
has issued a certificate of occupancy therefore as provided herein. Issuance of a certificate of
occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of the provisions of this Code or
of other ordinances of the City of Lee's Summit.

Sec. 7-165. - Change in uses.

Changes in the character or use of an existing structure shall not be made except as specified
in this Code. The Building Official may require a design professional registered within the state of
Missouri perform a code analysis and submit plans and/or other information as deemed necessary
to determine the proposed use will be in compliance with this Code.

Sec. 7-166. - Certificate issued.

It shall be the responsibility of the permit holder to request a final inspection and to apply for
a certificate of occupancy when required. The permit holder shall be excused from this
responsibility only if the owner of property has applied for and secured a certificate of occupancy.
After the Building Official inspects the building or structure and finds no violations of the provisions
of this Code or other laws that are enforced by the Building Official, the Building Official shall issue
a certificate of occupancy.

Sec. 7-167. - Posting the certificate of occupancy.

Page 22



BILL NO. 19-52

The certificate of occupancy, or a copy, shall be posted in a conspicuous place on the
premises and shall not be removed except by the Building Official.

Exception: R-1, R-2 and R-3 occupancies.

Sec. 7-168. - Temporary occupancy.

The Building Official is authorized to issue a temporary certificate of occupancy before the
completion of the entire work covered by the permit, provided that such portion or portions shall
be occupied safely. The Building Official shall set a time period during which the temporary
certificate of occupancy is valid.

Sec. 7-169. - Revocation.

The Building Official is authorized to, in writing, suspend or revoke a certificate of occupancy
or completion issued under the provisions of this Code wherever the certificate is issued in error,
or on the basis of incorrect information supplied, or where it is determined that the building or
structure or portion thereof is in violation of any ordinance or regulation or any of the provisions
of this Code.

Sec. 7-170. - Connection of service utilities.

No person shall make new connections from any source of energy, fuel, or power to any
building or system that is regulated by this Code for which a permit is required, until released by
the Building Official.

Sec. 7-171. - Temporary connection.

The Building Official shall have the authority to authorize the temporary connection of the
building or system to the source of energy, fuel, or power.

Sec. 7-172. - Authority to disconnect service utilities.

The Building Official shall have the authority to authorize disconnection of utility service to
the building, structure or system regulated by this Code and the codes referenced in case of
emergency where necessary to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or property. The Building
Official shall notify the serving utility, and wherever possible the owner and occupant of the
building, structure or service system of the decision to disconnect before taking such action. If not
notified prior to disconnecting, the owner or occupant of the building, structure or service system
shall be notified in writing, as soon as practical thereafter.

Sec. 7-173. - Board of appeals.

In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
Building Official and fire chief relative to the application and interpretation of this Code, there shall
be and is hereby created a board of appeals. The board of appeals shall consist of seven (7)
members and two (2) alternates appointed by the mayor with the advice and consent of the
council, to serve for a period of three (3) years, unless removed sooner for cause. The board of
appeals shall hold office at its pleasure. The board shall adopt appropriate rules of procedure for
conducting its business.

Page 23



BILL NO. 19-52

A. Qualifications. The members of the board of appeals shall consist of persons qualified
by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction, skilled
in diversified building or construction trades or professions such as architect, engineer,
builder, general contractor, licensed master contractor and one layman to represent the
general public. Employees of the City of Lee's Summit, are prohibited from being
members of the board.

B. Limitations on authority. An application for appeal to the board of appeals shall be based
on a claim that the true intent of this Code or the rules legally adopted thereunder has
been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this Code do not fully apply, or an equally
good or better form of construction is proposed. The board of appeals shall have no
authority to waive requirements of this Code or the Fire Code. The board of appeals may
recommend waivers of this Code to the City Council, which may waive requirements of
this Code.

C. Fee for appeal. Any person who appeals an order, decision, or determination made by
the Building Official or fire chief, relative to the application and interpretation of this Code,
shall file an application and pay a fee in accordance with the City of Lee's Summit, Fee
Schedule.

Sec. 7-174. - Unlawful acts.

It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, construct, alter, extend, repair,
move, remove, demolish or occupy any building, structure or equipment regulated by this Code,
or cause same to be done, in conflict with or in violation of any of the provisions of this Code.

Sec. 7-175. - Notice of violation.

The Building Official is authorized to serve a notice of violation or order on the person
responsible for the erection, construction, alteration, extension, repair, moving, removal,
demolition or occupancy of a building or structure in violation of the provisions of this Code, or in
violation of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this Code. Such order shall direct
the discontinuance of the illegal action or condition and the abatement of the violation.

Sec. 7-176. - Prosecution of violation.

If the notice of violation is not complied with within the established abatement period, the
Code Official is authorized to request the City of Lee's Summit Law Department to institute the
appropriate proceeding at law or in equity to restrain, correct or abate such violation, or to require
the removal or termination of the unlawful occupancy of the structure in violation of the provisions
of this Code or of the order or direction made pursuant thereto.

Sec. 7-177. - Violation penalties.

Any person who shall violate a provision of this Code or fail to comply therewith or with any
of the requirements of this Code or who erects, constructs, alters, or repairs a building or structure
in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building Official or fire chief,
or acts in violation of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be
punished by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonment not
exceeding ninety (90) days or both such fine and imprisonment, and any other penalties
prescribed by law. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be
deemed a separate offense.

Page 24



BILL NO. 19-52

Sec. 7-178. - Stop work order.

Whenever the Building Official finds any work regulated by this Code being performed in a
manner contrary to the provisions of this Code or other City of Lee's Summit Ordinances or in a
dangerous or unsafe manner, the Building Official is authorized to issue a stop work order.

Sec. 7-179. - Issuance of stop work order.

The stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property involved
or to the owner's agent, to the person doing the work or posted upon the property. Upon issuance
of a stop work order, the cited work shall immediately cease or as otherwise determined by the
Building Official. The stop work order shall state the reason for the order, and the conditions under
which the cited work will be permitted to resume. Any violation of a stop work order will constitute
a violation of this Code.

Sec. 7-180. - Unlawful continuance.

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition,
shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.

Sec. 7-181. - Unsafe structures and equipment conditions.

Structures or existing equipment that are or hereafter become unsafe, unsanitary or deficient
because of inadequate means of egress facilities, inadequate light and ventilation, or which
constitute a fire hazard, or are otherwise dangerous to human life or the public welfare, or which
involve illegal or improper occupancy or inadequate maintenance, shall be deemed an unsafe
condition. Unsafe structures shall be taken down and removed or made safe, as the Building
Official deems necessary and as provided for in this section. A vacant structure that is not secured
against entry shall be deemed unsafe.

Sec. 7-182. - Record.

The Building Official shall cause a report to be filed on an unsafe condition. The report shall
state the occupancy of the structure and the nature of the unsafe condition.

Sec. 7-183. - Notice.

If an unsafe condition is found, the Building Official shall serve on the owner, agent or person
in control of the structure, a written notice that describes the condition deemed unsafe and
specifies the required repairs or improvements to be made to abate the unsafe condition, or that
requires the unsafe structure to be demolished within a stipulated time. Such notice shall require
the person thus notified to declare immediately to the Building Official acceptance or rejection of
the terms of the order.

Sec. 7-184. - Method of service.

Such notice shall be deemed properly served if a copy thereof is (a) delivered to the owner
personally; (b) sent by certified or registered mail addressed to the owner at the last known
address with the return receipt requested; or (c) delivered in any other manner as prescribed by
local law or posted upon the property. If the certified or registered letter is returned showing that
the letter was not delivered, a copy thereof shall be posted in a conspicuous place in or about the

Page 25



BILL NO. 19-52

structure affected by such notice. Service of such notice in the foregoing manner upon the owner's
agent or upon the person responsible for the structure shall constitute service of notice upon the
owner.

Sec. 7-185. - Restoration.

The structure or equipment determined to be unsafe by the Building Official is permitted to
be restored to a safe condition. To the extent that repairs, alterations, or additions are made or a
change of occupancy occurs during the restoration of the structure, such repairs, alterations,
additions, or change of occupancy shall comply with the requirements of this Code.

Secs. 7-186—7-199. - Reserved.

ARTICLE Il. - BUILDING CODE
Sec. 7-200. - International Building Code adopted.

The 2018 IBC, including Appendices C and I, and the most current errata as published by
the International Code Council from time to time, is hereby adopted and incorporated in this
chapter as fully as if set forth herein, except for those parts or portions thereof as are
specifically added or amended by the language below.

Sec. 7-201. - International Building Code deleted; Chapter 1. Administration.

Chapter 1, Administration is hereby deleted. See Article | of this chapter.

Sec. 7-202. - International Building Code amended; Section 405.1. General.

Section 405.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Exception 7. Structures as defined in
the LSCO Chapter 7, Section 7-1300 Subterranean Space Building and Fire Code.

Sec. 7-203- International Building Code amended; Section 423.4. Storm Shelters.

Section 423.4 is hereby amended to add the following language: Exception 4. Group E
occupancies that undergo alterations or additions where the cost of compliance with ICC
500 Section 702 is greater than 20% of the total project cost may omit the requirements of
ICC 500 Section 702 only.

Sec. 7-204. - International Building Code amended; Section 501.2. Premises identification.
Section 501.2 is hereby amended to add the following language: In multi-tenant commercial
buildings where tenants have multiple entrances located on different sides of the building,

each door shall be addressed. Address characters shall be capable of being illuminated by
an internal or external lighting source.

Page 26



BILL NO. 19-52

Sec. 7-205. - International Building Code amended; Section 901.5. Acceptance test.

Section 901.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: Fire detection and alarm systems,
fire extinguishing systems, fire hydrant systems, fire standpipe systems, fire pump systems,
private fire service main and all other fire protection systems and appurtenances thereto shall
be subject to acceptance test(s) as contained in the installation standards and as approved
by the Code Official. The Code Official shall be notified forty-eight (48) hours before any
required acceptance testing.

Sec. 7-206. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.4. Group F.

Section 903.2.4 Group F is hereby amended to read as follows:Group F-1. An
automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings containing a Group F-
1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1.
2.
3.

A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m2).
A Group F-1 fire area is located more than two stories above grade plane.

The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2).

A Group F-1 occupancy used for the manufacture of upholstered furniture or
mattresses exceeds 2,500 square feet (232 m2).

Sec. 7-207. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.7. Group M.

Section 903.2.7 is hereby amended as follows: An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following
conditions exist:

1.
2.
3.

A Group M fire area exceeds twelve thousand (12,000) square feet (1,115 m 2).
A Group M fire area is located more than two (2) stories above grade plane.

The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds twenty-four thousand (24,000) square feet (2,230 m 2).

A Group M occupancy used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or
mattresses exceed five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

Sec. 7-208. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.9. Group S-1.

Section 903.2.9 is hereby amended to read as follows: An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout all buildings containing a group S-1 occupancy where one of
the following conditions exists:

1.

2.
3.

Where a group S-1 fire area exceeds twelve thousand (12,000) square feet (1,115
m?).

A group S-1 fire area is located more than two (2) stories above grade.

The combined area of all group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds twenty-four thousand (24,000) square feet (2,230 m 2).

Page 27



BILL NO. 19-52

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial trucks or buses where the
fire area exceeds five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

5. A Group S-1 occupancy used for the storage of upholstered furniture or mattresses
exceeds two thousand five hundred (2,500) square feet (232 m 2).

Sec. 7-209. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.9.1. Repair garages.

Section 903.2.9.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout all buildings used as repair garages in accordance with Section
406, as shown:

1. Buildings two (2) or more stories in height, including basements, with a fire area
containing a repair garage exceeding five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

2. Buildings no more than one story above grade plane with a fire area containing a
repair garage exceeding five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

3. Buildings with a repair garages servicing vehicles parked in basements.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the repair of commercial trucks or buses where the
fire area exceeds five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

Sec. 7-210. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.11.3. Buildings 55 feet
or more in height.

Section 903.2.11.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Buildings more than two
stories in height. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout buildings with a
floor level more than two stories above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

Exceptions:
1. Open parking garages"

Sec. 7-211. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.3.7. Fire Department
connection.

Section 903.3.7 is hereby amended to read as follows: The location of Fire Department
connections shall be approved by the Fire Code Official. Connections shall be four-inch Storz
type fittings and located within one hundred (100) feet of a fire hydrant, or as approved by
the Fire Code Official.

Sec. 7-212. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.4. Sprinkler system
supervision and alarms.

Section 903.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: Valves controlling the water supply
for automatic sprinkler systems, pumps, tanks, water levels and temperatures, critical air
pressures and waterflow switches on all sprinkler systems shall be electrically supervised by
a listed fire alarm control unit.

Exceptions:

1. Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one- and two family dwellings.

Page 28



BILL NO. 19-52

Limited area sprinkler systems in accordance with Section 903.3.8.

Automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13R where a

common supply main is used to supply both domestic water and the automatic

sprinkler system, and a separate shutoff valve for the automatic sprinkler system is

not provided.

4. Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or locked in the open position.

5. Control valves to commercial kitchen hoods, paint spray booths or dip tanks that are
sealed or locked in the open position.

6. Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire pump engines that are sealed or locked in
the open position.

7. Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, preaction and deluge sprinkler systems that
are sealed or locked in the open position.

8. Isolation valves for the backflow prevention devices remotely located in pits which

are locked and/or chained in the open position.

wnN

Sec. 7-213. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.4.2. Alarms.

Section 903.4.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: One all-weather horn/strobe shall
be connected to every automatic sprinkler system on the exterior of the building above the
FD connection or in an approved location. Such sprinkler water-flow alarm devices shall be
activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size
installed in the system. Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic
sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system. Interior alarm notification
appliances shall be installed as required by Section 903.4.2.1.

Sec. 7-214. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.4.2.1. Notification device.

Section 903.4.2.1 is hereby added to read as follows: Where an automatic fire sprinkler
system is installed in a building, audible and visible notification appliances shall be installed
throughout the building as follows:

1. Audible natification appliances shall be installed so as to be audible at fifteen (15)
dBa above sound pressure level throughout the building.

2. Visible notification appliances shall be installed in all public and common use areas,
restrooms and corridors in accordance with the spacing requirements of NFPA 72.

3. Visible natification devices can be eliminated in nhormally unoccupied portions of
buildings where permitted by the Fire Code Official.

Exception: The requirements of this section do not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.
Sec. 7-215. - International Building Code amended; Section 905.3. Required installations.

Section 905.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Standpipe systems shall be
provided in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 905.2 through 905.11,
and as required by the fire code official. In buildings used for high-piled combustible
storage, fire protection shall be in accordance with Chapter 32.

Sec. 7-216. - International Building Code amended; Section 905.3.1. Height.

Section 905.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Class Il standpipe systems shall
be installed throughout buildings where any of the following conditions exist:

Page 29



BILL NO. 19-52

Three or more stories are above or below grade plane.

2. The floor level of the highest story is located more than two stories above the
lowest level of the fire department vehicle access.

3. The floor level of the lowest story is located more than two stories below the
highest level of fire department vehicle access.

Exceptions:

1. Class | standpipes are allowed in buildings equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

Class | standpipes are allowed in Group B and E occupancies.

Class | manual standpipes are allowed in open parking garages where the highest
floor is located not more than 150 feet (45 720 mm) above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access.

wnN

4. Class | manual dry standpipes are allowed in open parking garages that are
subject to freezing temperatures, provided that the hose connections are located
as required for Class Il standpipes in accordance with Section 905.5.

5. Class | standpipes are allowed in basements equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system.

6. Class | standpipes are allowed in buildings where occupant-use hose lines will not
be utilized by trained personnel or the fire department.

7. In determining the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, it shall not be
required to consider either of the following:

a. Recessed loading docks for four vehicles or less.
b. Conditions where topography makes access from the fire department
vehicle to the building impractical or impossible.

8. Standpipe systems are not required in Group R-3 occupancies and Group R-2
occupancies 3 stories or less where individual units egress directly to the exterior
or unenclosed stairwells, and the building is equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system.

Sec. 7-217. - International Building Code amended; Section 905.3.4.1. Hose and cabinet.
Section 905.3.4.1 is hereby deleted.

Sec. 7-218. - International Building Code amended; Section 905.3.5. Underground
buildings.

Section 905.3.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: Underground buildings shall be
equipped throughout with a Class | automatic wet or manual wet standpipe system.
Subterranean spaces developed by the extraction of subsurface material from underground
spaces shall also be regulated by the City of Lee's Summit Subterranean Building and Fire
Code.

Sec. 7-219. - International Building Code amended; Section 907.2.7.1. Occupant
notification.

Page 30



BILL NO. 19-52

Section 907.2.7.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: During times that the building
is occupied, the initiation of a signal from a manual fire alarm box or from a water flow switch
shall not be required to activate the alarm notification appliances when an alarm signal is
activated at a constantly attended location from which evacuation instructions shall be
initiated over an emergency voice/alarm communication system installed in accordance with
Section 907.5.2.2 and only when approved by the Fire Code Official.

Sec. 7-220. - International Building Code amended; Section 912.2 Location.

Section 912 Location is hereby amended to read as follows: With respect to hydrants,
driveways, buildings and landscaping, fire department connections shall be so located that
fire apparatus and hose connected to supply the system will not obstruct access to the
buildings for other fire apparatus. The location of fire department connections shall be
within 100 feet of an approved fire hydrant or as approved by the fire code official.

Sec. 7-221. - International Building Code amended; Section 1010.1.9.4 Locks & Latches

Section 1010.1.9.4 Locks & Latches shall be amended as follows:

"Locks and latches shall be permitted to prevent operation of doors where any of the
following exist:

1. Places of detention or restraint.

2. Where egress doors are used in pairs, approved automatic flush bolts shall be
permitted to be used, provided that the door leaf having the automatic flush bolts does
not have a doorknob or surface-mounted hardware.

3. Doors from individual dwelling or sleeping units of Group R occupancies having an
occupant load of 10 or less are permitted to be equipped with a night latch, dead bolt or
security chain, provided such devices are openable from the inside without the use of a
key or tool.

4. Fire doors after the minimum elevated temperature has disabled the unlatching
mechanism in accordance with listed fire door test procedures.

5. Doors serving roofs not intended to be occupied shall be permitted to be locked,
preventing entry to the building from the roof."

Sec. 7-222. - International Building Code amended; Section 1015.2. Guards.

Section 1015.2 Where Required is hereby amended to add the following: Guards are required
at retaining walls over 30”above grade when walking surfaces are within (10) feet of the high
side of the retaining wall.

Exceptions remain unchanged.
Sec. 7-223. - International Building Code amended; Chapter 13. Energy efficiency.

Chapter 13 of the 2018 IBC is hereby deleted.

Page 31



BILL NO. 19-52

Sec. 7-224. - International Building Code amended; Table 1505.1.
Table 1505.1 is hereby amended by deleting footnotes a, b, and ¢ from the table.
Sec. 7-225. - International Building Code Amended; Section 1505.5. Non-classified roofing.

Section 1505.5 is amended to read as follows: Non-classified roofing shall not be
installed unless utilized for the repair of ten (10) percent or less of the total roof covering in
any three-year period.

Sec. 7-226. - International Building Code Amended; Section 1511.1. Reroofing.

Section 1511.1. Reroofing is amended to add the following: Re-roofing includes any repairs
of more than 10% or less of the total roof covering in any three year period. A repair of 10%
or less of the total roof covering in any three year period may utilize approved roofing
materials comparable to the existing roofing materials.

Sec. 7-227. - International Building Code amended; Section 1804.4.1 Site Grading.

Section 1804.4.1 Site Grading shall be amended to add the following language:

A. Alldrainage facilities shall be designed to carry waters to the nearest drainage way,
storm sewer conveyance, or other approved point of collection and conveyance.
Erosion of ground in the area of discharge shall be prevented by installation of
erosive control devices. Unless specified drainage ways and swales are specifically
approved by the Building Official, abutting property lines between structures shall
be designed to function as drainage ways. The toe of slopes shall set back from the
property line a minimum of one foot. The area surrounding the building foundation
shall have a drainage gradient as provided for in the International Building Code, as
amended from time to time with draining gradient thereafter of not less than two (2)
percent toward approved drainage facilities unless waived by the Building Official.

B. Prohibited conduct: No person shall allow or cause any:

1. Obstruction to be created, installed or maintained within any drainage way,
detention facility, or engineered swale which will create ponding on adjacent
property, divert water onto the adjoining property, or impede drainage. Fences
may be erected in such areas provided they do not unnecessarily restrict the
flow of water.

2. Water form intermittent sources such as discharges from sump pumps,
downspouts, foundation drains, swimming pools, swimming pool backwashes,
or other similar sources excluding lawn sprinklers to be discharged closer than
five (5) feet from any adjoining property line.

C. Enforcement: Where such conditions exist and the Code Official has given written
notice of the violation, the owner of the property shall take appropriate measures to
eliminate the problems caused on the adjacent property, within the time period
stated on the notice, and failure to do so shall be a violation of this chapter.

Page 32



BILL NO. 19-52

Sec. 7-228. - International Building Code amended; Section 1805.4. Subsoil Drainage
System

Section 1805.4. Subsoil Drainage System amended to add the following: Where
foundations retain earth and enclose habitable or usable space located below grade, drains
shall be provided below the floor slab. Drainage tiles, perforated pipe or other approved
systems or materials shall be installed at or below the area(s) to be protected; shall be placed
with positive or neutral slope to minimize the accumulation of deposits in the drainage system;
and shall discharge by gravity or mechanical means to an approved storm water drainage
system. The under-slab drainage system shall be installed around the inner perimeter of the
area(s) to be protected, or, in a manner that will provide adequate drainage for all area(s) to
be protected and is approved by the Building Official. Interior underslab drains installed on
uncompacted fill material shall be supported by mechanical means which are adequately tied
into the concrete slab to ensure proper drainage throughout the underslab drain(s).

Sec. 7-229. - International Building Code amended; Section 3109 Swimming
Pools/Spas/Hot Tubs.

Section 3109 Swimming Pools/Spas/Hot Tubs will be deleted.
ARTICLE Ill. - ELECTRICAL CODE
Sec. 7-300. - National Electrical Code adopted.

The 2017 edition of the National Electrical Code as published by the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA No. 70-2017) is hereby adopted and incorporated in this chapter as fully
as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as are specifically added
or amended as stated below.

Sec. 7-301. - National Electrical Code amended; Section 210.8(A)(5). Unfinished portions
or areas of the basement not intended as habitable rooms

Section 210.8(A)(5) is hereby amended to read as follows: All 125-volt, single phase, 15-
and 20- ampere receptacles installed in unfinished basements shall have ground fault
circuit interrupter protection for personnel. For the purposes of this section, unfinished
basements are defined as portions or areas of the basement not intended as habitable
rooms and limited to storage areas, work areas, and the like.

Exceptions:

1. Receptacles that are not readily accessible such as a ceiling mounted receptacle for
a garage door opener.

2. A single receptacle supplied by a dedicated branch circuit that is located and
identified for a specific use by a cord-and-plug-connected appliance such as a
refrigerator, freezer or sump pump.

Page 33



BILL NO. 19-52

3. Areceptacle supplying only a permanently installed fire alarm or burglar alarm
system.

Sec. 7-302. - National Electrical Code amended; Section 210.52(C)(5). Receptacle Outlet
Location.

Section 210.52(C)(5) is hereby amended to read as follows: Receptacle outlets shall be
located not more than 20 inches (508 mm) above the countertop or work surface.
Receptacle outlet assemblies installed in countertops and work surfaces shall be listed for
use in countertops or work surfaces. Receptacle outlets rendered not readily accessible by
appliances fastened in place, appliance garages, sinks or rangetops as covered in
210.52(C)(1), Exception, or appliances occupying dedicated space shall not be considered
as these required outlets.

EXCEPTION: Receptacle outlets shall be permitted to be mounted not more than 12 inches
(305 mm) below the countertop or work surface in construction designed for the physically
impaired or for island and peninsular countertops or work surface where the surface is flat
across its entire surface and the are no means to mount a receptacle within 20 inches (508
mm) above the countertop, such as in an overhead cabinet. Receptacles mounted below
the countertop or work surface in accordance with this section shall not be located where
the countertop or work surface extends more than 6 inches (152 mm) beyond its support
base.

Sec. 7-303. - National Electrical Code amended; Section 230.70(A)(1). Readily accessible
location.

Section 230.70(A)(1) is hereby amended to read as follows: The service disconnecting
means shall be installed at a readily accessible location either outside of a building or inside
nearest the point of entrance of the service conductors. When service entrance conductors
are more than ten (10) feet in length from the point of entry to the service panel, a separate
means of disconnect must be installed at the service cable entrance to the building or
structure.

ARTICLE IV. - PLUMBING CODE
Sec. 7-400. - International Plumbing Code adopted.

The 2018 edition of the International Plumbing Code, and its most current errata as
published by the International Code Council from time to time is hereby adopted and
incorporated in this chapter as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions
thereof as are specifically added or amended.

Sec. 7-401. - International Plumbing Code deleted; Chapter 1. Administration.

Chapter 1, Administration is hereby deleted. See Article | of this chapter.

Page 34



BILL NO. 19-52

Sec. 7-402. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 305.4.1. Sewer depth.

Section 305.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Building sewers shall be installed
a minimum of twelve (12) inches (304.8 mm) below grade.

Sec. 7-403. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 312.10. Inspection and
testing of backflow prevention assemblies.

Section 312.10 is hereby amended to read as follows: Inspection and testing of backflow
prevention assemblies shall be in accordance with the policies prescribed by the Water
Utilities Department of the City of Lee's Summit, MO.

Sec. 7-404. - International Plumbing Code amended; Table 403.1.

Table 403.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Footnote g — A service sink may not
be required, at the discretion of the Building Official, if deemed unnecessary due to the size,
type and finish of the space.

Sec. 7-405. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 403.4.1. Directional sighage.

Section 403.4.1 is hereby deleted.

Sec. 7-406. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 410.4. Substitution.

Section 410.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: Where restaurants provide drinking
water in a container free of charge, drinking fountains shall not be required for those
restaurants. In other occupancies, where drinking fountains are required, water coolers,
bottled water dispensers or break rooms with a kitchen sink shall be permitted to be
substituted for the required drinking fountains.

Sec. 7-407. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 607.2. Hot or tempered water
supply to fixtures.

Section 607.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: The developed length of hot or
tempered water piping, from the source of hot water to the fixtures that require hot or
tempered water, shall not exceed 100 feet (30,480mm). Recirculating system piping and
heat-traced piping shall be considered to be sources of hot or tempered water.

Sec. 7-408. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 608.15.2. Protection of
backflow preventers.

Section 608.15.2 is hereby amended to add the following language:

Page 35



BILL NO. 19-52

Exception: In-ground back-flow devices for lawn irrigation systems.

Sec. 7-409. — International Plumbing Code amended; Section 714.1 Backwater Valves
Section 714.1 is hereby deleted.

Sec. 7-410. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 903.1. Roof extension.

Section 903.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Open vent pipes that extend
through a roof shall be terminated not less than six (6) inches (152.4 mm) above the roof.
Where a roof is to be used for assembly or as a promenade, observation deck, sunbathing
deck or similar purposes, open vent pipes shall terminate not less than seven (7) feet (2,134
mm) above the roof.

Sec. 7-411. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 918.1. General.

Section 918.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Air admittance valve are only
allowed when approved by the Administrative Authority. Vent systems utilizing air admittance
valves shall comply with this section. Stack-type air admittance valves shall conform to ASSE
1050. Individual- and branch-type air admittance valves shall conform to ASSE 1051.

Sec. 7-412. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 1002.4. Trap seals.

Section 1002.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: Each fixture trap shall have a
liquid seal of not less than two (2) inches (51 mm) and not more than four (4) inches (102
mm), or deeper for special designs relating to accessible fixtures. Where a trap seal is subject
to loss by evaporation, a deep-seal trap consisting of a four-inch (102 mm) seal or a trap seal
primer valve shall be installed. A trap seal primer valve shall conform to ASSE 1018 or ASSE
1044.

Sec. 7-413. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 1101.3. Prohibited drainage.

Section 1101.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Sanitary sewer systems shall be
designed, built and maintained in such a manner to prevent all storm or ground water from
draining, discharging or entering into the sanitary sewer system. Connection of sump pumps,
foundation drains, yard drains, gutter downspouts and any other storm water drainage
receptacle(s) or system(s) are specifically prohibited from being connected to the sanitary
sewer system.

Sec. 7-414. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 1113.1.1. Pump capacity and
head.

Page 36



BILL NO. 19-52

Section 1113.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: The sump pump shall be of a
capacity and head appropriate to anticipate use requirements. Sumps receiving storm water
from any exposed exterior drain(s) or opening(s) shall be provided with back-up system(s)
capable of assuring proper sump operation in case of power failure.

ARTICLE V. - MECHANICAL CODE
Sec. 7-500. - International Mechanical Code adopted.

The 2018 edition of the International Mechanical Code, and its most current errata as
published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated in this
chapter as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as are
specifically added or amended as stated below.

Sec. 7-501. - International Mechanical Code deleted; Chapter 1. Administration.

Chapter 1, Administration is hereby deleted. See Article | of this chapter.

Sec. 7-502. - International Mechanical Code amended; Section 401.2. Ventilation required.

Section 401.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: Every occupancy space shall be
ventilated by natural means in accordance with Section 402 or by mechanical means in
accordance with Section 403.

ARTICLE VI. - FUEL GAS CODE
Sec. 7-600. - International Fuel Gas Code adopted.

The 2018 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code, and its most current errata as
published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated in this
chapter as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as are
specifically added or amended as set forth below.

Sec. 7-601. - International Fuel Gas Code deleted; Chapter 1. Administration.

Chapter 1, Administration is hereby deleted. See Article | of this chapter.
Sec. 7-602. - International Fuel Gas Code amended; Section 403.4.3. Copper and brass.

Section 403.4.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Copper and brass piping shall
not be utilized to distribute fuel gas.

Sec. 7-603. - International Fuel Gas Code amended; Section 403.4.4. Aluminum.

Section 403.4.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: Aluminum or aluminum alloy
piping shall not be utilized for the distribution of fuel gas.

Page 37



BILL NO. 19-52

Sec. 7-604. - International Fuel Gas Code amended, Section 403.5.1. Steel tubing.

Section 403.5.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Steel tubing shall not be utilized
to distribute natural gas nor shall it be utilized to distribute any other fuel gas within a building
or structure.

Sec. 7-605. - International Fuel Gas Code amended, Section 403.5.3. Copper and brass
tubing.

Section 403.5.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Copper and brass tubing shall
not be utilized to distribute natural gas nor shall it be utilized to distribute any other fuel gas
within a building or structure.

Sec. 7-606. - International Fuel Gas Code amended, Section 403.5.4. Aluminum tubing.

Section 403.5.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: Aluminum tubing shall not be
utilized to distribute natural gas nor shall it be utilized to distribute any other fuel gas within a
building or structure.

Sec. 7-607. - International Fuel Gas Code amended, Section 406.4.1. Test pressure.

Section 406.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: The test pressure to be used shall
be not less than one and one-half times the proposed maximum working pressure, but not
less than ten (10) psig (68.9 kPa) irrespective of design pressure. For welded piping, and for
piping carrying gas at pressures in excess of fourteen (14) inches water column pressure,
the test pressure shall not be less than sixty (60) psig. Where the test pressure exceeds one
hundred twenty-five (125) psig (862 kPa), the test pressure shall not exceed a value that
produces a hoop stress in the piping greater than fifty (50) percent of the specified minimum
yield strength of the pipe.

ARTICLE VII PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL
No changes are proposed for the currently adopted article.

ARTICLE VIIl ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE
Sec. 7-700. - Issuance of permits.
The private sewage disposal system shall be in accordance with Chapter 32 of the Lee's Summit
Code of Ordinances and requirements of Jackson County, Missouri. Building permits for
structures utilizing private sewage disposal shall not be issued until permitted by the Jackson
County, Missouri Department of Public Works.
Secs. 7-701—7-799. - Reserved.

ARTICLE VIII. - ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

Sec. 7-800. - Energy conservation code.

This article shall be known as the City's Energy Conservation Code and can be cited as such.

Sec. 7-801. - Scope.

Page 38



BILL NO. 19-52

This article sets forth energy efficiency related requirements for the design and construction of
buildings regulated by this chapter.

Exception: Portions of the building thermal envelope that do not enclose conditioned space.

Sec. 7-802. - Residential occupancies.

The minimum required R-value for each element of the building thermal envelope shall be in
accordance with the following:

A.

Wall assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor rating
of R-13. This requirement does not apply to doors, windows, or other openings or approved
penetrations nor does it apply to basement concrete walls when the basement is not finished as
a habitable space.

Floor assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor rating
of 19. Garage ceilings with living area above shall comply with this requirement.

Exception: Concrete floors in contact with the earth need not be insulated.

Roof assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor rating
of 19. This requirement does not apply to skylights or other approved penetrations.

Ceilings forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor rating of thirty
(30) at the time of installation.

Duct insulation. All portions of the air distribution system shall be installed in accordance with
Section M1601 and be insulated to an installed R-5 when system components are located within
the building but outside of conditioned space, and R-8 when located outside of the building. When
located within a building envelope assembly, at least R-8 shall be applied between the duct and
that portion of the assembly furthest from conditioned space.

Sec. 7-803. - Non-residential occupancies.

The minimum required R-value for each element of the building thermal envelope shall be in
accordance with the following:

Exception: The Building Official may approve a decreased R-Value for building exterior walls provided
the space is normally not occupied by employees and is associated with storage/warehouse or
manufacturing.

A.

C.

Wall assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor rating
of 11. This requirement does not apply to doors, windows or other openings or approved
penetrations nor does it apply to unfinished basement concrete walls.

Floor assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor rating
of 19.

Exception: Concrete floors in contact with the earth need not be insulated.

Roof assemblies forming portions of a building envelope shall meet or exceed an R factor 19.

Sec. 7-804. - Materials and equipment.

Page 39



BILL NO. 19-52

Materials and equipment shall be identified in a manner that will allow a determination of their
compliance with this chapter. Materials and equipment shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer's installation instructions.

Insulation. The thermal resistance (R-value) shall be indicated on all insulation and the insulation
installed such that the R-value can be verified. Where blown-in or sprayed insulation is applied the installer
shall provide a certification of the installed density and R-value if requested by the Building Official.

Sec. 7-805. - Definitions.

For the purpose of this article, certain terms are defined as follows:

Building envelope: The elements of a building, which enclose conditioned spaces through which
thermal energy may be transferred to or from the exterior.

Floor assembly: A floor assembly shall be considered as all components of any floor forming a portion
of the building envelope through which heat flows, thereby creating a building transmission heat loss or
gain.

R-factor: A measure of ability to retard heat flow, R is the numerical reciprocal of U, thus R=1/U.R is
used in combination with numerals to designate thermal resistance units.

Roof assembly: A roof assembly shall be considered as all components of the roof or ceiling envelope
through which heat flows, thereby creating a building transmission heat loss or gain, where such assembly
is exposed to out door air and encloses a heated or mechanically cooled space.

Thermal transmittance (J): Coefficient of heat transmission expressed in units of BTU per hour square
foot per degree F. The J value applies to combinations of different materials used in series along the heat
flow path.

Wall assembly: A wall assembly shall be considered as all components of any wall forming a portion
of the building envelope through which heat flows, thereby creating a building transmission heat loss or
gain.

Secs. 7-806—7-899. - Reserved.

Article IX. — RESIDENTIAL CODE

7-900. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADOPTED. The 2018 edition of the
International Residential Code, including appendices E, H, and J, and its most current
errata as published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated
in this chapter as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as
are specifically added or amended.

7-901. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 1.
ADMINISTRATION. Chapter 1, entitled Administration is hereby deleted. (See Article | of
this Chapter)

7-902. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DATA ENTRY; TABLE R301.2(1).
TABLE R301.2(1) CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA. Table R301.2(1)
shall include the following data:

Page 40



BILL NO. 19-52

Ground Wind Design Seismic Subject to Damage from
Snow Speed? | Topographic | Special | Windborne | Design Weathering® | Frost | Termite®
Load® | (meh) effects* wind | debris Category' line

region' | zone™ depth®
Twenty | Ninety | No No No A Severe Thirty- | Moderate
(20) (90) Six to heavy
pounds | miles (36)
per per inches
square | hour
foot
Winter Design Ice Barrier Flood Hazards?® Air Freezing Mean Annual
Temp® Underlayment Index! Temp!

Requirement"

Six (6) degrees Yes See Article 5 927 55.5 degrees

Fahrenheit

Division Il of the
Unified
Development
Ordinance

Fahrenheit

Manual J Design Criteria is hereby Deleted

7-903. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R302.5.1
OPENING PROTECTION. Section R302.5.1 Opening Protection is amended to read as
follows: Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes
shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence shall be
equipped with solid wood doors not less than 1 3/8ths inches (35mm) in thickness, solid or
honeycomb core steel doors not less than 1 1/8ths inches (35mm) thick, or 20 minute fire-
rated doors, equipped with a self closing device.

Exception: Attic access openings shall not be required to be equipped with a self closing

device.

7-904. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R303.3
BATHROOMS. Section R303.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Bathrooms, water
closet compartments and other similar rooms shall be provided with aggregate glazing area
in windows of not less than 3 square feet (0.279 m2), one-half of which must be openable.

EXCEPTION: The glazed areas shall not be required where artificial light and a mechanical
ventilation system are provided. The minimum ventilation rates shall be 50 cfm (23.6L/s) for
intermittent ventilation or 20 cfm (9.4 L/s) for continuous ventilation. Ventilation air from the
space shall be exhausted directly to the outside or to an attic ventilated in accordance with
Section R806. The point of discharge of the exhaust air shall be at least 3 feet from any
opening into the building. Bathrooms which contain only a water closet or lavatory, or

Page 41




BILL NO. 19-52

combination thereof, and similar rooms, may be ventilated with an approved mechanical
recirculating fan or similar device designed to remove odors from the air.

7-905. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R303.4
MECHANICAL VENTILATION. Section R303.4 Mechanical Ventilation is hereby deleted.

7-906. — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R311.3.2 FLOOR
ELEVATIONS FOR OTHER EXTERIOR DOORS. Section R311.3.2 Floor elevations for
other exterior doors is hereby amended to read as follows: Doors other than the required
egress door shall be provided with landings or floors not more than 7 % inches (196 mm)
below the top of the threshold.

EXCEPTION:

A landing is not required where a stairway of four or fewer risers is located on the exterior
side of the door, provided the door does not swing over the stairway.

7-907.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R311.7.8.5 GRIP
SIZE. Section R311.7.8.5 is hereby amended to read as follows; All required handrails
shall be of one of the following types or provide equivalent graspability.

1. Type I. Handrails with a circular cross section shall have an outside diameter of at least
1-1/4 inches (32mm) and not greater than 2 inches (51 mm). If the handrail is not circular it
shall have a perimeter dimension of at least 4 inches (102 mm) and not greater than 6-1/4
inches (160 mm) with a maximum cross section of dimension of 2-1/4 inches (57 mm).

2. Type Il. Handrails with a perimeter greater than 6-1/4 inches (160mm) shall provide a
graspable finger recess area on both sides of the profile. The finger recess shall begin
within a distance of 3/4 inch (19 mm) measured vertically from the tallest portion of the
profile and achieve a depth of at least 5/16 inch (8mm) within 7/8 inch (22mm) below the
widest portion of the profile. This required depth shall continue for at least 3/8 inch (10mm)
to a level that is not less than 1-3/4 inches (45 mm) below the tallest portion of the profile.
The minimum width of the handrail above the recess shall be 1-1/4 inches (32 mm) to a
maximum of 2-3/4 inches (70mm). Edges shall have a minimum radius of 0.01 inches (0.25
mm).

EXCEPTION:

Handrails provided at other non-required exterior stairs may have a maximum horizontal
cross-sectional dimension of 3-1/2 inches and shall be easily graspable.

7-908. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R313
AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS. Section R313 is hereby amended to read as
follows: A builder of a one-and two family dwelling or townhouse shall offer to any
purchaser, on or before the time of entering into the purchase contract the option, at the
purchaser’s cost, to install or equip fire sprinklers in the one-and two-family dwelling or
townhouse. Notwithstanding any other provision of law to the contrary, no purchaser of
such one- and two family dwelling or townhouse shall be denied the right to install a fire
sprinkler system in such dwelling or townhouse being purchased. The provisions of this

Page 42



BILL NO. 19-52

section, which are intended to mirror the requirements of section RSMo 67.281, shall expire
on December 31st, 2022.

7-909. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R313.1
TOWNHOUSE AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS. Section R313.1 Townhouse
automatic fire sprinkler systems is hereby deleted.

7-910. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R313.2 ONE- AND
TWO FAMILY DWELLING AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEMS. Section R313.2 One- and two
family dwellings automatic fire systems is hereby deleted.

7-911. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; R317.1.1 FIELD
TREATMENT. Section R317.1.1 is hereby deleted.

7-912. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R318.1.2 FIELD
TREATMENT. Section R318.1.2 is hereby deleted.

7-913. — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R326 SWIMMING
POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS. Section 326 is hereby deleted.

7-914. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION R401.3.1 MINIMUM
STANDARDS. Section R401.3.1 is hereby added to read as follows:

A. Minimum standards: All drainage facilities shall be designed to carry waters to the
nearest drainage way, storm sewer conveyance, or other approved point of collection and
conveyance. Erosion of ground in the area of discharge shall be prevented by installation of
erosive control devices. Unless specified drainage ways and swales are specifically
approved by the building official, abutting property lines between structures shall be
designed to function as drainage ways. The toe of slopes shall set back from the property
line a minimum of one foot. The area surrounding the building foundation shall have a
drainage gradient as provided for in the International Residential Code, as amended from
time to time with a draining gradient thereafter of not less than two percent toward approved
drainage facilities un