
INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM 

CONTRACT DOCUMENT
DATE: June 10, 2024 

TO: Key Purchasing Personnel 

FROM: Procurement and Contract Services 

BID#: 2024-024 Miscellaneous Traffic Signal Components 
CONTRACT#: 2024-027-1/1R 

Vendor 
Name & Address 

Gades Sales Company, Inc. 
PO Box 9003 
Wichita, KS 67277 

Phone & Fax Office: (316) 943-1219 
Email: squaney@gadestraffic.com 

Contact Person Sharon Quaney 
Ordering Instructions o Using Department to enter a requisition in the Lawson System for a Purchase Order to

be issued.
o Requisition must include each item as a separate line item.
o Invoices will be paid against Lawson System Receiver and Purchase Order.
o Reference Contract Number in the comments section of the requisition as well as

comments to print on the purchase order.

Terms/Discounts Net 30 
Delivery Destination 

Pricing See Attached Pricing Sheet 
Response Time As specified 
Effective Dates September 28. 2024 through September 27, 2025 

cc: Bid File- Original memo 
Intranet 
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NOTICE OF RENEWAL 

 
May 14, 2024 
 
 
Ms. Sharon Quaney 
Gades Sales Company, Inc. 
PO Box 9003 
Wichita, KS 67277 
 
 
RE: Miscellaneous Traffic Signal Components 
Renewal Agreement 2024-0027-2/1R 
 
 
Dear Ms. Quaney: 
 
The City of Lee’s Summit and Gades Sales Company, Inc. entered into Agreement 2024-027-1 on September 28, 2023 
(the “Agreement”), for Miscellaneous Traffic Signal Components.  You are hereby notified the City of Lee’s Summit, in 
accordance with Section 3.1 of the Agreement, is exercising its option to renew the term of the Agreement for an 
additional year.  The renewal term shall be for a one (1) year period from September 28, 2024 through September 27, 
2025.  The City may at its option, renew the agreement for up to three (3) additional one (1) year terms. 
 
Should any changes to the current pricing need proposed, the Vendor should contact the Procurement Officer within 
thirty (30) business days of this notification and will be required to provide justification and all details surrounding the 
request. Otherwise, the current contract shall auto renew exactly as written. 
 
City staff looks forward to doing business with your company during this agreement period.  Please do not hesitate 
to contact me at 816-969-1087 with any questions or concerns. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
DeeDee Tschirhart 
DeeDee Tschirhart, CPPB 
Senior Procurement Officer 
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RENEWAL PRICING-1R 

PRICE SHEET 
 
NOTE: All pricing blanks must be filled in. Incomplete or unfilled spaces in the Specifications/Price Sheet shall be 
deemed as a NO BID entry for that item. All prices must include shipping and inside delivery. 
 

Item Description Est Qty (Each) Unit Price Extended Price 

1. NEMA Conflict Monitor with Flashing Yellow Arrow capabilities 4 $1185.00 $4740.00 

2. YUNEX M60 Lite Controller 4 $4688.00 $18,752.00 

3. Vantage NEXT CCU Shelf Mount Unit 3 No Bid  

4. Vantage NEXT WDR Camera (without bulk head connection) 12 No Bid  

5. Pedestrian Push Buttons 20 $112.00 $2240.00 

6. Audible Pedestrian Push Buttons 2 No Bid  

7. Backplate Kits 4 $65.00 $260.00 

8. Pelco Break-A-Way pole bases (4” round), or equal 6 $220.00 $1320.00 

 Brand Bid if not Pelco ___________________________ 

9. GE Red Ball, Green Ball, LED Signal Indications, or equal 25 Red 
25 Green $52.00 $2600.00 

 Brand Bid if not GE ___________________________ 

10. Pedestrian LED Signal Indications 10 $130.00 $1300.00 

Total Cost $31,212.00 

For items not specifically identified in this Solicitation, may the City Departments contact your Company for 
quotations on other items? 

X YES      ⃝NO 
 

__5% off list Price 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Company Name: Gades Sales Company, Inc.  Date:    6/10/2024   
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