5] LEE'S SUMMIT

MISSOURI

BID NUMBER: 2017-055
PROJECT: Hankook & Continental/General Tires & Service

BID OPENING: 11/30/2016 at 11:00AM
OPENED BY: Tarah Daugherty

This is the unofficial bid tabulation and only reflects the reading of the bids and not the evaluation process of bids received.

Bidder
Cross-Midwest Tire Co.
Kansas City, KS

Bidder

Anchor Sales & Service

Independence, MO

Bidd
DLS Tire Cel
Lee's Sumi

Type of Tire Continental/General Hankook Continental/General % Hankook Continental/General %
% off Catalog List % off Catalog List off Catalog List % off Catalog List off Catalog List

4.1 Passenger Light Truck Tires 39% No bid No bid 49% 49%
4.2 Premium Heavy Duty Truck & Bus 33% No bid No bid 49% 39%
GENERAL INFORMATION
4.3 State hours & days of operation 24/7 24/7 M-F 7:30am-5pm, 24/7
4.4 Delivery Time (after receipt of PO) 24 hrs Same Day Service As soon as i
4.5 The City's standard tt Net 30 aft ipt

e City's standard payment terms are Ne after receip None None Non

of invoice. State any discounts offered:

4.6 Describe Warranty for Tires AND Service:

Workmanship & materials

No questions asked

100% Warranty on Tires & Service

Workmanship & materie
tire
Service work guarante

4.7 State Contact Name, position, email & phone number for
Customer Service related issues:

Rayce Farthing, CSR
rfarthing@crossmidwest.com
816-935-4382

Branden Simms, Regional Sales Mngr
branden@anchorsales.com

816-799-4400

John LuAllen, Gel
john.luallen@dlst
816-556

4.8 Please list the nearest store location (full address & phone
number) closest to Lee's Summit, MO for tires to be purchased
& services to be performed:

3527 Gardner Avenue
Kansas City, MO/816-231-6511

1720 S.E. Ranson Road

Lee's Summit, MO 64082

816-799-4400

400 SE Fleet'
Lee's Summit,

HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE & TRAILER TIRE SERVICE

Description of Service Price Price Pric
Service Call to Lee's Summit, MO
5.1 | (NOTE: There shall be NO Delivery Fee or Service Call $45.00 $55.00 $45.1
Charges for the delivery of Tires Only)

5.2 |Change tire, Mount AND Dismount $10.00/per Tire $25.00/per Tire $25.0
5.3 |Tire Installation $10.00/per Tire S0/per Tire $o/
5.4 [Flat repair, remove, repair and mount $25.00/per Tire $30.00/per Tire $32.50/p
5.5 |Flat repair, off vehicle $15.00/per Tire $0/per Tire $27.50/p
5.6 |Rotate mounted tires $10.00 $0.00 $10.00
5.7 |New Valve Stem (heavy duty metal type) $3.00/per Tire $5.50/per Tire $5.0(
5.8 |Computer spin balance $20.00/per Tire $20.00/per Tire $25.0
5.9 |Wheel balance valve stem combo $20.00/per Tire $0/per Tire $30.0
5.10 [Standard 2 Wheel Alignment $105.00 N/A N//
5.11 |Standard 4 Wheel Alignment $195.00 N/A N//
5.12 [Studding $20.00/per Tire $S0/per Tire N//
5.13 [Used tire recycle/disposal $3.00/per Tire $0/per Tire $3.0(
5.14 [Wheel Refurbishment $30.00 /per Tire $18.00/per Tire $28.0

5.15 GRAND TOTAL FOR COMMERCIAL/HEAVY DUTY TIRE
: SERVICE (LINES 5.1-5.14) $511.00 $153.50 $231,

LIGHT DUTY VEHICLE TIRE SERVICE

Description of Service Price Price Pric

Service Call to Lee's Summit, MO

5.16 | (NOTE: There shall be NO Delivery Fee or Service Call $45.00/per Service Call $55.00/per Service Call $45.00/per S
Charges for the delivery of Tires Only)
5.17 [Change tire, Mount AND Dismount $6.00 /per Tire $20.00/per Tire $5.0(
5.18 |[Tire Installation $6.00 /per Tire S0 /per Tire S0/
5.19 [Flat repair, remove, repair and mount $15.00 /per Tire $20.00/per Tire $17.5
5.20 [Flat repair, off vehicle $9.00 /per Tire S0 /per Tire $15.0
5.21 [Rotate mounted tires $6.00 ea S0 /per Tire $3.00 ¢
5.22 [New Valve Stem (snap in rubber type) $3.00/per Tire $3.00/per Tire $2.0(
5.23 [Computer spin balance $15.00 /per Tire S0 /per Tire $5.0(
5.24 [Wheel balance valve stem combo $15.00 /per Tire S0 /per Tire $7.0(
5.25 [Standard 2 Wheel Alignment $79.95 N/A $49.!
5.26 [Standard 4 Wheel Alignment $79.95 N/A $59.!
5.27 [Studding $15.00 /per Tire S0 /per Tire N/#
5.28 |Used tire recycle/disposal $3.00 /per Tire $0/per Tire $1.5(
5.29 [Wheel Refurbishment $30.00 /per Tire $12/per Tire $25.0
5.30 GRAND TOTAL FOR PASSENGER/LIGHT DUTY TIRE $327.90 $110.00 $235,

SERVICE (LINES 5.16-5.29)

UNOFFICIAL
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