

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				All-Star Custom Apparel & Design, Inc. Henrietta, NY				Custom Graphics Lee's Summit, MO				
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	SIZE	EST. QTY.	BRAND BID	STYLE NO	FABRIC WEIGHT	UNIT PRICE EACH	BRAND BID	STYLE NO	FABRIC WEIGHT	UNIT PRICE EACH	
SECTION 4.0: ITEM PRICING												
4.1 FIRE DEPARTMENT												
4.1.1	T-shirt, SS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2000, C: Navy, * NO SUBS	S - XL 2XL 3XL	660 200 10				\$4.11 \$5.95 \$7.46				\$2.20 \$4.00 \$5.50	
4.1.2	T-shirt, LS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2400, C: Navy, * NO SUBS	S - XL 2XL 3XL	425 125 10				\$6.81 \$8.71 \$10.48				\$4.30 \$6.00 \$8.00	
4.1.3 Fire Department Total							\$43.52	4.1.3 Fire Department Total			\$30.00	
4.2 FLEET DIVISION												
4.2.1	T-shirt, SS, pocket, 50/50, double-needle stitched bottom & sleeve hems, shoulder to shoulder taping, seamless collar 5.4 oz., Fruit of the Loom #5930PR, C: Dark Gray, * NO SUBS	S - XL 2XL 3XL 4XL	15 1 10 5				no bid-discontinued item no bid-discontinued item no bid-discontinued item no bid-discontinued item				\$4.60 \$6.10 \$7.50 \$7.50	
4.2.2	T-shirt, LS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk heavy cotton, 5.6 oz., Fruit of the Loom #4930R, C: Dark Gray, * NO SUBS	S - XL 2XL 3XL	5 5 5				\$7.98 \$9.09 \$10.80				\$3.60 \$4.60 \$6.40	
4.2.3 Fleet Division Total							\$27.87	4.2.3 Fleet Division Total			\$40.30	
4.3 PARKS & RECREATION												
4.3.1	T-Shirt, SS, no pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8000B, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Youth S - L	3150				\$3.60				\$2.10	
4.3.2	T-Shirt, SS, no pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8000, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL 2XL 3XL	2207 15 1				\$3.95 \$5.85 \$7.38				\$2.20 \$3.60 \$5.10	
4.3.3	T-Shirt, SS, pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8300, C: Sand, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL 2XL 3XL	55 25 1				no bid-discontinued color no bid-discontinued color no bid-discontinued color				\$5.18 \$7.18 \$8.69	
4.3.4	Sweatshirt, LS, 50/50 cotton/poly, Gildan, #18000, C: Black, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL 2XL 3XL	30 30 4				\$10.27 \$11.65 \$12.61				\$6.00 \$7.50 \$8.30	
4.3.5	Men's Nike Dri-Fit Micro Pique Polo, SanMar #363807, SS, 100% polyester, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adults S - XL 2XL 3XL	26 2 2				\$26.73 \$27.73 \$29.73				\$20.00 \$21.00 \$22.00	
4.3.6	Womens Nike Dri-Fit Micro Pique Polo, SanMar #354067, SS, 100% polyester, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adults S - XL 2XL	116 4				\$26.73 \$27.73				\$20.00 \$21.00	
4.3.7	Women, ¾ zip sweatshirt, Sport Tek LST253, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S-XL	10				\$20.95				\$14.50	
4.3.8	Men Polo style, SS shirt, 100% polyester w/ moisture wicking properties, Izod 1320075, C: Black or Red, * NO SUBS	S - XL 2XL 3XL	90 10 2				\$25.27 \$25.86 \$27.94				\$18.60 \$19.60 \$22.00	
4.3.9	Women Polo style SS shirt, 100% polyester w/ moisture wicking properties, Izod 1200 Performance Pique, #1320081, C: Black or Red, * NO SUBS	S-XL 2XL	80 5				\$33.51 \$35.65				\$18.60 \$19.60	
4.3.10	Adult Polo style LS shirt, 5.5 oz polyester pique golf shirt, Men's Tri Mountain 658 Black, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL 2XL 3XL	80 5 1				\$27.49 \$29.71 \$31.23				\$17.00 \$18.00 \$19.00	
4.3.11	Adult Polo style LS shirt 5.5 oz polyester pique golf shirt, Women's Tri Mountain 656 Eclipse, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL 2XL	30 5				\$27.49 \$29.71				\$17.00 \$18.00	
4.3.12	Visors, C: Red and Tan	Adult	25	Valucap	VC500	N/A	\$8.00	Port & Co	CP45	80% Cotton	\$2.75	
4.3.13	Snapback Trucker Cap, S&S Activewear, #18095, C: Blk & Gray *NO SUBS	Adult	50				\$9.94				\$4.00	
4.3.14 Parks & Recreation Total							\$526.71	4.3.14 Parks & Recreation Total			\$368.50	
4.3.15 Sorting by Team Charge for Parks & Recreation T-Shirts Order							\$	\$0.00				
4.3.16 Delivery Time After Receipt of Order for Parks & Recreation T-Shirts that have to be SORTED (business days)							15 business days	7-10 business days				

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				All-Star Custom Apparel & Design, Inc. Henrietta, NY			Custom Graphics Lee's Summit, MO				
4.4 PUBLIC WORKS OPERATIONS											
4.4.1	T-shirt, SS w/ pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #2300, C: Various, *NO SUBS	S - XL	1			\$8.96				\$5.15	
		2XL	1			\$10.96				\$7.16	
		3XL	1			\$12.49				\$8.70	
		4XL	1			\$12.49				\$8.70	
		5XL	1			\$12.49				\$8.70	
4.4.2	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6270 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	1			NO BID				\$20.00	
4.4.3	T-shirt, LS, pocket, Cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2400, C: Various, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1			\$10.31				\$4.30	
		2XL	1			\$11.35				\$6.05	
		3XL	1			\$12.74				\$8.35	
		4XL	1			\$12.74				\$8.35	
		5XL	1			\$12.74				\$8.35	
4.4.4	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6271 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	1			NO BID				\$20.00	
		2XL	1			NO BID				\$22.00	
		3XL	1			NO BID				\$23.00	
		4XL	1			NO BID				\$23.00	
		5XL	1			NO BID				NA	
4.4.5	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Berne Apparel #SZ101 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1			\$45.63				\$32.00	
		2XL	1			\$45.63				\$32.00	
		3XL	1			\$48.63				\$33.00	
		4XL	1			\$48.63				\$35.50	
		5XL	1			NO BID, 5XL N/A				\$38.00	
4.4.6	ML Kishigo Microfiber Reflective Tshirt #9110-9111	S-XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	n/a	\$17.18	ML Kishigo	\$9,110.00	6 oz	\$11.00
		2XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	N/A	\$18.44	ML Kishigo	\$9,110.00	6 oz	\$12.00
		3XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	N/A	\$18.44	ML Kishigo	\$9,110.00	6 oz	\$12.00
		4XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	N/A	\$18.44	ML Kishigo	\$9,110.00	6 oz	\$12.00
		5XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	N/A	\$18.44	ML Kishigo	\$9,110.00	6 oz	\$12.00
4.4.7	Jacket, nylon shell, lightweight fleece lining, Port Authority Competitor Jacket JP54, C: Various, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1				\$36.18				\$22.00
		2XL	1				\$37.18				\$23.00
		3XL	1				\$39.18				\$24.00
		4XL	1				\$40.18				\$25.00
		5XL	1				\$42.18				\$28.00
4.4.8	Carhartt Jacket #100632 and # 100614 C: Black	S - XL	1	Carhartt	100632/100614	12 oz/13 oz	\$61.90	Carhartt	100614	12oz/13oz	\$40.00
		2XL	1	Carhartt	100632/100614	12 oz/13 oz	\$61.90	Carhartt	100614	12oz/13oz	\$40.00
		3XL	1	Carhartt	100632/100614	12 oz/13 oz	\$65.15	Carhartt	100614	12oz/13oz	\$44.00
		4XL	1	Carhartt	100632/100614	12 oz/13 oz	\$65.15	Carhartt	100614	12oz/13oz	\$44.00
		5XL	1				NO BID 5XL N/A	NA	NA	NA	NA/NO Bid
4.4.9	Carhartt Bibs R41 C: Brown	S-XL	1				NO BID	Carhartt	R41	12 oz	\$67.00
		2XL	1				NO BID	Carhartt	R41	12 oz	\$67.00
		3XL	1				NO BID	Carhartt	R41	12 oz	\$67.00
		4XL	1				NO BID	Carhartt	R41	12 oz	\$67.00
		5XL	1				NO BID	Carhartt	R41	12 oz	\$67.00
4.4.10	Carhartt Coat J140 C: Brown	S-XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 OZ	\$82.38	Carhartt	J140	12 oz	\$66.50
		2XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 OZ	\$82.38	Carhartt	J140	12 oz	\$66.50
		3XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 OZ	\$88.88	Carhartt	J140	12 oz	\$72.00
		4XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 OZ	\$88.88	Carhartt	J140	12 oz	\$72.00
		5XL	1				\$88.88	Carhartt	J140	12 oz	\$73.00
4.4.11	Carhartt Stocking Cap C: Black		1				NO BID	Carhartt	CTA205	5 oz	\$8.00
4.4.11A	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6260 Thermal Lined Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS <u>NOTE: Added Per Addendum No. 1</u>	S-XL	1				NO BID				\$20.00
		2XL	1				NO BID				\$22.00
		3XL	1				NO BID				\$23.00
		4XL	1				NO BID				\$23.00
		5XL	1				NO BID				N/A
4.4.12 Public Works Operations Total						\$1,277.13	4.4.12 Public Works Operations Total			\$1,482.31	

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				All-Star Custom Apparel & Design, Inc. Henrietta, NY			Custom Graphics Lee's Summit, MO				
4.5 WATER UTILITIES DEPARTMENT											
4.5.1	T-Shirt - SS, Gildan DryBlend Pocket T-Shirt #8000 - 50/50 Preshrunk, C: Navy	S - XL	1	Gildan	8000	5.5 oz	\$18.71	Gildan	\$8,300.00	5.6 oz	\$4.60
		2XL-5XL	1	Gildan	8000	5.5 oz	\$22.16	Gildan	\$8,300.00	5.6 oz	\$6.25
4.5.2	T-Shirt - SS, Gildan Ultra Cotton Tall T-Shirt, No Pocket, #2000T - 100% Preshrunk, C: Navy	LT-XLT	1	Gildan	2000T	6 oz	\$21.59	Gildan	2000t	6 oz	\$5.40
		2XLT-3XLT	1	Gildan	2000T	6 oz	\$22.15	Gildan	2000t	6 oz	\$6.40
4.5.3	T-Shirt - LS, Gildan Ultra Cotton Pocket T-Shirt, #2410 - 100% Preshrunk, C: Navy	S - XL	1	Gildan	2410	6 oz	\$22.80	Gildan	\$2,410.00	6 oz	\$6.50
		2XL-5XL	1	Gildan	2410	6 oz	\$25.49	Gildan	\$2,410.00	6 oz	\$8.00
4.5.4	T-Shirt - LS, Port & Company, Tall T-Shirt, #PC55LST - 50/50 Shrink Resistant, C: Navy	LT-XLT	1	Port & Company	PC55LST	5.5 oz	\$21.51	Port & Company	PC55LST	5.5 oz	\$5.20
		2XLT-4XLT	1	Port & Company	PC55LST	5.5 oz	\$23.32	Port & Co	PC55LST	5.5 oz	\$7.00
4.5.5	Hoodie - Cornerstone Heavyweight Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt w/Thermal Lining #CS620, C: Navy	S-XL	1	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$45.52	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$28.00
		2XL-6XL	1	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$49.52	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$31.00
4.5.6	Oxford - SS, Port Authority Easy Care Shirt, #S508 -55/45, C: Various	S-XL	1	Port Authority	S508	4.5 oz	\$17.62	Port Authority	S508	4.5 oz	\$11.00
		2XL-6XL	1	Port Authority	S508	4.5 oz	\$23.62	Port Authority	S508	4.5 oz	\$15.00
4.5.7	Oxford - SS, Port Authority Tall Easy Care Shirt, #TLS508 - 55/45, C: Various	S-XL	1	Port Authority	TLS508	4.5 oz	\$18.67	Port Authority	TLS508	4.5 oz	\$12.00
		2XL-6XL	1	Port Authority	TLS508	4.5 oz	\$21.67	Port Authority	TLS508	4.5 oz	\$14.00
4.5.8	Oxford, LS, Port Authority Crosshatch Easy Care , #S640 - 60/40, C: Various	S-XL	1	Port Authority	S640	3 oz	\$22.87	Port Authority	S640	3.0 oz	\$16.00
		2XL-4XL	1	Port Authority	S640	3 oz	\$25.87	Port Authority	S640	3.0 oz	\$18.00
4.5.9	Oxford, LS, Port Authority Tall Crosshatch Easy Care , #TLS640 - 60/40, C: Various	LT-XLT	1	Port Authority	TLS640	3 oz	\$23.92	Port Authority	TLS640	3.0 oz	\$18.00
		2XLT-4XLT	1	Port Authority	TLS640	3oz	\$27.07	Port Authority	TLS640	3.0 oz	\$19.00
4.5.10	Men's polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo K455, C: Various	S - XL	45	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$19.72	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$13.00
		2XL	35	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$20.72	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$14.00
		3XL	15	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$22.72	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$15.00
4.5.11	Women's polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455, C: Various	S-XL	25	Port Authority	L455	5.6 oz	\$19.72	Port Authority	L455	5.6 oz	\$13.00
4.5.12	Women's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455LS, C: Various	2XL	10				NO BID-discontinued	Port Authority	L455ls	5.6 oz	\$14.00
4.5.13	Men's Tall polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455, C: Various	S-XL	25	Port Authority	TLK455	5.6 oz	\$20.77	Port Authority	TLK455	5.6 oz	\$14.00
4.5.14	Men's Tall polo style, LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455LS, C: Various	2XL	15				NO BID-Discontinued	Port Authority	TLK455LS	5.6 oz	\$15.00
		3XL	5				NO BID-Discontinued	Port Authority	TLK455ls	5.6 oz	\$17.00
4.5.15	Men's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo K455LS, C: Various	S - XL	45	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$21.82	Port Authority	K455ls	5.6 oz	\$15.00
		2XL	45	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$22.82	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$16.00
4.5.16	Women's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455LS, C: Various	S-XL	25				NO BID-discontinued	Port Authority	L540LS	4.0 oz	\$9.00
		2XL	10				NO BID-discontinued	Port Authority	L540LS	4.0 oz	\$10.00
4.5.17	Men's Tall polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455LS, C: Various	S - XL	25				NO BID-discontinued	Port Authority	TLK455LS	5.0 oz	\$16.00
		2XL	25				NO BID-discontinued	Port Authority	TLK455LS	5.0 oz	\$16.00
4.5.18 Water Utilities Department Total							\$602.37	4.5.18 Water Utilities Department Total		\$428.35	

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				All-Star Custom Apparel & Design, Inc. Henrietta, NY				Custom Graphics Lee's Summit, MO				
4.6 WATER METER SERVICES DEPARTMENT												
4.6.1	T-Shirt-SS, Gildan #8300 C: Heather	M-XXL	56	Gildan	8300	5.5 oz	\$15.34	Gildan	\$8,300.00	5.6 oz	\$4.15	
4.6.2	T-Shirt-LS, Gildan #2400 C: Navy	M-XXL	34	Gildan	2400	6 oz	\$11.13	Gildan	\$2,400.00	6.1 oz	\$4.30	
4.6.3	Pull-Over Hoodies, 50/50 Jerzee Nublend, 996M,C: Navy	M-XXL	16	Jerzees	996M	8 oz	\$20.94	Jerzee	996M	8 oz	\$8.50	
4.6.4	Cornerstone Thermal Zip Up Jacket, CS620, C: Navy	M-XXL	3	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$41.32	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$28.00	
4.6.5	SS, Womens Plos Port Authority Rapid Dry, L455, C: Various	L	7	Port Authority	L455	5.6 oz	\$24.52	Port Authority	L455	5 oz	\$13.00	
4.6.6	LS, Womens Plos Port Authority Rapid Dry, L500LS, C: Various	L	3	Port Authority	L500LS	5 oz	\$22.42	Port Authority	L500ls	5 oz	\$11.00	
4.6.7	Waterproof Rain Jacket, Port Authority, J333, C: Orange Crush	M-XXL	3	Port Authority	J333	N/A	\$39.22	Port Authority	J333	8 oz	\$27.00	
							4.6.8 Water Meter Services Department Total	\$174.89			4.6.8 Water Meter Services Department Total	\$95.95
							4.7 GRAND TOTAL	\$2,652.49			4.7 GRAND TOTAL	\$2,445.41

SECTION 4.8: ADD-ON CHARGES FOR SCREEN PRINTING

NOTE:

Costs quoted in this section will be added to the item bid in Section 1, to complete the calculation of a total shirt cost, under the contract, when an order is placed by one of our using departments, for a specific event or program. This section

SCREEN PRINTING	ONE COLOR (PER ITEM)	EACH ADDITIONAL COLOR (PER ITEM)	ONE COLOR (PER ITEM)	EACH ADDITIONAL COLOR (PER ITEM)
4.8.1 Location of Imprint: Upper Left Chest	0.33	0.33	0.9	0.2
4.8.2 Location of Imprint: Full Front	0.39	0.39	0.9	0.2
4.8.3 Location of Imprint: Full Back	0.39	0.39	0.9	0.2
4.8.4 Location of Imprint: Full Front & Back	0.78	0.78	1.8	0.2
4.8.5 Location of Imprint: Left Chest & Back	0.72	0.72	1.8	0.2
4.8.6 Location of Imprint: Upper Left Sleeve	0.79	0.79	0.9	0.2
4.8.7 Consecutive Numerical Imprints (4" -6" Size)	2.07	2.07	1.65	0.2
4.8.8 Screen & Setup Charges Per Design	25	25	5	5
4.8.9 Per Order Expedited/Rush Delivery Fee, if applicable. (NOTE: Indicating N/A shall mean there will be no additional fee to expedite an order)	\$8.00 PER ITEM UP TO 10 ITEMS, \$2.25 PER ITEM OVER 10 ITEMS		N/A	

SECTION 4.9: MINIMUM QUANTITY INFORMATION

4.9.1 Is there a Minimum quantity or dollar amount required for each order? (Note: If bidder has requirements for certain brands regarding minimums, supplemental, detailed documentation shall be provided with bid)	Yes-15 items to the same location	No
4.9.2 Is there an additional flat fee for less than Minimum qty or dollar amount ordered? (Note: If bidder has requirements for certain brands regarding minimums, supplemental, detailed documentation shall be provided with bid)	Yes-additional \$17.60 per order	No
4.9.3 Can you supply additional quantities to an original order within a one-week period after delivery at no additional cost (other than the applicable item pricing)?	Yes, provided minimum pricing qty is met	Yes

SECTION 4.10: ONE TIME CHARGES

NOTE: Costs in this Section, are additional charges that may or may not need to be added to the invoice for a particular order. This section must be completed in full – leave no areas blank. Any deviations from the required pricing format m

4.10.1 Art & Color Separation Charges Per Design	\$46/per hour if we design, no charge if you have ready artwork	\$15.00 per hr
4.10.2 Camera Work Charges Per Design	\$46/ per hour if necessary	NA
4.10.3 Embroidery Charge/1,000 stitches Per Design	\$0.40 per thousand stitches	\$.80 per Thousand Stitch. Minimum \$4 (5000 stitches)
4.10.4 Digitizing Service Per Design	\$45.00 per design	\$2 per thousand stitches

SECTION 4.11: DISCOUNTS & OTHER INFORMATION

4.11.1 During course of contract year, Depts. May need to order items NOT specifically listed above. May the Depts contact you for a quotation on such items?	Yes	Yes
4.11.2 If you marked Yes to the question 4.11.1, will you offer a flat, across the board discount off of List price for ALL brands/items? If so, what %?	percentage varies by item	45% discount off list price on all brands
4.11.3 If you marked No to the question 4.11.1, will you offer a set % off list price discount, but discount will vary by brand? Indicate any brand specific discounts, if applicable. Attach a separate sheet if more identification is necessary.	Percentage varies by item	Yes Brand: Carhartt 30% discount off list price
4.11.4 Will you offer a large volume discount based on order dollar amount or order Qty? If Yes, please out line specifics below to include Qty and or dollars and Discount(s) offered.	yes, but it will vary based on decoration and shipping discounts from our carriers	No
4.11.5 City Standard payment terms are Net 30 after receipt of invoice. State any payment term discounts offered:	0.00%	0.00%
4.11.6 Response/Delivery Time After Receipt of Order (business days)	15 Business Days	7-10 Business Days

Comments: Promo Solutions uploaded 4.0 Pricing Sheet only. They have been deemed Non-Responsive for not completing & submitting required bid document.

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	SIZE	EST. QTY.	AMC Promotional Products Orlando, FL				Dunn Right LLC/DBA The Liddle Sport Shop Lee's Summit, MO				International Promotional Ideas Inc Elk Grove Village, IL					
				BRAND BID	STYLE NO	FABRIC WEIGHT	UNIT PRICE EACH	BRAND BID	STYLE NO	FABRIC WEIGHT	UNIT PRICE EACH	BRAND BID	STYLE NO	FABRIC WEIGHT	UNIT PRICE EACH		
SECTION 4.0: ITEM PRICING																	
4.1 FIRE DEPARTMENT																	
4.1.1	T-shirt, SS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2000, C: Navy, * NO SUBS	S - XL	660				\$4.98				\$2.80				\$2.33		
		2XL	200				\$8.50				\$5.31				\$4.10		
		3XL	10				\$11.50				\$7.11				\$6.10		
4.1.2	T-shirt, LS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2400, C: Navy, * NO SUBS	S - XL	425				\$7.34				\$6.11				\$4.40		
		2XL	125				\$10.07				\$7.81				\$6.76		
		3XL	10				\$13.74				\$8.81				\$9.37		
4.1.3 Fire Department Total							\$56.13	4.1.3 Fire Department Total				\$37.95	4.1.3 Fire Department Total				\$33.06
4.2 FLEET DIVISION																	
4.2.1	T-shirt, SS, pocket, 50/50, double-needle stitched bottom & sleeve hems, shoulder to shoulder taping, seamless collar 5.4 oz., Fruit of the Loom #5930PR, C: Dark Gray, * NO SUBS	S - XL	15				\$6.71				\$6.02				\$4.84		
		2XL	1				\$8.14				\$7.72				\$6.40		
		3XL	10				\$9.70				\$7.94				\$7.20		
		4XL	5				\$11.70				\$8.27				\$7.20		
4.2.2	T-shirt, LS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk heavy cotton, 5.6 oz., Fruit of the Loom #4930R, C: Dark Gray, * NO SUBS	S - XL	5				\$4.50				\$5.74				\$4.50		
		2XL	5				\$7.11				\$6.46				\$5.70		
		3XL	5				\$9.18				\$8.41				\$7.87		
4.2.3 Fleet Division Total							\$57.04	4.2.3 Fleet Division Total				\$50.56	4.2.3 Fleet Division Total				\$43.71
4.3 PARKS & RECREATION																	
4.3.1	T-Shirt, SS, no pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8000B, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Youth S - L	3150				\$4.20				\$2.95				\$2.36		
4.3.2	T-Shirt, SS, no pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8000, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL	2207				\$4.60				\$2.91				\$2.42		
		2XL	15				\$7.20				\$5.07				\$4.60		
		3XL	1				\$9.71				\$7.01				\$6.10		
4.3.3	T-Shirt, SS, pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8300, C: Sand, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL	55				\$7.30				\$6.69				\$4.65		
		2XL	25				\$9.78				\$8.58				\$6.48		
		3XL	1				\$12.21				\$9.88				\$8.00		
4.3.4	Sweatshirt, LS, 50/50 cotton/poly, Gildan, #18000, C: Black, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL	30				\$10.20				\$8.40				\$4.90		
		2XL	30				\$11.10				\$9.69				\$6.76		
		3XL	4				\$14.11				\$11.38				\$6.76		
4.3.5	Men's Nike Dri-Fit Micro Pique Polo, SanMar #363807, SS, 100% polyester, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adults S - XL	26				\$29.99				\$26.99				\$23.00		
		2XL	2				\$32.98				\$27.39				\$24.00		
		3XL	2				\$35.99				\$29.89				\$26.00		
4.3.6	Womens Nike Dri-Fit Micro Pique Polo, SanMar #354067, SS, 100% polyester, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adults S - XL	116				\$29.99				\$26.99				\$23.00		
		2XL	4				\$32.98				\$27.39				\$24.00		
4.3.7	Women, ¼ zip sweatshirt, Sport Tek LST253, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S-XL	10				\$				\$19.56				\$16.50		
4.3.8	Men Polo style, SS shirt, 100% polyester w/ moisture wicking properties, Izod 1320075, C: Black or Red, * NO SUBS	S - XL	90				\$				\$25.11				\$21.60		
		2XL	10				\$				\$25.91				\$22.20		
		3XL	2				\$				\$27.65				\$24.27		
4.3.9	Women Polo style SS shirt, 100% polyester w/ moisture wicking properties, Izod 1200 Performance Pique, #1320081, C: Black or Red, * NO SUBS	S-XL	80				\$				No Bid Discontinued				\$19.65		
		2XL	5				\$				No Bid Discontinued				\$20.60		
4.3.10	Adult Polo style LS shirt, 5.5 oz polyester pique golf shirt, Men's Tri Mountain 658 Black, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	80				\$25.00				\$22.95				\$17.00		
		2XL	5				\$26.00				\$24.30				\$18.50		
		3XL	1				\$28.00				\$25.65				\$20.00		
4.3.11	Adult Polo style LS shirt 5.5 oz polyester pique golf shirt, Women's Tri Mountain 656 Eclipse, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	30				\$25.00				\$22.95				\$17.00		
		2XL	5				\$26.00				\$24.30				\$18.50		
4.3.12	Visors, C: Red and Tan	Adult	25				\$5.00			Model 712	\$7.49				\$2.65		
4.3.13	Snapback Trucker Cap, S&S Activewear, #18095, C: Blk & Gray *NO SUBS	Adult	50				\$4.10				\$5.40				\$5.00		
4.3.14 Parks & Recreation Total							\$391.44	4.3.14 Parks & Recreation Total				\$442.48	4.3.14 Parks & Recreation Total				\$396.50
4.3.15 Sorting by Team				\$150.00				\$0.00				\$					
4.3.16 Delivery Time After Receipt of Order for Parks & Recreation T-S				20 business days				10-12 business days				20 business days					

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				AMC Promotional Products Orlando, FL				Dunn Right LLC/DBA The Liddle Sport Shop Lee's Summit, MO				International Promotional Ideas Inc Elk Grove Village, IL						
4.4 PUBLIC WORKS OPERATIONS																		
4.4.1	T-shirt, SS w/ pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #2300, C: Various, *NO SUBS	S - XL	1				\$6.86				\$7.00			\$4.98				
		2XL	1				\$8.78				\$9.10			\$6.78				
		3XL	1				\$12.52				\$10.40			\$8.20				
		4XL	1				\$12.59				\$10.40			\$8.20				
		5XL	1				\$12.59				\$10.47			\$8.20				
4.4.2	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6270 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	1				\$49.00				Discontinued			\$30.00				
4.4.3	T-shirt, LS, pocket, Cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2400, C: Various, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1				\$11.20				\$6.11			\$4.40				
		2XL	1				\$13.12				\$7.81			\$6.76				
		3XL	1				\$14.74				\$8.81			\$9.37				
		4XL	1				\$14.74				\$8.97			\$9.37				
		5XL	1				\$15.74				\$9.10			\$9.37				
4.4.4	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6271 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	1				\$49.00				Discontinued			\$27.00				
		2XL	1				\$52.00				Discontinued			\$27.00				
		3XL	1				\$54.00				Discontinued			\$27.00				
		4XL	1				\$56.00				Discontinued			\$27.00				
		5XL	1				\$59.00				Discontinued			\$27.00				
4.4.5	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Berne Apparel #SZ101 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1				\$39.88				\$38.99			\$34.00				
		2XL	1				\$39.83				\$38.99			\$34.00				
		3XL	1				\$43.75				\$42.89			\$37.00				
		4XL	1				\$46.00				\$42.89			\$37.00				
		5XL	1				\$48.00				N/A			\$37.00				
4.4.6	ML Kishigo Microfiber Reflective Tshirt #9110-9111	S-XL	1				\$20.99				\$16.89			\$15.60				
		2XL	1				\$22.99				\$18.53			\$17.25				
		3XL	1				\$22.99				\$18.53			\$17.25				
		4XL	1				\$22.99				\$18.53			\$17.25				
		5XL	1				\$23.99				\$18.53			\$17.25				
4.4.7	Jacket, nylon shell, lightweight fleece lining, Port Authority Competitor Jacket JP54, C: Various, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1				\$33.98				\$27.29			\$24.00				
		2XL	1				\$34.99				\$28.59			\$25.00				
		3XL	1				\$36.99				\$31.19			\$27.00				
		4XL	1				\$37.99				\$32.49			\$28.00				
		5XL	1				\$39.99				\$35.09			\$31.00				
4.4.8	Carhartt Jacket #100632 and # 100614 C: Black	S - XL	1				\$62.99	100632	59	100614	\$50.69			\$44.00				
		2XL	1				\$62.99		59		\$50.69			\$44.00				
		3XL	1				\$66.24		63		\$54.91			\$47.24				
		4XL	1				\$66.24		63		\$54.91			\$47.24				
		5XL	1				\$66.24		N/A		N/A			\$47.24				
4.4.9	Carhartt Bibs R41 C: Brown	S-XL	1				\$98.98				\$84.49			\$75.00				
		2XL	1				\$98.98		in waist and		\$84.49			\$75.00				
		3XL	1				\$98.98		Length sizing		\$84.49			\$75.00				
		4XL	1				\$108.00				\$84.49			\$75.00				
		5XL	1				\$108.00				\$84.49			\$75.00				
4.4.10	Carhartt Coat J140 C: Brown	S-XL	1				\$140.98				\$84.49			\$75.00				
		2XL	1				\$140.98				\$84.49			\$75.00				
		3XL	1				\$146.98				\$92.94			\$79.50				
		4XL	1				\$146.98				\$92.94			\$79.50				
		5XL	1				\$146.98				\$92.94			\$79.50				
4.4.11	Carhartt Stocking Cap C: Black		1			\$22.97				\$10.39			\$9.50					
4.4.11A	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6260 Thermal Lined Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS NOTE: Added Per Addendum No. 1	S-XL	1				\$				\$25.98			\$23.00				
		2XL	1				\$				\$27.98			\$24.00				
		3XL	1				\$				\$29.98			\$25.00				
		4XL	1				\$				N/A			\$26.00				
		5XL	1				\$				N/A			\$27.00				
				4.4.12 Public Works Operations Total				\$2,540.74	4.4.12 Public Works Operations Total				\$1,673.37	4.4.12 Public Works Operations Total				\$1,766.95

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				AMC Promotional Products Orlando, FL				Dunn Right LLC/DBA The Liddle Sport Shop Lee's Summit, MO				International Promotional Ideas Inc Elk Grove Village, IL					
4.5 WATER UTILITIES DEPARTMENT																	
4.5.1	T-Shirt - SS, Gildan DryBlend Pocket T-Shirt #8000 - 50/50 Preshrunk, C: Navy	S - XL	1				\$4.50				\$2.91			\$3.00			
		2XL-5XL	1				\$9.42				\$6.00			\$7.60			
4.5.2	T-Shirt - SS, Gildan Ultra Cotton Tall T-Shirt, No Pocket, #2000T - 100% Preshrunk, C: Navy	LT-XLT	1				\$8.58				\$7.78			\$5.50			
		2XLT-3XLT	1				\$9.46				\$8.10			\$6.50			
4.5.3	T-Shirt - LS, Gildan Ultra Cotton Pocket T-Shirt, #2410 - 100% Preshrunk, C: Navy	S - XL	1				\$10.88				\$9.32			\$7.00			
		2XL-5XL	1				\$16.26				\$11.57			\$10.00			
4.5.4	T-Shirt - LS, Port & Company, Tall T-Shirt, #PC55LST - 50/50 Shrink Resistant, C: Navy	LT-XLT	1				\$9.22				\$7.03			\$6.50			
		2XLT-4XLT	1				\$13.12				\$8.84			\$9.00			
4.5.5	Hoodie - Cornerstone Heavyweight Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt w/Thermal Lining #CS620, C: Navy	S-XL	1				\$51.00				\$37.79			\$33.00			
		2XL-6XL	1				\$68.00				\$43.19			\$41.00			
4.5.6	Oxford - SS, Port Authority Easy Care Shirt, #S508 - 55/45, C: Various	S-XL	1				\$14.68				\$14.84			\$13.00			
		2XL-6XL	1				\$29.99				\$20.24			\$18.00			
4.5.7	Oxford - SS, Port Authority Tall Easy Care Shirt, #TLS508 - 55/45, C: Various	S-XL	1				\$20.99				\$16.19			\$14.00			
		2XL-6XL	1				\$30.99				\$18.23			\$18.00			
4.5.8	Oxford, LS, Port Authority Crosshatch Easy Care , #S640 - 60/40, C: Various	S-XL	1				\$26.98				\$21.59			\$19.00			
		2XL-4XL	1				\$32.00				\$24.96			\$21.00			
4.5.9	Oxford, LS, Port Authority Tall Crosshatch Easy Care , #TLS640 - 60/40, C: Various	LT-XLT	1				\$27.98				\$22.94			\$20.00			
		2XLT-4XLT	1				\$33.98				\$26.31			\$23.00			
4.5.10	Men's polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo K455, C: Various	S - XL	45				\$20.99				\$17.54			\$15.00			
		2XL	35				\$23.98				\$18.89			\$17.00			
		3XL	15				\$25.99				\$21.59			\$21.00			
4.5.11	Women's polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455, C: Various	S-XL	25				\$21.98				\$17.54			\$15.00			
4.5.12	Women's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455LS, C: Various	2XL	10				\$24.99				\$18.89			\$17.00			
4.5.13	Men's Tall polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455, C: Various	S-XL	25				\$28.99				\$18.89			\$17.00			
4.5.14	Men's Tall polo style, LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455LS, C: Various	2XL	15				\$25.00				\$20.24			discontinued			
		3XL	5				\$27.00				\$22.94			discontinued			
4.5.15	Men's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo K455LS, C: Various	S - XL	45				\$25.99				\$20.24			\$15.00			
		2XL	45				\$29.98				\$21.59			\$17.00			
4.5.16	Women's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455LS, C: Various	S-XL	25				\$25.00				N/A in Long Sleeve			\$17.00			
		2XL	10				\$27.00				N/A in Long Sleeve			\$18.00			
4.5.17	Men's Tall polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455LS, C: Various	S - XL	25				\$25.99				\$21.59			discontinued			
		2XL	25				\$29.98				\$22.94			discontinued			
4.5.18 Water Utilities Department Total							\$780.89	4.5.18 Water Utilities Department Total				\$550.71	4.5.18 Water Utilities Department Total				\$444.10

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				AMC Promotional Products Orlando, FL				Dunn Right LLC/DBA The Liddle Sport Shop Lee's Summit, MO				International Promotional Ideas Inc Elk Grove Village, IL							
4.6 WATER METER SERVICES DEPARTMENT																			
4.6.1	T-Shirt- SS, Gildan #8300 C: Heather	M-XXL	56				\$8.52							\$7.56	\$7.50				
4.6.2	T-Shirt-LS, Gildan #2400 C: Navy	M-XXL	34				\$8.70							\$6.89	\$7.50				
4.6.3	Pull-Over Hoodies, 50/50 Jerzee Nublend, 996M,C: Navy	M-XXL	16				\$20.38							\$14.80	\$11.00				
4.6.4	Cornerstone Thermal Zip Up Jacket, CS620, C: Navy	M-XXL	3				\$43.00							\$38.79	\$33.00				
4.6.5	SS, Womens Plos Port Authority Rapid Dry, L455, C: Various	L	7				\$21.98							\$17.54	\$15.00				
4.6.6	LS, Womens Plos Port Authority Rapid Dry, L500LS, C: Various	L	3				\$18.98							\$14.84	\$13.00				
4.6.7	Waterproof Rain Jacket, Port Authority, J333, C: Orange Crush	M-XXL	3				\$49.99							\$35.90	\$31.00				
				4.6.8	Water Meter Services Department				\$171.55	4.6.8 Water Meter Services Department				\$136.32	4.6.8 Water Meter Services Department				\$118.00
				4.7 GRAND TOTAL				\$3,997.79	4.7 GRAND TOTAL				\$2,891.38	4.7 GRAND TOTAL				\$2,802.32	

SECTION 4.8: ADD-ON CHARGES FOR SCREEN PRINTING

NOTE:
Costs quoted in this section will be added to the item bid in Section 1, to complete the calculation of must be completed in full – leave no areas blank. Indicate \$0 if there is no charge for the item. Any deviations from the required pricing format may cause for rejection of this bid. Do not list percentages of

SCREEN PRINTING	ONE COLOR (PER ITEM)	EACH ADDITIONAL COLOR (PER ITEM)	ONE COLOR (PER ITEM)	EACH ADDITIONAL COLOR (PER ITEM)	ONE COLOR (PER ITEM)	EACH ADDITIONAL COLOR (PER ITEM)
4.8.1 Location of Imprint: Upper Left Chest	2.3	0.45	\$0.90	\$0.30	1	0.5
4.8.2 Location of Imprint: Full Front	4.5	0.45	\$0.90	\$0.30	1	0.5
4.8.3 Location of Imprint: Full Back	4.5	0.45	\$0.90	\$0.30	1	0.5
4.8.4 Location of Imprint: Full Front & Back	9	0.45	\$1.80	\$0.60	1.2	0.5
4.8.5 Location of Imprint: Left Chest & Back	6.8	0.45	\$1.80	\$0.60	1.2	0.5
4.8.6 Location of Imprint: Upper Left Sleeve	0.7	0.45	\$0.90	\$0.30	1	0.5
4.8.7 Consecutive Numerical Imprints (4" -6" Size)	4.5	0.45	\$1.75 they will be heat press #'s	\$1.25 they will be heat press #'s	4	0.5
4.8.8 Screen & Setup Charges Per Design	4.5	45	\$8.00	\$5.00	20	20
4.8.9 Per Order Expedited/Rush Delivery Fee, if applicable. (NOTE: Indicating N/A shall mean there will be no additional fee to expedite an order)	50-150		If available - 2 Days or less - 75% plus expedited shipping If Available - 3 Days - 9 Days - 30% plus expedited shipping if necessary		\$ Additional Freight	

SECTION 4.9: MINIMUM QUANTITY INFORMATION

4.9.1 Is there a Minimum quantity or dollar amount required for each order? (Note: If bidder has requirements for certain brands regarding minimums, supplemental, detailed documentation shall be provided with bid)	no	Yes - 12 pieces for screen printing and 1 piece for Embroidery	NO
4.9.2 Is there an additional flat fee for less than Minimum qty or dollar amount ordered? (Note: If bidder has requirements for certain brands regarding minimums, supplemental, detailed documentation shall be provided with bid)	no	Yes - if there are less than 12 pieces for screen printing it will get charged for 12 pieces.	NO
4.9.3 Can you supply additional quantities to an original order within a one-week period after delivery at no additional cost (other than the applicable item pricing)?	yes	Yes	YES

SECTION 4.10: ONE TIME CHARGES

NOTE: Costs in this Section, are additional charges that may or may not need to be added to the invay be cause for rejection of the bid.

4.10.1 Art & Color Separation Charges Per Design	15.00 per color	\$15 / Hour	\$0.00
4.10.2 Camera Work Charges Per Design	\$50.00	N/A	\$0.00
4.10.3 Embroidery Charge/1,000 stitches Per Design	\$1.50	\$.80/Per Thousand Stitch . Minimum \$4 (5000 stitches)	\$20.00
4.10.4 Digitizing Service Per Design	\$55.00	\$ 3/ Per Thousand Stitches	\$20.00

SECTION 4.11: DISCOUNTS & OTHER INFORMATION

4.11.1 During course of contract year, Depts. May need to order items NOT specifically listed above. May the Depts contact you for a quotation on such items?	yes	Yes	YES
4.11.2 If you marked Yes to the question 4.11.1, will you offer a flat, across the board discount off of List price for ALL brands/items? If so, what %?	21% discount off list price on all brands	40% discount off list price on all brands WITH EXCEPTIONS BELOW	25% discount off list price on all brands
4.11.3 If you marked No to the question 4.11.1, will you offer a set % off list price discount, but discount will vary by brand? Indicate any brand specific discounts, if applicable. Attach a separate sheet if more identification is necessary.	N/A	Brand: North Face 20% discount off list price Brand: Under Armour 30% discount off list price Brand: Carhartt 20% discount off list price Brand: Nike 30% discount off list price	Type "Yes" and complete the below OR "No" OR "N/A, because I will offer a flat discount as indicated in question 4.11.2"
4.11.4 Will you offer a large volume discount based on order dollar amount or order Qty? If Yes, please out line specifics below to include Qty and or dollars and Discount(s) offered.	Yes	NO	NO
4.11.5 City Standard payment terms are Net 30 after receipt of Invoice. State any payment term discounts offered:	3% Net 10	N/A	1% 10
4.11.6 Response/Delivery Time After Receipt of Order (business days)	14-30 Business Days	10-12 Business Days	20 Business Days

Comments: Promo Solutions uploaded 4.0 Pricing Sheet only. They have been deemed Non-Respo

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				Moon Tees, Ltd Lee's Summit, MO				Express Press Springfield, MO				Unifirst #229 Kansas City, MO					
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	SIZE	EST. QTY.	BRAND BID	STYLE NO	FABRIC WEIGHT	UNIT PRICE EACH	BRAND BID	STYLE NO	FABRIC WEIGHT	UNIT PRICE EACH	BRAND BID	STYLE NO	FABRIC WEIGHT	UNIT PRICE EACH		
SECTION 4.0: ITEM PRICING																	
4.1 FIRE DEPARTMENT																	
4.1.1	T-shirt, SS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2000, C: Navy, * NO SUBS	S - XL	660				\$2.15				\$2.54				\$4.77		
		2XL	200				\$3.65				\$4.54				\$6.08		
		3XL	10				\$3.65				\$5.54				\$8.65		
4.1.2	T-shirt, LS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2400, C: Navy, * NO SUBS	S - XL	425				\$4.50				\$4.88				\$8.27		
		2XL	125				\$5.95				\$6.88				\$10.73		
		3XL	10				\$5.95				\$7.88				\$12.03		
4.1.3 Fire Department Total							\$25.85	4.1.3 Fire Department Total				\$32.26	4.1.3 Fire Department Total				\$50.53
4.2 FLEET DIVISION																	
4.2.1	T-shirt, SS, pocket, 50/50, double-needle stitched bottom & sleeve hems, shoulder to shoulder taping, seamless collar 5.4 oz., Fruit of the Loom #5930PR, C: Dark Gray, * NO SUBS	S - XL	15				No Bid See Attached				\$5.46				NO BID - DISCONTINUED		
		2XL	1				No Bid See Attached				\$7.46				NO BID - DISCONTINUED		
		3XL	10				No Bid See Attached				\$8.46				NO BID - DISCONTINUED		
		4XL	5				No Bid See Attached				\$9.46				NO BID - DISCONTINUED		
4.2.2	T-shirt, LS, no pocket, 100% preshrunk heavy cotton, 5.6 oz., Fruit of the Loom #4930R, C: Dark Gray, * NO SUBS	S - XL	5				\$4.75				\$5.02				\$6.50		
		2XL	5				\$6.25				\$7.02				\$10.69		
		3XL	5				\$6.25				\$8.02				\$12.95		
4.2.3 Fleet Division Total							\$17.25	4.2.3 Fleet Division Total				\$50.90	4.2.3 Fleet Division Total				\$30.14
4.3 PARKS & RECREATION																	
4.3.1	T-Shirt, SS, no pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8000B, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Youth S - L	3150				\$2.20				\$2.31				\$4.16		
4.3.2	T-Shirt, SS, no pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8000, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL	2207				\$2.10				\$2.56				\$4.52		
		2XL	15				\$3.50				\$4.56				\$7.25		
		3XL	1				\$3.50				\$5.56				\$8.67		
4.3.3	T-Shirt, SS, pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #8300, C: Sand, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL	55				\$4.55				\$5.46				\$7.60		
		2XL	25				\$5.95				\$7.46				\$10.67		
		3XL	1				\$5.95				\$8.46				\$11.85		
4.3.4	Sweatshirt, LS, 50/50 cotton/poly, Gildan, #18000, C: Black, * NO SUBS	Adult S - XL	30				\$5.75				\$7.13				\$10.15		
		2XL	30				\$7.75				\$9.13				\$12.10		
		3XL	4				\$8.75				\$10.13				\$12.82		
4.3.5	Men's Nike Dri-Fit Micro Pique Polo, SanMar #363807, SS, 100% polyester, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adults S - XL	26				\$19.00				\$23.31				\$30.75		
		2XL	2				\$20.00				\$25.31				\$32.50		
		3XL	2				\$21.00				\$26.31				\$35.50		
4.3.6	Womens Nike Dri-Fit Micro Pique Polo, SanMar #354067, SS, 100% polyester, C: Various, * NO SUBS	Adults S - XL	116				\$19.00				\$23.31				\$32.50		
		2XL	4				\$20.00				\$25.31				\$35.50		
4.3.7	Women, ¾ zip sweatshirt, Sport Tek LST253, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S-XL	10				\$14.50				\$17.45				\$21.50		
4.3.8	Men Polo style, SS shirt, 100% polyester w/ moisture wicking properties, Izod 1320075, C: Black or Red, * NO SUBS	S - XL	90				\$17.85				\$21.72				\$23.75		
		2XL	10				\$18.85				\$23.72				\$25.00		
		3XL	2				\$19.85				\$24.72				\$27.00		
4.3.9	Women Polo style SS shirt, 100% polyester w/ moisture wicking properties, Izod 1200 Performance Pique, #1320081, C: Black or Red, * NO SUBS	S-XL	80				No Bid See Attached				No Bid				\$23.75		
		2XL	5				No Bid See Attached				No Bid				\$25.00		
4.3.10	Adult Polo style LS shirt, 5.5 oz polyester pique golf shirt, Men's Tri Mountain 658 Black, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	80				\$17.40				\$16.45				\$22.50		
		2XL	5				\$18.40				\$18.45				\$24.25		
		3XL	1				\$19.40				\$19.45				\$25.85		
4.3.11	Adult Polo style LS shirt 5.5 oz polyester pique golf shirt, Women's Tri Mountain 656 Eclipse, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	30				\$17.40				\$16.45				\$22.50		
		2XL	5				\$17.40				\$18.45				\$24.23		
4.3.12	Visors, C: Red and Tan	Adult	25	Port & Co.	CP45	N/A	\$2.75	Valuecap	VC500	N/A	\$2.68				\$4.15		
4.3.13	Snapback Trucker Cap, S&S Activewear, #18095, C: Blk & Gray *NO SUBS	Adult	50				\$3.46				\$4.79				\$6.15		
4.3.14 Parks & Recreation Total							\$316.26	4.3.14 Parks & Recreation Total				\$370.64	4.3.14 Parks & Recreation Total				\$532.17
4.3.15 Sorting by Team				\$0.00				\$				\$					
4.3.16 Delivery Time After Receipt of Order for Parks & Recreation T-S				7-10 business days				17 business days				15-20 business days					

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				Moon Tees, Ltd Lee's Summit, MO				Express Press Springfield, MO				Unifirst #229 Kansas City, MO				
4.4 PUBLIC WORKS OPERATIONS																
4.4.1	T-shirt, SS w/ pocket, 50/50, Gildan Ultra Blend #2300, C: Various, *NO SUBS	S - XL	1				\$4.75				\$4.78			\$7.75		
		2XL	1				\$6.25				\$6.78			\$10.67		
		3XL	1				\$6.25				\$7.78			\$11.85		
		4XL	1				\$6.25				\$8.78			\$11.85		
		5XL	1				\$6.25				\$9.78			\$11.85		
4.4.2	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6270 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	1				No Bid See Attached				No Bid			NO BID		
4.4.3	T-shirt, LS, pocket, Cotton, Gildan Ultra Blend #2400, C: Various, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1				\$5.80				\$4.88			\$8.26		
		2XL	1				\$7.30				\$6.88			\$10.73		
		3XL	1				\$7.30				\$7.88			\$12.03		
		4XL	1				\$7.30				\$8.88			\$12.03		
		5XL	1				\$7.30				\$9.88			\$12.03		
4.4.4	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6271 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S - XL	1				No Bid See Attached				No Bid			NO BID		
		2XL	1				No Bid See Attached				No Bid			NO BID		
		3XL	1				No Bid See Attached				No Bid			NO BID		
		4XL	1				No Bid See Attached				No Bid			NO BID		
		5XL	1				No Bid See Attached				No Bid			NO BID		
4.4.5	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Berne Apparel #SZ101 Thermal Lined Zipper Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1				\$32.50				\$35.18			\$36.00		
		2XL	1				\$35.50				\$37.18			\$36.00		
		3XL	1				\$35.50				\$38.18			\$39.75		
		4XL	1				\$35.50				\$39.18			\$39.75		
		5XL	1				\$35.50				\$40.18			\$43.50		
4.4.6	ML Kishigo Microfiber Reflective Tshirt #9110-9111	S-XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110		\$13.00	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	Unknown	\$11.65			\$16.65		
		2XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110		\$14.00	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	Unknown	\$13.65			\$17.50		
		3XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110		\$14.00	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	Unknown	\$14.65			\$17.50		
		4XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110		\$14.00	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	Unknown	\$15.65			\$17.50		
		5XL	1	ML Kishigo	9110		\$14.00	ML Kishigo	9110-9111	Unknown	\$16.65			\$17.50		
4.4.7	Jacket, nylon shell, lightweight fleece lining, Port Authority Competitor Jacket JP54, C: Various, * NO SUBS	S-XL	1				\$21.50				\$24.89			\$33.85		
		2XL	1				\$22.50				\$26.89			\$35.50		
		3XL	1				\$23.50				\$27.89			\$38.75		
		4XL	1				\$24.50				\$28.89			\$40.50		
		5XL	1				\$25.50				\$29.89			\$43.50		
4.4.8	Carhartt Jacket #100632 and # 100614 C: Black	S - XL	1	Carhartt	CT100614	13 oz	\$39.00	Carhartt	CT100632	12 oz	\$52.91		STYLE #100614	\$57.00		
		2XL	1	Carhartt	CT100614	13 oz	\$39.00	Carhartt	CT100632	12 oz	\$54.91			\$57.00		
		3XL	1	Carhartt	CT100614	13 oz	\$42.25	Carhartt	CT100632	12 oz	\$55.91			\$62.00		
		4XL	1	Carhartt	CT100614	13 oz	\$42.25	Carhartt	CT100632	12 oz	\$56.91			\$62.00		
		5XL	1				No Bid	Carhartt	CT100632	12 oz	\$57.91			NO BID		
4.4.9	Carhartt Bibs R41 C: Brown	S-XL	1	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$65.00	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$75.22			\$97.00		
		2XL	1	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$65.00	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$77.22			\$97.00		
		3XL	1	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$65.00	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$78.22		SIZES 50-58	\$105.00		
		4XL	1	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$65.00	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$79.22			\$105.00		
		5XL	1	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$65.00	Carhartt	CTR41	12 oz	\$80.22			\$105.00		
4.4.10	Carhartt Coat J140 C: Brown	S-XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$65.00	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$75.22			\$95.00		
		2XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$65.00	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$77.22			\$95.00		
		3XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$71.50	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$78.22			\$103.50		
		4XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$71.50	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$79.22			\$103.50		
		5XL	1	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$71.50	Carhartt	CTSJ140	12 oz	\$80.22			\$103.50		
4.4.11	Carhartt Stocking Cap C: Black		1	Carhartt	CTA205		\$6.50	Carhartt	CTA18	Unknown	\$9.36		ALL TALLS/BIGS	\$12.00		
4.4.11A	Hooded Sweatshirt, zipper front, insulated. Rothco #6260 Thermal Lined Hooded Sweatshirt, C: Black, * NO SUBS <u>NOTE: Added Per Addendum No. 1</u>	S-XL	1				\$20.60				\$22.90			NO BID		
		2XL	1				\$21.60				\$24.90			NO BID		
		3XL	1				\$22.60				\$25.90			NO BID		
		4XL	1				No Bid-Not Available				\$26.90			NO BID		
		5XL	1				No Bid-Not Available				\$27.90			NO BID		
4.4.12 Public Works Operations Total							\$1,329.05	4.4.12 Public Works Operations Total				\$1,673.51	4.4.12 Public Works Operations Total			\$1,842.30

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

			Moon Tees, Ltd Lee's Summit, MO				Express Press Springfield, MO				Unifirst #229 Kansas City, MO				
4.5 WATER UTILITIES DEPARTMENT															
4.5.1	T-Shirt - SS, Gildan DryBlend Pocket T-Shirt #8000 - 50/50 Preshrunk, C: Navy	S - XL	1	Gildan	\$8,300.00	5.5 oz	\$4.55	Gildan	\$8,000.00	5.5 oz	\$2.56			\$4.90	
		2XL-5XL	1	Gildan	\$8,300.00	5.5 oz	\$5.95	Gildan	\$8,000.00	5.5 oz	\$7.56			\$9.45	
4.5.2	T-Shirt - SS, Gildan Ultra Cotton Tall T-Shirt, No Pocket, #2000T - 100% Preshrunk, C: Navy	LT-XLT	1	Gildan	2000T	6 oz	\$5.23	Gildan	2000T	6 oz	\$6.27			\$9.30	
		2XLT-3XLT	1	Gildan	2000T	6 oz	\$6.63	Gildan	2000T	6 oz	\$9.27			\$9.95	
4.5.3	T-Shirt - LS, Gildan Ultra Cotton Pocket T-Shirt, #2410 - 100% Preshrunk, C: Navy	S - XL	1	Gildan	\$2,410.00	6 oz	\$6.36	Gildan	\$2,410.00	6 oz	\$7.80			\$11.15	
		2XL-5XL	1	Gildan	\$2,410.00	6 oz	\$7.76	Gildan	\$2,410.00	6 oz	\$12.80			\$14.75	
4.5.4	T-Shirt - LS, Port & Company, Tall T-Shirt, #PC55LST - 50/50 Shrink Resistant, C: Navy	LT-XLT	1	Port & Co.	PC55LST	5.5 oz	\$5.21	Port & Company	PC55LST	5.5 oz	\$6.40			\$8.50	
		2XLT-4XLT	1	Port & Co.	PC55LST	5.5 oz	\$6.55	Port & Company	PC55LST	5.5 oz	\$10.40			\$11.35	
4.5.5	Hoodie - Cornerstone Heavyweight Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt w/Thermal Lining #CS620, C: Navy	S-XL	1	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$25.20	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$32.89			\$45.50	
		2XL-6XL	1	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$27.20	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$37.89			\$55.00	
4.5.6	Oxford - SS, Port Authority Easy Care Shirt, #S508 -55/45, C: Various	S-XL	1	Port Authority	S508	4.5 oz	\$11.00	Port Authority	S508	4.5 oz	\$13.01			\$16.35	
		2XL-6XL	1	Port Authority	S508	4.5 oz	\$13.00	Port Authority	S508	4.5 oz	\$19.01			\$23.75	
4.5.7	Oxford - SS, Port Authority Tall Easy Care Shirt, #TLS508 - 55/45, C: Various	S-XL	1	Port Authority	TLS508	4.5 oz	\$12.00	Port Authority	TLS508	4.5 oz	\$14.15			\$17.75	
		2XL-6XL	1	Port Authority	TLS508	4.5 oz	\$13.00	Port Authority	TLS508	4.5 oz	\$20.15			\$24.15	
4.5.8	Oxford, LS, Port Authority Crosshatch Easy Care , #S640 - 60/40, C: Various	S-XL	1	Port Authority	S640	3 oz	\$16.00	Port Authority	S640	3 oz	\$18.73			\$23.75	
		2XL-4XL	1	Port Authority	S640	3 oz	\$17.00	Port Authority	S640	3 oz	\$22.73			\$28.25	
4.5.9	Oxford, LS, Port Authority Tall Crosshatch Easy Care , #TLS640 - 60/40, C: Various	LT-XLT	1	Port Authority	TLS640	3 oz	\$17.00	Port Authority	TLS640	3 oz	\$19.87			\$25.25	
		2XLT-4XLT	1	Port Authority	TLS640	3 oz	\$18.00	Port Authority	TLS640	3 oz	\$23.87			\$29.65	
4.5.10	Men's polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo K455, C: Various	S - XL	45	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$13.00	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$15.30			\$19.25	
		2XL	35	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$14.00	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$17.30			\$20.75	
		3XL	15	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$15.00	Port Authority	K455	5.6 oz	\$18.30			\$23.75	
4.5.11	Women's polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455, C: Various	S-XL	25	Port Authority	L455	5.6 oz	\$13.00	Port Authority	L455	5.6 oz	\$15.30			\$19.25	
4.5.12	Women's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455LS, C: Various	2XL	10	Port Authority	LS00LS	5 oz	\$12.00	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$19.59			\$17.65	
4.5.13	Men's Tall polo style SS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455, C: Various	S-XL	25	Port Authority	TLK455	5.6 oz	\$14.00	Port Authority	TLK455	5.6 oz	\$16.44			\$20.75	
4.5.14	Men's Tall polo style, LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455LS, C: Various	2XL	15	Port Authority	TLK500LS	5 oz	\$13.00	Port Authority	TLK455LS	5.6 oz	\$17.98			\$19.25	
		3XL	5	Port Authority	TLK500LS	5 oz	\$15.00	Port Authority	TLK455LS	5.6 oz	\$18.98			\$23.00	
4.5.15	Men's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo K455LS, C: Various	S - XL	45	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$15.00	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$17.59			\$22.25	
		2XL	45	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$16.00	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$19.59			\$23.75	
4.5.16	Women's polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo L455LS, C: Various	S-XL	25	Port Authority	LS00LS	5 oz	\$12.00	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$17.59			\$16.30	
		2XL	10	Port Authority	LS00LS	5 oz	\$13.00	Port Authority	K455LS	5.6 oz	\$19.59			\$18.30	
4.5.17	Men's Tall polo style LS, Port Authority Rapid Dry Polo TLK455LS, C: Various	S - XL	25	Port Authority	TLK500LS	5 oz	\$13.00	Port Authority	TLK455LS	5.6 oz	\$15.98			\$17.75	
		2XL	25	Port Authority	TLK500LS	5 oz	\$15.00	Port Authority	TLK455LS	5.6 oz	\$17.98			\$19.25	
				4.5.18 Water Utilities Department Total				\$410.64				4.5.18 Water Utilities Department Total			
								\$532.87				\$650.00			

UNOFFICIAL BID TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 2020-033

PROJECT: T-Shirts, Sweatshirts, Jackets & Specialty Items

LS=Long Sleeve, SS=Short Sleeve, C=Color, NO SUBS= No Substitutes--Item bid must be exactly as identified

				Moon Tees, Ltd Lee's Summit, MO				Express Press Springfield, MO				Unifirst #229 Kansas City, MO					
4.6 WATER METER SERVICES DEPARTMENT																	
4.6.1	T-Shirt- SS, Gildan #8300 C: Heather	M-XXL	56	Gildan	8300	5.5 oz	\$4.55	Gildan	8300	5.5 oz	\$7.46				\$7.60		
4.6.2	T-Shirt-LS, Gildan #2400 C: Navy	M-XXL	34	Gildan	2400	6 oz	\$4.50	Gildan	2400	6 oz	\$6.88				\$9.35		
4.6.3	Pull-Over Hoodies, 50/50 Jerzee Nublend, 996M,C: Navy	M-XXL	16	Jerzees	996M	8 oz	\$8.55	Jerzees	996MR	8 oz	\$12.16				\$16.95		
4.6.4	Cornerstone Thermal Zip Up Jacket, CS620, C: Navy	M-XXL	3	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$25.20	Cornerstone	CS620	12 oz	\$34.89				\$43.00		
4.6.5	SS, Womens Plos Port Authority Rapid Dry, L455, C: Various	L	7	Port Authority	L455	5.6 oz	\$13.00	Port Authority	L455	5.6 oz	\$15.30				\$20.00		
4.6.6	LS, Womens Plos Port Authority Rapid Dry, L500LS, C: Various	L	3	Port Authority	L500LS	5 oz	\$12.00	Port Authority	L500LS	5 oz	\$13.01				\$16.95		
4.6.7	Waterproof Rain Jacket, Port Authority, J333, C: Orange Crush	M-XXL	3	Port Authority	J333		\$26.00	Port Authority	J333	Unknown	\$32.61				\$41.50		
4.6.8 Water Meter Services Department Total							\$93.80	4.6.8 Water Meter Services Department Total				\$122.31	4.6.8 Water Meter Services Department Total				\$155.35
4.7 GRAND TOTAL							\$2,192.85	4.7 GRAND TOTAL				\$2,782.49	4.7 GRAND TOTAL				\$3,260.49

SECTION 4.8: ADD-ON CHARGES FOR SCREEN PRINTING

NOTE:

Costs quoted in this section will be added to the item bid in Section 1, to complete the calculation of increase, list actual added costs.

SCREEN PRINTING	ONE COLOR (PER ITEM)	EACH ADDITIONAL COLOR (PER ITEM)	ONE COLOR (PER ITEM)	EACH ADDITIONAL COLOR (PER ITEM)	ONE COLOR (PER ITEM)	EACH ADDITIONAL COLOR (PER ITEM)
4.8.1 Location of Imprint: Upper Left Chest	0.8	0.25	0.75	0.5	2.45	0.4
4.8.2 Location of Imprint: Full Front	0.8	0.25	0.75	0.5	2.45	0.4
4.8.3 Location of Imprint: Full Back	0.8	0.25	0.75	0.5	2.45	0.4
4.8.4 Location of Imprint: Full Front & Back	1.6	0.5	0.75	0.5	4.9	0.8
4.8.5 Location of Imprint: Left Chest & Back	1.6	0.5	0.75	0.5	4.9	0.8
4.8.6 Location of Imprint: Upper Left Sleeve	0.8	0.25	0.75	0.5	2.45	0.4
4.8.7 Consecutive Numerical Imprints (4" -6" Size)	1.35	0.4	1	1	3.15 PER DIGIT	N/A
4.8.8 Screen & Setup Charges Per Design	7	4	0	0	33.5	12.75
4.8.9 Per Order Expedited/Rush Delivery Fee, if applicable. (NOTE: Indicating N/A shall mean there will be no additional fee to expedite an order)	N/A		\$1 rush fee per shirt (minimum \$50) for faster production.		ADD 25% TO EMBROIDERY OR SILKSCREEN PRICING FOR RUSH ORDERS	

SECTION 4.9: MINIMUM QUANTITY INFORMATION

4.9.1 Is there a Minimum quantity or dollar amount required for each order? (Note: If bidder has requirements for certain brands regarding minimums, supplemental, detailed documentation shall be provided with bid)	No	Yes, see attached documentation (Bidder noted Screen Printing 24 items, Embroidery-0 items)	YES
4.9.2 Is there an additional flat fee for less than Minimum qty or dollar amount ordered? (Note: If bidder has requirements for certain brands regarding minimums, supplemental, detailed documentation shall be provided with bid)	No	No	YES
4.9.3 Can you supply additional quantities to an original order within a one-week period after delivery at no additional cost (other than the applicable item pricing)?	Yes	Yes	NO

SECTION 4.10: ONE TIME CHARGES

NOTE: Costs in this Section, are additional charges that may or may not need to be added to the invc

4.10.1 Art & Color Separation Charges Per Design	\$20 Per Hour	\$0.00	\$40.00
4.10.2 Camera Work Charges Per Design	N/A	\$0.00	\$25.00
4.10.3 Embroidery Charge/1,000 stitches Per Design	.65/Per Thousand Stitches -- Minimum \$4 (6000 Stitches)	\$0.40 per 1000 stitches	\$1.65
4.10.4 Digitizing Service Per Design	\$3.00 Per Thousand Stitches	\$0.00	\$40.00

SECTION 4.11: DISCOUNTS & OTHER INFORMATION

4.11.1 During course of contract year, Depts. May need to order items NOT specifically listed above. May the Depts contact you for a quotation on such items?	Yes	Yes	YES
4.11.2 If you marked Yes to the question 4.11.1, will you offer a flat, across the board discount off of List price for ALL brands/items? If so, what %?	42% discount off list price on all brands	30% discount off list price on all brands	0% discount off list price on all brands
4.11.3 If you marked No to the question 4.11.1, will you offer a set % off list price discount, but discount will vary by brand? Indicate any brand specific discounts, if applicable. Attach a separate sheet if more identification is necessary.	N/A	N/A, because I will offer a flat discount as indicated in question 4.11.2	Type "Yes" and complete the below OR "No" OR "N/A, because I will offer a flat discount as indicated in question 4.11.2" Brand: _____% discount off list price
4.11.4 Will you offer a large volume discount based on order dollar amount or order Qty? If Yes, please out line specifics below to include Qty and or dollars and Discount(s) offered.	No	No	NO
4.11.5 City Standard payment terms are Net 30 after receipt of invoice. State any payment term discounts offered:	2% Net 10	_____%	0.00%
4.11.6 Response/Delivery Time After Receipt of Order (business days)	7-10 Business Days	15 Business Days	15-20 Business Days

Comments: Promo Solutions uploaded 4.0 Pricing Sheet only. They have been deemed Non-Respo