



2022-047 Equipment Rental Bid Tab

Complete each field. "N/A" if rate is not available. "X" the No Bid column if no bidding the entire line

| Item | Description                            | Est. Qty. | Unit | Bledsoe Equipment Inc. |              |               |        | Herc Rentals. Inc. |              |               |        | The G.W. Vankeppel Co. |              |               |        |
|------|--|-----------|------|------------------------|--------------|---------------|--------|--------------------|--------------|---------------|--------|------------------------|--------------|---------------|--------|
|      |  |           |      | Daily Price            | Weekly Price | Monthly Price | No Bid | Daily Price        | Weekly Price | Monthly Price | No Bid | Daily Price            | Weekly Price | Monthly Price | No Bid |
| 38   | Loader, Track HVAC Cab                 | 1         | Each | \$360.00               | \$1,180.00   | \$3,540.00    |        | \$390.00           | \$978.00     | \$2,520.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 39   | Loader, Track Bobcat T590 HVAC Cab     | 1         | Each | \$360.00               | \$1,180.00   | \$3,540.00    |        | \$390.00           | \$978.00     | \$2,520.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 40   | Loader, Track Deere 323D HVAC Cab      | 1         | Each | \$360.00               | \$1,180.00   | \$3,540.00    |        | \$493.00           | \$1,310.00   | \$3,120.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 41   | Trencher 4x30                          | 1         | Each | \$154.00               | \$463.00     | \$1,390.00    |        | \$222.00           | \$654.00     | \$1,147.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 42   | Lift, Bucket 36ft 2 Man Tow Electric   | 1         | Each | \$225.00               | \$900.00     | \$2,700.00    |        | \$337.00           | \$804.00     | \$1,890.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 43   | Lift, Personnel 1 Man 30 ft            | 1         | Each | \$110.00               | \$330.00     | \$662.00      |        | \$324.00           | \$684.00     | \$1,704.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 44   | Pressure Washer 3200 PSI Hot water     | 1         | Each | \$133.00               | \$529.00     | \$1,588.00    |        | \$194.00           | \$691.00     | \$1,458.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 45   | Pressure Washer 3500 PSI               | 1         | Each | \$84.00                | \$330.00     | \$992.00      |        | \$108.00           | \$384.00     | \$810.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 46   | Cutter, Sod Gas 24                     | 1         | Each | \$160.00               | \$640.00     | \$1,120.00    |        | \$103.00           | \$365.00     | \$769.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 47   | Ball, Mount w/ Equipment               | 1         | Each | \$8.00                 | \$17.00      | \$36.00       |        |                    |              |               | X      |                        |              |               | X      |
| 48   | Hammer, Air 90 lb.                     | 1         | Each | \$77.00                | \$232.00     | \$695.00      |        | \$49.00            | \$173.00     | \$365.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 49   | Light, Tower 4000 Watt                 | 1         | Each | \$135.00               | \$405.00     | \$751.00      |        | \$139.00           | \$329.00     | \$552.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 50   | Pump, 2" Gas w/ 2 hoses                | 1         | Each | \$66.00                | \$264.00     | \$794.00      |        | \$97.00            | \$367.00     | \$730.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 51   | Roller, Lawn Towable                   | 1         | Each | \$34.00                | \$99.00      | \$298.00      |        |                    |              |               | X      |                        |              |               | X      |
| 52   | Roller, Lawn Push                      | 1         | Each | \$21.00                | \$66.00      | \$199.00      |        |                    |              |               | X      |                        |              |               | X      |
| 53   | Rotary Tip for Pressure Washer         | 1         | Each | \$8.00                 | \$36.00      | \$70.00       |        | \$38.00            | \$112.00     | \$330.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 54   | Trailer, Agitating Concrete            | 1         | Each | \$224.00               | N/A          | N/A           |        | \$103.00           | \$365.00     | \$769.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 55   | Trailer, Skid Loader                   | 1         | Each | \$80.00                | \$320.00     | \$960.00      |        | \$128.00           | \$516.00     | \$1,162.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 56   | Propane Refills 20lb                   | 1         | Each | \$18.63                | N/A          | N/A           |        |                    |              |               | X      |                        |              |               | X      |
| 57   | Propane Refills 30lb                   | 1         | Each | \$27.95                | N/A          | N/A           |        |                    |              |               | X      |                        |              |               | X      |
| 58   | Propane Refills 40lb                   | 1         | Each | \$37.26                | N/A          | N/A           |        |                    |              |               | X      |                        |              |               | X      |
| 59   | Propane Refills 100lb                  | 1         | Each | \$93.15                | N/A          | N/A           |        |                    |              |               | X      |                        |              |               | X      |
| 60   | Vermeer S450TX                         | 1         | Each | \$195.00               | \$585.00     | \$1,755.00    |        | \$325.00           | \$906.00     | \$2,110.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 61   | Adjustable Spreaders                   | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid | \$140.00           | \$408.00     | \$990.00      |        | \$20.00                | \$60.00      | \$180.00      |        |
| 62   | 2' Extension Legs package for Aluminum | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$5.00                 | \$15.00      | \$45.00       |        |
| 63   | Fin Board 4' x8'                       | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$4.00                 | \$12.00      | \$36.00       |        |
| 64   | Lifting Device                         | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$6.00                 | \$18.00      | \$54.00       |        |
| 65   | End Member 10'                         | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$5.00                 | \$15.00      | \$45.00       |        |
| 66   | Modular Shield Panel 24" x 8'          | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$12.00                | \$36.00      | \$108.00      |        |
| 67   | Modular Shield Panel 24" x 12'         | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$14.00                | \$42.00      | \$126.00      |        |
| 68   | Release Tool 48"                       | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$3.00                 | \$9.00       | \$27.00       |        |
| 69   | Shoring Pump Hand                      | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$11.00                | \$33.00      | \$99.00       |        |
| 70   | Removal Hook 48"                       | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$3.00                 | \$9.00       | \$27.00       |        |
| 71   | Kit: 1.5 Shore 52-88" Cyl              | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$7.00                 | \$21.00      | \$63.00       |        |
| 72   | Kit: 1.5 Shore 52-88" Cyl 24" Ext      | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$9.00                 | \$27.00      | \$81.00       |        |
| 73   | Kit: 1.5 Shore 52-88" Cyl 56" Ext      | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$11.00                | \$33.00      | \$99.00       |        |
| 74   | 1.5' Rail CS                           | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | N/C                    | N/C          | N/C           |        |

2022-047 Equipment Rental Bid Tab

Complete each field. "N/A" if rate is not available. "X" the No Bid column if no bidding the entire line

| Item | Description                            | Est. Qty. | Unit | Bledsoe Equipment Inc. |              |               |        | Herc Rentals. Inc. |              |               |        | The G.W. Vankeppel Co. |              |               |        |
|------|--|-----------|------|------------------------|--------------|---------------|--------|--------------------|--------------|---------------|--------|------------------------|--------------|---------------|--------|
|      |  |           |      | Daily Price            | Weekly Price | Monthly Price | No Bid | Daily Price        | Weekly Price | Monthly Price | No Bid | Daily Price            | Weekly Price | Monthly Price | No Bid |
| 75   | 1.5' Rail SS                           | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | N/C                    | N/C          | N/C           |        |
| 76   | 52" – 88" Cylinder Assembly            | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$7.00                 | \$21.00      | \$63.00       |        |
| 77   | Shield Aluminum 6' x 6'                | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid |                    |              |               | X      | \$75.00                | \$225.00     | \$675.00      |        |
| 78   | Scissor Lift 30-35' Electric 46-48"    | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid | \$198.00           | \$440.00     | \$900.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 79   | Sweeper Ride on 8' Windrow Three Wheel | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid | \$335.00           | \$797.00     | \$1,818.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 80   | Blower Axial 12" Electric              | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid | \$92.00            | \$240.00     | \$658.00      |        | \$18.00                | \$54.00      | \$162.00      |        |
| 81   | Blower 16" Ventilation                 | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid | \$102.00           | \$197.00     | \$606.00      |        | \$18.00                | \$54.00      | \$162.00      |        |
| 82   | Duct Hose 16" x 25'                    | 1         | Each |                        |              |               | No Bid | \$18.00            | \$54.00      | \$162.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 83   | Mini Excavator 7400-9199#              | 1         | Each | \$190.00               | \$570.00     | \$1,710.00    |        | \$353.00           | \$934.00     | \$2,040.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 84   | Mini Excavator Bucket 18"              | 1         | Each | \$55.00                | \$165.00     | \$497.00      |        | \$23.00            | \$54.00      | \$154.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 85   | Light Tower Towable Small              | 1         | Each | \$135.00               | \$405.00     | \$751.00      |        | \$103.00           | \$264.00     | \$769.00      |        |                        |              |               | X      |
| 86   | Skid Steer Loader 2001-2599#           | 1         | Each | \$220.00               | \$658.00     | \$1,973.00    |        | \$329.00           | \$770.00     | \$1,740.00    |        |                        |              |               | X      |

2022-047 Equipment Rental Bid Tab

Complete each field. "N/A" if rate is not available. "X" the No Bid column if no bidding the entire line

| Item | Description                 | Est. Qty. | Unit | Bledsoe Equipment Inc. |                   |               |        |
|------|-----------------------------|-----------|------|------------------------|-------------------|---------------|--------|
|      |                             |           |      | Daily Price            | Weekly Price      | Monthly Price | No Bid |
|      | <b>U-CARTS</b>              |           |      | <b>2 HRS</b>           | <b>4 HRS</b>      | <b>Daily</b>  | No Bid |
| 87   | U-Cart Trailer              | 1         | Each | \$56.00                | \$112.00          | \$224.00      |        |
|      | <b>CONCRETE FOR U-CARTS</b> |           |      | <b>5-SACK MIX</b>      | <b>6-SACK MIX</b> |               | No Bid |
| 88   | 1/4 YARD CONCRETE           | 1         | Each | N/A                    | \$86.00           |               |        |
| 89   | 1/3 YARD CONCRETE           | 1         | Each | N/A                    | X                 |               |        |
| 90   | 1/2 YARD CONCRETE           | 1         | Each | N/A                    | \$101.00          |               |        |
| 91   | 2/3 YARD CONCRETE           | 1         | Each | N/A                    | X                 |               |        |
| 92   | 3/4 YARD CONCRETE           | 1         | Each | N/A                    | \$131.00          |               |        |
| 93   | 1 YARD CONCRETE             | 1         | Each | N/A                    | \$158.00          |               |        |

| Herc Rentals. Inc. |                   |               |        |
|--------------------|-------------------|---------------|--------|
| Daily Price        | Weekly Price      | Monthly Price | No Bid |
| <b>2 HRS</b>       | <b>4 HRS</b>      | <b>Daily</b>  | No Bid |
|                    |                   |               | X      |
| <b>5-SACK MIX</b>  | <b>6-SACK MIX</b> |               | No Bid |
|                    |                   |               | X      |
|                    |                   |               | X      |
|                    |                   |               | X      |
|                    |                   |               | X      |
|                    |                   |               | X      |
|                    |                   |               | X      |

| The G.W. Vankeppel Co. |                   |               |        |
|------------------------|-------------------|---------------|--------|
| Daily Price            | Weekly Price      | Monthly Price | No Bid |
| <b>2 HRS</b>           | <b>4 HRS</b>      | <b>Daily</b>  | No Bid |
|                        |                   |               | X      |
| <b>5-SACK MIX</b>      | <b>6-SACK MIX</b> |               | No Bid |
|                        |                   |               | X      |
|                        |                   |               | X      |
|                        |                   |               | X      |
|                        |                   |               | X      |
|                        |                   |               | X      |
|                        |                   |               | X      |

**Locaton**

Bledsoe's Rental  
1300 NE Douglas  
Lee's Summit, MO 64086

Herc Rentals Inc.  
707 E 16th St  
Kansas City, MO 64108

G.W. Vankeppel  
5800 Bannister Rd  
Kansas City, MO 64134